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View Sent Message

This mail is associated with :

*SHD5151Z (C0374771)
[YN4957T]
TP
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
Mar 3 2016 8:00PM
[SEAGULL TECHNOLOGY PTE. LTD.]
Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

Resend View Recipients Print Message | Delete Message Forward
From LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 19/06/2017 15:30 PM.
To sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg; sur@lkkauto.com; AXA_SG
cC assignments@Ilkkauto.com

Subject No development - AXA - C0374771

Dear Ms Saw Theng,

Refer to the below email.

Kindly be informed that the below matter is being finalised. However till date TP's repairer did not submit the LOD for negotaitoin of settlement.
Also no action were being initiated despite of remiders.

As the matter is dragging long and there is no development, we therefore proceed to temporary close and submit the wp report to your office.
If any new development in future, we will inform you for further handling.

Best Regards

Zayer

Dear Sir /Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.
Dear Zayyer,

For your information and necessary action please.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.
"Wishes you a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2017"

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

<-- Original Message -->

From: AXA_SG

To: sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg; LKK_HQ

CC: vivianlau@lkkauto.com; chewht@lkkauto.com; zayyer@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 14/12/2016 09:51 AM

Subject: Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN4957T (OI : AXA - C0374771) and SHD5151Z (TP : LKK REF - CC3/AXA16004337/Kzb3) on
03.03.2016

AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD
‘| (65) 6338 7288
Z (65) 6338 2522

mvw_rma.fnm_ﬂq

M redefining / insurance

Dear Shu Pei
Please advise on the status of this matter.
Regards

Saw Theng
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<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg

CC: AXA_SG; vivianlau@lkkauto.com; chewht@lkkauto.com; zayyer@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 14/09/2016 02:30 PM

Subject: Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN4957T (OI : AXA - C0374771) and SHD5151Z (TP : LKK REF - CC3/AXA16004337/Kzb3) on
03.03.2016

Dear Saw Theng,
Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary action.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg

CC: AXA_SG; vivianlau@lkkauto.com; chewht@lkkauto.com; zayyer@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 10/08/2016 03:38 PM

Subject: Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN4957T (OI : AXA - C0374771) and SHD5151Z (TP : LKK REF - CC3/AXA16004337/Kzb3) on
03.03.2016

Dear Saw Theng,
Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary action.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg

CC: AXA_SG; vivianlau@lkkauto.com; chewht@lkkauto.com; zayyer@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 16/06/2016 09:05 AM

Subject: Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN4957T (OI : AXA - C0374771) and SHD5151Z (TP : LKK REF - CC3/AXA16004337/Kzb3) on
03.03.2016

Dear Saw Theng,
Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary action.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg

CC: AXA_SG; vivianlau@lkkauto.com; chewht@lkkauto.com; zayyer@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 20/05/2016 03:40 PM

Subject: Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN4957T (OI : AXA - C0374771) and SHD5151Z (TP : LKK REF - CC3/AXA16004337/Kzb3) on
03.03.2016

Dear Saw Theng,
Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary action.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg

CC: AXA_SG; vivianlau@lkkauto.com; chewht@lkkauto.com; zayyer@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 07/04/2016 07:30 PM

Subject: Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN4957T (OI : AXA - C0374771) and SHD5151Z (TP : LKK REF - CC3/AXA16004337/Kzb3) on
03.03.2016

Dear Saw Theng,

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary action.

Thank you.
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Best Regards,

Shu Pei | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg

CC: AXA_SG; vivianlau@lkkauto.com; chewht@lkkauto.com; zayyer@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 21/03/2016 10:31 AM

Subject: Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN4957T (OI : AXA - C0374771) and SHD5151Z (TP : LKK REF - CC3/AXA16004337/Kzv3) on
03.03.2016

Dear Saw Theng,

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary action.
Please advise also whether we can proceed for direct settlement for this case.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Voon Fei | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: VoonFei@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg

CC: AXA_SG; vivianlau@lkkauto.com; chewht@lkkauto.com; zayyer@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 08/03/2016 05:14 PM

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN4957T (OI : AXA - C0374771) and SHD5151Z (TP : LKK REF - CC3/AXA16004337/Kzv3) on
03.03.2016

Dear Saw Theng,

Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accident report for our necessary action.
Please advise also whether we can proceed for direct settlement for this case.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Zayyer and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2409.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Voon Fei | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: VoonFei@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.
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