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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 5256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD Ref : CC3I/AXA16004337/Kzb3
8 SHENTON WAY #27-01SINGAPORE 068811 nare: GG " “Nmmmumm
Code: AXAZ
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YN 4957T Veh. Inspected SHD 51512
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 07/03/2016
z Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
[ |chassis No. Colour
Odometer z Steering
Brakes Meodification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  03/03/2016 Inspection Date 04/03/2016
Survey held at TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTELTD
NO.2 ANG MO KIO 5T 63
SINGAPORE 569111
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AMWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD e Candy
MNO.2 ANG MO H_JD ST 63 SINGAPORE 569111 i

TELNO.6287 6666  FAX NO.6257 1330

CO/GST REG NO.201019626G

SHD5151Z - AXA
Vehicle No.: SHD 5151Z - Candy
Chassis No.: JTDGJ20W105001432
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: WISH 2.0 BI-FUEL
Date of Accident : 03.03.16
Third Party Insurer: AXA
PART LIST
1 1  Front Fender LH $ 837.60 .
2 1  Front Fender Liner LH $ 369.14
3 1 Front door LH % 1,554.00
4 1  Front side view mirror LH $ 874.43
TOTAL $ 3,635.17
25% $ 908.79
$ 2,726.38
Specical Nett
1 1 Door Sticker "TRANS-CAB" LH S 80.00 »
TOTAL § 80.00
TOTAL PARTS % 2,806.38
Panel Beating, Knocking And Straightening The
Necessary Portion, Remove And Renewal Of
Parts, Adjust And Realign The Same $ 840.00
To Check Electrical Lighting Concerned. % 120.00
Putty And Spray Painting Of The Affected
Portion. $ 820.00
| $ 1,780.00
r' TOTAL § 4,586.38
li 3DAYS

REPAIR DAYS
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View Sent Message

This mall is associated with

*EHDS151Z (CO374771)
[YN4BETT]
TR
TRAMS-CASB SERVICES F
Mar 3 201
[SEAGULL TECHNOLOGY PTE. LTO.]
Trang-cab Auto Services Ple Lid

Reserid Wiew Recipients I Print Message | Delate Message | Forward
From LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 19/06/2017 15:30 PM.
To sawthengkhor@ans.cam.sg; sur@lkkauto.com; AXA_SG
cc megignrmentsg lkkauto.com

Subject MNo development - AXA - CO374771

Dear Ms Saw Theng,

Refer to the below email.

Kindly be infarmed that the below matter is being finalised. However tifl date TP's repairer did not submit the LOD far negotaitain of settlement,
Alse no Botion were being initiated despite of remiders.

As the matter is dragging kong and there is no development, we therefore proceed to temporary close and submit the wp report to your office.
If any new development in future, we will inform yvou for further handling.

Best Regards

Zayer

Dear Sir /Madam,

Thank you for your email,

Qur respective case handler will logk inta the matter and revert to you In due course.
Dear Zayyer,

For your information and necessary action please.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned,
"wishes youw a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2017"

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupsiiiikkauto. com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

=-- (riginal Message --=

Fram: AXA_SG

To: sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg; LKK_HG

CC: vivianlau@ikkauto,com; chewhl@Ikkaute, com; ayyer@ikkauto.com, admin-afikkaulo.com

Sent On: 14/12/2016 09:51 AM

Subpect: Re: Direct Settlement - AcCident Involving YN4957T (01 = AXA - CO374771) and SHDS151Z (TP : LKK REF - CC3/ANALGODM33T/KZDI) on
03.03.2016

FURA BRS ELARE L SERCAIE PR LD
W (nh)ure 7 aas
LR B RV )

A AT %l

M redefining / nsurpnce

[rear Shu Pei

Flease advise on the status of this matter,
Regards

Saw Theng

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.ctm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp ... 19/6/2017
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<-- Original Message --=

L LKK_HQkh riflaxa,com

E\:}:-: Tn.?.:i";gg '-'I:a nlauﬁllkkaust?}.:nm:. chewhtiikkauto.com; zayyer@ikkauto.com; admin-aidikkauta.com
Sent On: 14/09/2016 02:30 FM

Subject: Re: Direct Sattlement - Accident Tnvaheing YR4957T (01
03.03.2016

« AXA - C0374771) and SHD5151Z (TP : LKK REE - CCI/AXALGO0433T Kzb3) on

Dear Saw Thang,

Kindly advise whather insured has reparted, IF 5o, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident regort for aur necessany action,
Thank you.

Best Aegards,

Shu Pei | Admin

LKK Auta Consultants Pie Lid

Phane: 6366 D055 | email: shupeidlkkauto com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Unl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

«-- Original Message --=

Fram: LEK_HQ

To: sawtheng. khori@axa.com.sgq

Co: AXA SG vivianlaulkkauto.com; chewhbii kkauta,com; zaypyer@lkkaute,com; admin-agikkauto.com

Sent On: 10/08/2016 03:38 PM

Subject: Re; Direct Settlemant - Accident Invahving ¥NADSTT {01 ; AXA - CO374771) and SHOS151Z (TP © LKX REF - CC3/AxAL6004337/K203) an
03.03.2018

Dear Saw Theng,
Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured™s accident repart for pur NeCcEssary action.
Thank yau,

Best Hegards,

Shu Pei | Admin

LE¥ Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phane: 6366 2055 | amail: shupeidikkauto, com | fax: 67414108
Bl 51, Paya Unl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408%33)

<-- Original Message --=

From: LEK_HQ

To: sewtheng.khan@axa,com.sg

CC: AXA SG; vivianlau@ikkauto.com; chewht@lkkauto.com; zayyerilikkauto.com; admen-aildlkkauta.com

Sent On: 16/06/2016 0%:0% AM

Subject: Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Irvelving YNS95FT (O] : AXA - CO374771) and SHO5151Z (TP : LKK REF - CCI/AXATIE004337/Kzb3) on
03.03.2016

Dear Saw Theng,
Kindly advise whether insured has reported. If so, kindly lgt us have & copy of insured's accident repart far our necessary action.
Thank you,

Best Regards,

Snu Pel | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lbd

Phoneo: 6366 0055 | email: shupaihlkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Fark, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S({408933)

<=« Original Massage --=

Fram: LEK_HQ

To; sawtheng. khorfiaxa com.sg

CC: AXA SG; vivienlaugblkkauto.com; chewht@lkkauto, com; zayyeriikkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 20/05/2016 03:40 PM

Cubject: Ra: Difect Settlameant - Accident Tnvahdng YN495TT (OF : AXA - COA74771) and SHDS151Z (TP : LKK REF - CC3/AXAIG004337/Kzb3) an
03.03.2016

Dear Shw Theng,
Kindly advise whather insured has reported. If 2o, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for aur necessary action.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pe | Admin

LKK Auta Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 366 0055 | emall: shupedikkauro.com | fax: 67414108
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

«<-= Original Message -->

From: LEK_HQ

To: sawtheng. khorBaxa, com.sg

CC: ANA_SG; vivianlau@ikkauto.com; chewhigikkauto com; zayyer@ikkauto.com; admin-aiikkauts.com

Sent On: 07/04/2016 07:30 PM

5ubjec;: Re: Direct Settiement - Accident Involving YN495TT (D1 : AXA - CO374771) and SHOSL51Z (TP : LKK REF - CC3/ARALG004337/K2b3) on
03.03.2016

Daar Saw Theng,
Kindly advise whather insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident repart Tor our necessary action.

Thank o,

hitps://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCUmail& fuscaction=dsp ... 19/6/2017
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Best Regards,

St Pel | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6386 D055 | email: shupeidikkauta.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya bl [ndustrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933}

«=-- Qriginal Message -~

From: LEK_HG

To: sawtheng. khor@axa.com.sg

CC: AXA_SG; vivianlau@lkkauto.com; chewht@ikkauto.com; zayyer@ikkeuto.com; admin-ad@ikkauts, com

Sent On: 2170372016 10:31 AM

Subject: fe: Direct Sartlemant - Accident [nvalving YNESSTT (O @ AXA - C0374771) and SHD51512 (TP : LKK REF - CCIAXALG004337/Kav3) on

03.03.2016

Dear Saw Thang,

Kindty advise whether insured has reported. 1 so, kindly let us have a copy of insured’s accidant repart for our necessery action.
Flease sdvise also whether we can proceed for direct settlement far this case.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Voon Fei | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lud

Phane: 5366 D055 | email: VoonFeidikkauts com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Uni Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, £02-25 | S{408933)

<-- Qriginal Message -->

From: LEE_HQ

To: sawthang khorexa.com,sg

CO: AXA_SG; vivienlau@lkkautn.com; chewnt@ikkauto.com; zayyerlkkauto.com; admin-a@ikkauto.com

Sent On: 0B/03/2016 05:14 PM

Subject: Direct Settlernent - Accident [nvalving YHAGSTT (D01 : AXA - CO374771) and SHD5151Z (TP : LKK REF - CCI/AMALIGD0433 T/ Hevd) an
03.03.2016

Dear Saw Theng,

Kirdly advise whether ingured has reported. IF 5o, kindly let us have & copy of Insured’s accident report for gur necessary action.
Plegse advise also whether we can proceed for direct settlement for this case.

Kindiy take note that the case handles in-charge is Zayyer and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2409,

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Voon Fei | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pie Lid

Phane: 6366 0055 | ermail: VoanFeu@ikkauta com | fax: 67414108
B|I.: _51. Paya l_..lh_ll:nd_u_s't_rfal Park, Ubi E:\'E_ﬂuE 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are fo dacumants.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=S8VCmail&fuseaction=dsp_... 19/6/2017



 Vasanthi Rengitsan (LKKAuto)

To: VIAY@SEAGULLGROUP.COM.5G
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto); Zayyer (LKKAuto); Vasanthi Rengiyan (LKKAuto)
Subject: YOUR REF : YN 49577 _ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 4957T AND SHD 1512 AT

BALESTIER ROAD ON 03/03/2016

03 NOVEMBER 2016

SEAGULL PTELTD

NO 7 TUAS SOUTH ST15
SINGAPORE 637078
ATTN: MR VIJAY

Dear SirfMadam,

OUR REF : CC3/AXA16004337/Kzb3
YOUR REF : YN 4957T
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YN 4957T AND SHD 51512 AT BALESTIER ROAD ON 03/03/2016

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your
motor insurer, AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD acting on behalf of the owner of
SHD 5151Z against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the opinion that liability may be equally shared
between both parties due to conflicting versions without any concrete evidences to support each version.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against
your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights
afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct
of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 10
days from the date of this letter. Your intent must be formally expressed to us and acknowledged by us.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to

Vasanthi@lkkauto.com within 10 days from the date of this letter_if not provided at our reporting centre.
The list below is not all inclusive and further document may be required:

Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)
Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to
keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third
Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or seftlement without AXA's prior
knowledge and consent.



. This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any
breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you informed of the
final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6256 3561 or email us at
Vasanthi@lkkauto.com

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Best Regards,

R.Vasanthi (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6841-2132 | email:Vasanthi@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Pending Driver LiCense

CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case Notified | E<t Submited | AdjAssigned | AdjRpt | AdjSubmitted | Ins Auth'ed | Status
0B Mar 2016 0 Mar 2016 | $§650.00 $$650.00 Recding forh |
Main 10:34 Edit Estimates | view fpt | _Cﬂlﬁil |
Edit Adj Rpt t

Reference Claim Details

| CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by insurer]

| Insured: SEAGULL PTE. LTD., Co. Reg No.: 200311843H - -

| Main Claimant: TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD, Co. Reg. No.: 200303878K =
Vehicle Reg. No.: SHD5151Z Date of Loss: |03/03/2016 20:00 - :59
Claim Type: TP/ CO 374771 Policy/Cover Note No.: | F1594330 [Com prehensive)

Vehicle Reg. No.

| (Insured): .'I"H495?T Policy No. tl:lair_nfnt}: VPX/P1680520

! Excess: [ssoo0 .

Repairer: Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd (Ang Mo Kio) 2, Ang Mo Kio Street 63, 569111 Ang Mo Kio - Tel: 62876666

Handling Insurer: AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6336 7288 ... [Handled by Khor Saw Theng - G8H0 4754]
| Claimant's Insurer: AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6338 7268 o - o
| adjuster: LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd {HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ... [Handled by KENNETH KONG] .. [Final Rpt due

g |17/03/2016] = o

Driver/Custodian
(Insured}:

ALBERT ANTHONY [}, MRIC: 59131059G, Tel: +6592714304

| ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose Case Man |

A¥A_SG (14/12/2016): Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN495TT (01 : AXA - CO374771) and SHD...
AXA_SG (03/10/2016): Re: Direct sertiement - Accident Involving YN4957T (DI : AXA - CO374771) and SHD...
AXA_SG (20/05/2016): Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YH4957T (O] : AXA - CO374771) and SHD...
A¥A_SG (08/03/2016): WP / New TP Assignment - CO374771/P1594390

c

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS View ai | Search Tasks | Creste New Task | _Compiete ||
Due Date Priority Typa Task Group Subject Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done? |

F Ma rasults,

hitns://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox= MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 20/6/2017
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Claim Documents

*SHD5151Z (CO374771)
[YMN4957T]
TP
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
Mar 3 2016 8:00PM
[SEAGULL PTE. LTD.]
Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd

w7
Print

Print

¥

Print

Print

Uglgad Documents Upload Photos | Compose New Letter | View Use Viewes

Assessment Reports 1 per page -
Mo | Finalized On ANA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) | :Thumhnail:

1| 03/10/16 14:31 :':ff::'_‘iiﬁ'i‘mﬂ:ncmi ISV ©  Load HTM
No | Finalized On |LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) N ~|[Thumbnail

1 08/03/16 17:10  Adjuster Immediate Advice © | oadH™™ |
Documentation 1 per page -
Mo Finalized .{J_n AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ) '_ o 'Thumt_r_rialli

1 08/03/1609:16  Email_ABS | € | ioadPOF
2 0B/03/1609:16  SHDS5151Z TP GIA Report_ABS | €@ | LosspoF

3 08/03/16 09:16  Police Report_ABS | €Y | Load FOF |
4 08/03/16 10:20 €I € | Load POF

S 08/03/1610:23  POLICY SCHEDULE | @ | Load POF
No | Relabel/Reorder LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) ) ~ Thumbnail
| p8/03/16 11:18 TP ESTIMATE - MARKED @ | loadPDF |
3 20/0G/17 11:39  LKK INSPECTION PHOTOS €  LcadroF

3 20/06/17 14:40 | LETTER TO OI ' | €9 | Load PoF

Documents Checklist

OOCUMENTS CHECKLIST

There are no document checklists configured.

[
Our Checklist Remarks - LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ)

Show Remarks To: [ Handling Insurer
| Mobe: Ramarks 808 private unless you show il 10 ciher partes.

) Ftr,set1 Save F‘;t I

_i

htlns:;‘fsinaapore.mcrimen.coma’ciaims.*'index.cfm?fusebox=MTRduc&fuseactinn=dsp_... 20/6/2017
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd icoregno:19es07128R)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933

Tel: 6258-3561 Fax: 5844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CC3/AXA16004337/KZB3S2
Date: 20/06/2017
REFERENCE
Handllr!:g AXMA Insurance Pte Lid Policy No: P1584350
Insurer:
Gialmank SHD5151Z Insured Vehicle No : YNA4GSTT
Vehicle No :
Date of Loss: 03032016 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No: Co374771
DESC ION & IDENTIFIC M
Reg No: SHD51512
Make & Model: TOYOTA WISH, 2.0 (A) Engine No: 3ZRA412988
Reg. Date: 30/12/2009 (Man. Year: 2008) Chassis No:  JTDGJ20W105001432
Colour: Red \White Odometer: 560734 km
Engine Capacity: 1987 ce
Market Value/New Car Price: A

Sum Insured (5%):

Market Value/New Car Price

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY

General Condition: Good Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
ND E E
Front Tyre Size: 195/65R15 Rear Tyre Size: 195/65R15
Front Left Side: Rovelo 4 mm Rear Left Side: Falken 6 mm
Front Right Side: Rovelo 4 mm Rear Right Side: Falken 6 mm
The above valugs represent the remaiming fyr reads tepth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
FParts 2.806.38 655.82 2,150.56 7663
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1,780.00 150.00 1,630.00 o1.57
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (5%} 4, 586.38 B05.82 3,780.56 B2.43
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 650.00
(S58%) 4 586.38 650.00 3.936.38 B5.83
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 321.05 45,50 275.55 85.83
Nett Amount (S§) 4,907.43 695.50 4,211.93 85.83
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 0B/03/2016
Date Inspected: 04/03/2016 Inspected At Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd (Ang
Mo Kio)
2, Ang Mo Kio Street 63
Singapore 569111
Estimated Period of Repair: 1.0 days
Adjuster; KENNETH KONG Manager: ZAY YER LYNN

NOTE: This report represents our findings af the time and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has been camied out to the best of our
knawladge and abiiify but any ather liabilify under any ather circumstances is harsby exprassly exciuded
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REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: (Last Synchronised: 20 Jun 2017)

Parts: MIA TOYOTA WISH 2.0 (4) (Model not available in database)

Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SHD5151Z)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page
Further Info: llems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's  Amount

1 1 *FRONT FENDER (CONSISTENT) Repair B3760FL “FL
2 1 *FRONT FENDER LINER LH (CONSISTENT) Serviceable 369.14 FL *-FL
3 1 *FRONT DOOR LH (CONSISTENT) Repair 1,554.00 FL “-FL
4 1 *FRONT SIDE VIEW MIRROR LH (CONSISTENT) Broken B7443FL “BT7443FL
5 1 “DOOR STICKER TRANS-CAB LH (CONSISTENT) Mot Necessary BO.DOFS *-FS

F=Franchise part. S=Spcett. L=ListitemDisc e —

Sub Total (38 3,715.17 874.43
- List Item Discount on L Items 25.00/25.00% (S$) 908.79 21861

Total Parts (S§) 2,806.38 65582

I_ Report was unsubmitied during this print-out. _|
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

No  Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 PANEL BEATING, KNOCKING AND STRAIGHTENING THE New 840.00 60.00

NECESSARY PORTION, REMOVE AND RENEWAL OF
PARTS, ADJUST AND REALIGN THE SAME.

TO CHECK ELECTRICAL LIGHTING CONCERNED. Mew 120.00 10.00

3 PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING OF THE AFFECTED New 820.00 80.00
PORTION.

Gross Labour Cost (S§) 1,780.00 150.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. J

< END OF ESTIMATES =
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