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This mail is associated with :

*SHF710H (C0382818)
[SKP4291K]
P
TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD
May 4 2016 2:00PM
[ONG, YU YAN]
Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd
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From LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 19/06/2017 15:03 PM.
To jas.tan@axa.com.sg; AXA_SG
CcC sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@Ilkkauto.com

Subject No Development- C0382818/GA061929

Dear Jas,

refer to the below email.

We had finalised the amount with TP's repairer. But till date TP's repairer did not submit LOD despite of our reminders.

As such, the matter is dragging long and there is NO development. We therefore proceed to temporary close and submit the report to your office.
If any new development in future, we will inform you for further handling.

Best Regards

Zayer

Dear Lynn,

Refer to the below email.

This is a case of conflicting version. Therefore, we already wrote an email to TP requested for evidence.

Just for update, it is pending reply from Trans-Cab. We will follow up the matter and revert back to you if any outcome. Thanks.

Best Regards
Zayer

<-- Original Message -->

From: AXA_SG

To: LKK_HQ;sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com
CC: AXA_SG

Sent On: 10/05/2016 03:04 PM

Subject: New TP Assignment - C0382818/GA061929

Dear LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd,
Please survey the vehicle and proceed for direct settlement if damages consistent.

Workshop Name: Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd
Policy Number: GA061929

Vehicle Number: SHF710H

Date of Accident:04/05/2016

Estimated Claim Amount:

Excess:

Claim Handler Name: Lynn Khong

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY
There are no documents.
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