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Fw: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMH 8267 Z & SKV 7174 P ON 02/05/2020 || C10006266

Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Tue 5/5/2020 10:50 AM
To:  Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Hansel Ang <hansel.ang@budgetdirect.com.sg>

2 attachments (2 MB)
SMH8267Z.pdf; SKV7174P.pdf;

Hi Team,

We would like to request for TP PRS for SMH8267Z.  They have chosen Mr. Kenneth Kong to survey this
vehicle.

Workshop informa�on:
KUM CHEW MOTOR WORKSHOP 
160 Sin Ming Drive
#05-08 Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722
Tel : 64563715  Fax : 64557754

Please confirm.  Thank you.

Regards,
 
Ivy Ratilla
Executive, Claims Admin
 
T +65 6540 2185
F +65 6725 0853 
Eivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg
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Customer Care +65 6221 2111
Claims +65 6221 2199
Claims (Int.) +65 6540 2199
 
190 Clemenceau Avenue, #03-01
Singapore Shopping Centre
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Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget
Direct Insurance.
 
This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments
(email) reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This
email is confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended
addressee, confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or
disclosure of this email is unauthorised.
 
This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto & General) and
is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and a�achments (email) reflect the views of the
stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confiden�al and subject to copyright. It
may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confiden�ality and privilege have not been waived and
any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.

From: kumchew1 <kumchew1@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 5 May 2020 10:14
To: Ivy Ra�lla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>; 'Seetoh' <seetoh10@yahoo.com>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMH 8267 Z & SKV 7174 P ON 02/05/2020 || C10006266
 
Hi Ms Ivy,
 
Refer to your email today.
 
Kindly arrange Mr Kenneth Kong (LKK Auto consultant) to pre-repair inspec�on our client vehicle.
 
Thank you
 
Best Regards,
  
Mdm Lim
 
KUM CHEW MOTOR WORKSHOP 
160 Sin Ming Drive

 

#05-08 Sin Ming AutoCity

 

Singapore 575722

 

Tel : 64563715  Fax : 64557754

 
From: kumchew1 <kumchew1@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 4 May 2020 16:54
To: Ivy Ra�lla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMH 8267 Z & SKV 7174 P ON 02/05/2020.
 

Dear Sir,

We are acting on behalf of Mr Lee Cher Chiang,the owner of SMH 8267 Z in the
above matter.

https://www.budgetdirect.com.sg/?utm_source=signature&utm_medium=email&utm_term=bdi_e-signature_all_homepage_1x1&utm_campaign=email
mailto:kumchew1@singnet.com.sg
mailto:ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg


5/5/2020 Mail - Admin-D (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office365.com/mail/deeplink?version=2020042702.14&popoutv2=1&leanbootstrap=1 3/3

Kindly arrange for pre-repair with the following details;

Venue                         : Kum Chew Motor Workshop

                               160, Sin Ming Drive #05-08

                               Sin Ming Autocity

                               Singapore 575722.

Contact No.                : 64536256.

Thank & Best Regards,
Mdm Lim

This email is sent by Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited, Auto & General (SEA)
Services Pte. Limited, Easy Compare (Thailand) Co., Ltd or a related body corporate (Auto & General)
and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect the
views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and
subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and
privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.
If you are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then delete the email.
Auto & General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.
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the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and subject to
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have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised. If you
are not the intended addressee, please immediately notify the sender and then delete the email. Auto
& General does not warrant that this email is error or virus free.


