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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept <claims_rar@bifrostauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 8 May 2020 6:04 PM

To: Guo Qiang (LKKAuto)

Cc: claims; Lucas Chow

Subject: Re: Finalize SFQ5828K

Without Prejudice, 
 
Dear Guo, 
 
We hereby confirm COR at $1900 before GST @ 4 working days. 
 
Thank you. 
 
The contents of this document apply to vehicle damages only. All personal injuries and damages arising 

therefrom are excluded from the ambit and application of this document.  
 
Nur'Ikhwan 
Motor Claims Department 
Tel: 9329 0237 
 
 
On Fri, 8 May 2020 at 17:54, Guo Qiang (LKKAuto) <GuoQiang@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Ikhwan, 
  
Finalize COR $1900 before GST @ 4 working days.  
  
Regards, 
Guo Qiang 

 


