Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>

Sent: Thursday, 21 May 2020 4:27 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: Chloe; Admin A

Subject: Re: SDG9637U CLAIMING AGAINST SMF7303U DOA:31.03.2020 *** LKK REF:
CC6/EQI20005519/Aga3

Without Prejudice
Hi Cecilia
Thanks for your email, we accept your offer of $7,250.

*** please kindly highlight to EQ, payment under "New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd" ***

Best Regards,

Sukyi Chong

New Hock Teck Motor Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 Blk C #01-43 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit S(417883)
Tel : 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

On Thu, May 21, 2020 at 2:56 PM Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sukyi,

We are pleased to offer G/S $7250.00 (all-in).



