Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 6 May 2020 12:31 pm
To: ‘Gan Li Hui'

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: YN5735K REPAIR LIMIT

Hi,

As per call with Darren, Repair limit revised to $14,000.

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) [mailto:taufikh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 6 May 2020 12:00 PM

To: 'Gan Li Hui'

Cc: 'Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)'

Subject: YN5735K REPAIR LIMIT

Hi,
Please be inform repair limit for this lorry is $13,000.
Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto



