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Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Darren Chiu <darren@completevms.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 October 2020 4:12 pm

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto); Gan Li Hui

Subject: Re: YN5735K REPAIR LIMIT

Ok. We agreeded to your offer. 

 

 

 

Regards, 

Darren Chiu 

 
To help 
protect your 
privacy, 
Micro so ft 
Office 
prevented 
auto matic  
download of 

this pictu re  
from the  
In ternet. 

Complete VMS PTE LTD 
The Premier One-Stop Vehicle Accident Claims Centre 
 

Hp:  83332118 
Tel:  64550012 
Fax: 65540012 
Block 176 Sin Ming Drive, #03-14 / 07 
Sin Ming Autocare Complex, Singapore 575721 
 

 

 

On Tue, Oct 27, 2020 at 12:31 PM Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Darren, 

  

As per our tele-conversation , COR for TMA L/S $18,000. 

  

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

  

From: Gan Li Hui [mailto:lihui@completevms.com.sg]  
Sent: Friday, 8 May 2020 12:48 PM 

To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) 

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR; Darren Chiu 
Subject: Re: YN5735K REPAIR LIMIT 

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Shirley, 

  

We accept Lorry repair $14000 before GST (excluding TMA), please advise TMA repair cost. 
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Thank you & Best Regards, 
Gan Li Hui (Ms) 

Complete VMS PTE LTD 

Block 176 Sin Ming Drive, #03-14  

Sin Ming Autocare Complex, Singapore 575721 

Tel:  6455 0012    Fax: 6554 0012 

  

  

On Fri, 8 May 2020 at 11:40, Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Li Hui, 

  

Kindly let us know whether you can repair the vehicle within the repair limit since insurance is chasing. 

  

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim 

related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 6 May 2020 12:31 pm 
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To: 'Gan Li Hui' <lihui@completevms.com.sg> 

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: YN5735K REPAIR LIMIT 

  

Hi, 

  

As per call with Darren, Repair limit revised to $14,000. 

  

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

  

From: Taufikh (LKK Auto) [mailto:taufikh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 6 May 2020 12:00 PM 

To: 'Gan Li Hui' 
Cc: 'Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)' 
Subject: YN5735K REPAIR LIMIT 

  

Hi, 

  

Please be inform repair limit for this lorry is $13,000. 

  

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 


