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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 7 July 2022 4:07 pm
To: 'Wai Yin Ng'
Cc: Admin A; 'Claims'
Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD2004-088 -- Accident involving SMM560C & SHD258H on 27/04/2020 

*** LKK REF: CC3/AIG20005468/Kga3 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Your ref: SHD 258H           
Our Ref: CC3/AIG20005468/Kga3                
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMM560C & SHD258H on 27/04/2020 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Kindly check and advise if your client is still interested to pursue with his third-party claim against our principal M/s AIG 
ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD. 
 
Please revert on the offer acceptance within 3 days from the date of this e-mail. Otherwise, we shall have no other option 
but to submit our report to our principal for closure. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6749-4274 | HP: 8891 1278 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Friday, 27 May 2022 9:07 am 
To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD2004-088 -- Accident involving SMM560C & SHD258H on 27/04/2020 *** LKK REF: 
CC3/AIG20005468/Kga3  



2

 
3RD REMINDER 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Wai Yin,  
 
We have our principal instruction to maintained our stand at 50/50 settlement.  
 
Therefore, we maintain our last offer of $1488.15 (all-in).  
 
Kindly confirm acceptance.  
 
Thanks  
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 16 March 2022 8:25 am 
To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD2004-088 -- Accident involving SMM560C & SHD258H on 27/04/2020 *** LKK REF: 
CC3/AIG20005468/Kga3  
 
2ND REMINDER 
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Wai Yin,  
 
We have our principal instruction to maintained our stand at 50/50 settlement.  
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Therefore, we maintain our last offer of $1488.15 (all-in).  
 
Kindly confirm acceptance.  
 
Thanks  
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6749-4274 | MAIN: 6256 3561 | EMAIL: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| FAX: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Friday, 14 January 2022 5:03 pm 
To: Wai Yin Ng <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD2004-088 -- Accident involving SMM560C & SHD258H on 27/04/2020 *** LKK REF: 
CC3/AIG20005468/Kga3  
 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Wai Yin,  
 
We have our principal instruction to maintained our stand at 50/50 settlement.  
 
Therefore, we maintain our last offer of $1488.15 (all-in).  
 
Kindly confirm acceptance.  
 
Thanks  
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 


