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Vivian Lau

From: Do-Not-Reply <do-not-reply@merimen.com>

Sent: Friday, 6 May, 2016 12:40 PM

To: do-not-reply@merimen.com

Cc: Vivian Lau; Thin Thin

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SDR2600M (OI : AXA - TBA) and 

SHD5218R (TP : LKK REF - CC3/AXA16000719/Kwb3) on 21.12.2015

This mail is associated with : 

*SHD5218R (C0368957) 

[SDR2600M] 
TP 

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD 

Dec 21 2015 4:00PM 

[YEE HONG PTE LTD] 

Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd 

Your Ref : C0368957 

Our Ref : CC3/AXA16000719/Kwb3            

                                                 

Dear Kitty, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SDR 2600M (Insured) & SHD 5218R ( Third Party) ON 21/12/2015 

ALONG THOMSON SERVICE ROAD  
  

We refer to the above matter 

  

The third party reported that he was travelling turning into Thomson Plaza towards the Taxi Stand, OI 

travelling straight and collided. 

  

Insured reported that he drove out from Thomson Plaza Car Park. TP turning in the driveway and brush 

against OI. 

  

Based on the circumstances of both parties and available information in hand our opinion that OI coming 

out form the Car Park which was travelling straight on the main driveway, TP turning into the driveway 

towards the Taxi Stand.   

  

As such, we intend to reject the claim. 

  

Kindly advice on your view/opinion/instruction for this claim. 
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Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Vivian Lau| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 

6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

  

<-- Original Message -->  

From: LKK_HQ 

To: zhengxin.jim@axa.com.sg 

CC: AXA_SG; vivianlau@lkkauto.com; thinthin@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com 

Sent On: 20/01/2016 09:28 AM 

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SDR2600M (OI : AXA - TBA) and SHD5218R (TP : LKK 

REF - CC3/AXA16000719/Kwb3) on 21.12.2015 

   

Dear Jim, 

  

As per instruction, we will proceed direct settlement for this case. 

 

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625. 

 

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei | Admin 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

[ This mail is sent from a mailer account - do not reply to this email address ]  


