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Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 18 June 2020 11:20 AM

To: 'Jacelyn'

Cc: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION: SMF5520Y - TP/CHINA TAIPING - VW GOLF A7 (DOA 

09.04.2020)

Hi Jacelyn 

 

COR l/s $2250 , 3 days. 

 

Regards 

Taufikh 

Lkk Auto 

 

From: Jacelyn [mailto:jacelyn@mova.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 8 June 2020 11:35 AM 
To: 'Taufikh (LKKAuto)' 

Subject: FINALIZATION: SMF5520Y - TP/CHINA TAIPING - VW GOLF A7 (DOA 09.04.2020) 

 

Dear Taufikh, 

  

Please find the attached ‘Marking Estimate’ & ‘After-Paint’ photographs for your reference.  

  

We propose the finalize amount at Lumpsum $ 2,250.00 & 3 working days. Kindly revert. 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Jacelyn Ooi 
Estimator 
Mova Automotive Pte Ltd 

Tel: 6272 3892 Fax: 6270 8314 
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its content.  We would be grateful if you would notify us by email and delete the original transmission and any attachment from your system.  
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