From: Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg>

Sent: 4 December 2020 12:32 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Request for counter claim status - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 4250G & SFK 9218B ON
03/04/2020

Dear Knanchna,

Please see below:

RE: M2002317-TG -RE: LIABILITY / ARRANGE FOR SURVEY / YOUR REF: SLR4250G / OUR REF: g ratis

To Ronald Ya Yee PeiLi

Cc  Jess Frands /

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Ronald,

We agree to do direct settlement as liability is in your client’s favour. Please liaise with Shirley to arrange survey Thank you.

Dear Shirley,

Please arrange survey. Thank you.

Best Regards

Telma Gomez
Assistant Manager, Motor Claims

Tokio Marine Insurance Singapore Lid.

Thank You,

Ronald Yap

5 Ubi Close
S408605
Eurokars Group

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@I|kkauto.com>

Sent: 03 December 2020 17:58

To: Ronald Yap <ronald.yap@eurokars.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Request for counter claim status - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 4250G & SFK 9218B ON
03/04/2020

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Ronald,

We are acting on behalf of our mutual client (MR NG TIONG GUAN — SFK9218B).

We were informed by our mutual client that you are helping them to file a Third party property
damage claim against the insurer of_SLR 4250G.

Kindly let us have the outcome and the percentage (i.e. 50% or 100%) of the said claim.
If successful, kindly also let us have a copy of the DV.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




