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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: winnie@yoga-legal.com

Sent: Friday, 22 May 2020 4:53 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B

Follow Up Flag: Flag for follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Asher 

 

The breakdown of our proposal is as follows:- 

 

1. Damages                                             $7,000.00 

2. Survey fee                                          $   550.00 

3. Cost and disbursements                $   600.00 

$8,150.00 

 

Thank you. 

 

Regards, 

 

Winnie Phee 

M/s C. YOGARAJAH LLC 

883 North Bridge Road 

#11-03 Southbank 

Singapore 198785 

Tel   :  (65) 6292 5838 

Fax  :  (65) 6292 5938 

(UEN No. 201333127N) (GST Reg No. 201333127N) 

 

Important Note: This electronic mail transmission (including any attachments) is private and confidential and may 

contain legally privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, you may not use, copy or disseminate 

the information contained herein.  Please delete this message and its attachments immediately and contact us at 

(65) 6292 5838, if you have received this message in error. Thank you. 

 

 

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 20 May 2020 9:08 AM 

To: winnie@yoga-legal.com 

Subject: Re: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B 

 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
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Hi Winnie, 

 

We refer to the email below. 

 

Please provide us with the breakdown of your counter proposed in order for us to review the matter. 

 

We previously  have inform that our surveyor recommended repair cost at $5,050 (8days) 

  

Therefore our offer to your client's is fair and reasonable settle at global sum $6,950 (all in). 

  

Please kindly advise your client to reconsider and let us have the acceptance. 

  

Thank You.  

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

From: winnie@yoga-legal.com <winnie@yoga-legal.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, May 19, 2020 4:42 PM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B  

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Asher 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Our client is not agreeable to your offer and proposes at a global sum of $8,150.00 all-in. 

  

Kindly let us hear from you. 

  

Regards, 

  

Winnie Phee 

M/s C. YOGARAJAH LLC 
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883 North Bridge Road 

#11-03 Southbank 

Singapore 198785 

Tel   :  (65) 6292 5838 

Fax  :  (65) 6292 5938 

(UEN No. 201333127N) (GST Reg No. 201333127N) 

  

Important Note: This electronic mail transmission (including any attachments) is private and confidential and may 

contain legally privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, you may not use, copy or disseminate 

the information contained herein.  Please delete this message and its attachments immediately and contact us at 

(65) 6292 5838, if you have received this message in error. Thank you. 

  

  

  

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Friday, 17 April 2020 4:21 PM 

To: Winnie Phee <winnie@yoga-legal.com> 

Subject: Re: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B 

  

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Hi Winnie, 

  

We refer to the email below. 

  

We understand that third party repairer does not have GST, however previously CNB offer cost repair with 

GST. 

  

Enclosed a copy of the adjuster report. 

  

Thank You.  

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
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From: Winnie Phee <winnie@yoga-legal.com> 

Sent: Friday, April 17, 2020 4:16 PM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B  

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

  

Dear Asher 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Kindly let us have your surveyor's report. 

  

We note that CNB has previously offered us repair costs at $5,403.50 based on their surveyor's report. 

  

Thank you. 

 

Regards 

  

Winnie Phee 

M/s C. YOGARAJAH LLC 

883 North Bridge Road 

#11-03 Southbank 

Singapore 198785 

Tel      :  (65) 6292 5838 

Fax     :  (65) 6292 5938 

Email :  winnie@yoga-legal.com 

(UEN No. 201333127N) (GST Reg No. 201333127N) 

  

Important Note: This electronic mail transimission (including any attachments) is private and confidential and may 

contain legally privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, you may not use, copy or disseminate 

the information contained herein.  Please delete this message and its attachments immediately and contact us at 

(65) 6292 5838, if you have received this message in error. Thank you. 

  

  

On Fri, Apr 17, 2020 at 8:40 AM Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
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  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Hi Winnie, 

  

We refer to the matter below. 

  

Our surveyor recommended repair cost at $5,050 (8days) 

  

Therefore our offer to your client's is fair and reasonable settle at global sum $6,950 (all in). 

  

Please kindly advise your client to reconsider and let us have the acceptance. 

  

Thank You.  

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

From: Winnie Phee <winnie@yoga-legal.com> 

Sent: Thursday, April 16, 2020 6:10 PM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B  

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

  

Dear Asher 

  

We refer to your email of even date. 

  

Our client is not agreeable to your offer therein and proposes to settle at a global sum of $8,350.00 (all-in). 

  

Kindly let us hear from you soon. 

  

Thank you. 

 

Regards 

  

Winnie Phee 
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M/s C. YOGARAJAH LLC 

883 North Bridge Road 

#11-03 Southbank 

Singapore 198785 

Tel      :  (65) 6292 5838 

Fax     :  (65) 6292 5938 

Email :  winnie@yoga-legal.com 

(UEN No. 201333127N) (GST Reg No. 201333127N) 

  

Important Note: This electronic mail transimission (including any attachments) is private and confidential and may 

contain legally privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, you may not use, copy or disseminate 

the information contained herein.  Please delete this message and its attachments immediately and contact us at 

(65) 6292 5838, if you have received this message in error. Thank you. 

  

  

On Thu, Apr 16, 2020 at 5:13 PM Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Hi Sir, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

On a without prejudice, for a quick and amicable settlement, we propose the settlement at Global Sum S$6,950.00 

(all-in). 

  

Please kindly let us have your acceptance. 

  

Thank You.  
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Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

  

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Thursday, April 16, 2020 10:46 AM 

To: winnie@yoga-legal.com <winnie@yoga-legal.com> 

Subject: Re: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B  

  

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Hi Winnie, 

  

We refer to the email below. 

  

We have just received the assignment from our principal, shall review the matter and revert to you in due 

course. 

  

Thank You.  
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Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of claim related 

documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

  

From: winnie@yoga-legal.com <winnie@yoga-legal.com> 

Sent: Thursday, April 16, 2020 10:41 AM 

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B  

  

Dear Asher 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We were informed by CNB that this matter will be handled by you. 

  

As such, kindly let us have an offer as soon as possible. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Regards, 

  

Winnie Phee 

M/s C. YOGARAJAH LLC 

883 North Bridge Road 

#11-03 Southbank 
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Singapore 198785 

Tel      :  (65) 6292 5838 

Fax     :  (65) 6292 5938 

Email :  winnie@yoga-legal.com 

(UEN No. 201333127N) (GST Reg No. 201333127N) 

  

Important Note: This electronic mail transmission (including any attachments) is private and confidential and may 

contain legally privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, you may not use, copy or disseminate 

the information contained herein.  Please delete this message and its attachments immediately and contact us at 

(65) 6292 5838, if you have received this message in error. Thank you. 

  

From: Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 16 April 2020 10:09 am 

To: winnie@yoga-legal.com 

Cc: Jun Tian LEE (CNB) <LEE_Jun_Tian@cnb.gov.sg>; Shirlene YEO (CNB) <Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg> 

Subject: RE: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B 

  

Message Classification: Restricted 

Hi, 

  

The case handler mentioned is in my previous email. I do not have their case reference, it is sufficient to let them 

know the CNB vehicle number when you contact them. Thanks. 

  

Chris Tan 

Logistics Officer 

Corporate Services Division  

DID: (65) 6557 4315 

Mobile: (65) 9049 7706 
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Central Narcotics Bureau   W cnb.gov.sg    FB fb.com/CNB.DrugFreeSG    IG 

Instagram.com/cnb.drugfreesg 

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must 

not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized 

person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error." 

  

From: winnie@yoga-legal.com <winnie@yoga-legal.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 16 April 2020 10:07 AM 

To: Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 

Cc: Jun Tian LEE (CNB) <LEE_Jun_Tian@cnb.gov.sg>; Shirlene YEO (CNB) <Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg> 

Subject: RE: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B 

  

Dear Chris 

  

Kindly advise who is the case handler from LKK and their file reference number. 

  

Thank you. 

  

Regards, 

  

Winnie Phee 

M/s C. YOGARAJAH LLC 

883 North Bridge Road 

#11-03 Southbank 

Singapore 198785 

Tel      :  (65) 6292 5838 

Fax     :  (65) 6292 5938 
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Email :  winnie@yoga-legal.com 

(UEN No. 201333127N) (GST Reg No. 201333127N) 

  

Important Note: This electronic mail transmission (including any attachments) is private and confidential and may 

contain legally privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, you may not use, copy or disseminate 

the information contained herein.  Please delete this message and its attachments immediately and contact us at 

(65) 6292 5838, if you have received this message in error. Thank you. 

  

From: Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 16 April 2020 9:21 am 

To: winnie@yoga-legal.com 

Cc: Jun Tian LEE (CNB) <LEE_Jun_Tian@cnb.gov.sg>; Shirlene YEO (CNB) <Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg> 

Subject: RE: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B 

  

Message Classification: Restricted 

Dear Winnie 

  

This case is currently being processed by our claims adjuster, LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd. 

  

Please contact the case handler directly for any matters concerning this claim: 

  

Asher Sng | Case Handler   

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

  

Thank you. 

  

Chris Tan 

Logistics Officer 

Corporate Services Division  

DID: (65) 6557 4315 

Mobile: (65) 9049 7706 
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Central Narcotics Bureau   W cnb.gov.sg    FB fb.com/CNB.DrugFreeSG    IG 

Instagram.com/cnb.drugfreesg 

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must 

not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized 

person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error." 

  

From: winnie@yoga-legal.com <winnie@yoga-legal.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 15 April 2020 5:56 PM 

To: Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 

Cc: Jun Tian LEE (CNB) <LEE_Jun_Tian@cnb.gov.sg>; Shirlene YEO (CNB) <Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg> 

Subject: RE: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sirs 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We were informed by our client’s workshop that the repairs were completed before 23/11/2018 and they did not 

made a record of the dates of repair. 

  

Kindly let us have your offer within the next seven (7) days hereof. 

  

Regards, 

  

Winnie Phee 

M/s C. YOGARAJAH LLC 

883 North Bridge Road 



13

#11-03 Southbank 

Singapore 198785 

Tel      :  (65) 6292 5838 

Fax     :  (65) 6292 5938 

Email :  winnie@yoga-legal.com 

(UEN No. 201333127N) (GST Reg No. 201333127N) 

  

Important Note: This electronic mail transmission (including any attachments) is private and confidential and may 

contain legally privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, you may not use, copy or disseminate 

the information contained herein.  Please delete this message and its attachments immediately and contact us at 

(65) 6292 5838, if you have received this message in error. Thank you. 

  

From: Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 5 September 2019 10:16 am 

To: winnie <winnie@yoga-legal.com> 

Cc: Jun Tian LEE (CNB) <LEE_Jun_Tian@cnb.gov.sg>; Shirlene YEO (CNB) <Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg> 

Subject: RE: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B 

  

Message Classification: Confidential 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Winnie 

  

Please provide the final repair bill showing the dates of repair for our review. Thank you. 

  

Chris Tan 

Logistics Officer 

Corporate Services Division 

DID: (65) 6557 4315 
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Keeping Singapore Drug-Free 

 

Central Narcotics Bureau W cnb.gov.sg    FB fb.com/CNB.DrugFreeSG   IG Instagram.com/cnb.drugfreesg 
WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must 
not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorised 
person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error" 

  

  

From: winnie <winnie@yoga-legal.com>  

Sent: Sunday, 1 September 2019 2:22 PM 

To: Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 

Cc: Jun Tian LEE (CNB) <LEE_Jun_Tian@cnb.gov.sg>; Shirlene YEO (CNB) <Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg> 

Subject: RE: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sirs 

  

We refer to your email on 20 August 2019. 

  

Our client is not agreeable to your offer therein and proposes to settle as follows:- 

  

1.Damages (repair costs + loss of use)                     $7,200.00 

2.Survey fee                                                                   $   550.00 

3.LTA                                                                                $       7.49 

4.Costs and incidentals with GST                               $   749.00 

$8,506.49 

  

Kindly let us hear from you as soon as possible. 

  

Regards 

  

Winnie Phee 
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M/s C. YOGARAJAH LLC 

883 North Bridge Road 

#11-03 Southbank 

Singapore 198785 

Tel      :  (65) 6292 5838 

Fax     :  (65) 6292 5938 

Email :  winnie@yoga-legal.com 

(UEN No. 201333127N) (GST Reg No. 201333127N) 

  

Important Note: This electronic mail transmission (including any attachments) is private and confidential and may 

contain legally privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, you may not use, copy or disseminate 

the information contained herein.  Please delete this message and its attachments immediately and contact us at 

(65) 6292 5838, if you have received this message in error. Thank you. 

  

From: Chris TAN (CNB) [mailto:Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg]  
Sent: Tuesday, 20 August, 2019 9:40 AM 

To: winnie 

Cc: Jun Tian LEE (CNB); Shirlene YEO (CNB) 
Subject: RE: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B 

  

Message Classification: Confidential 

Dear Winnie 

  

Our offer is as follows: 

  

Repair costs (based on our surveyor’s report) 5,403.50 

Loss of Use (8 days repair based on our surveyor’s report + 3 days 

PRI) 

660.00 

Survey report fee 550.00 

LTA fee 7.49 

Costs and Incidentals 534.13 

TOTAL 6,801.62 

  

Please confirm acceptance. 
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Chris Tan 

Logistics Officer 

Corporate Services Division 

DID: (65) 6557 4315 

  

 

 

 Keeping Singapore Drug-Free 
Central Narcotics Bureau W cnb.gov.sg    FB fb.com/CNB.DrugFreeSG   IG Instagram.com/cnb.drugfreesg 

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must 
not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorised 
person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error" 

  

  

From: winnie <winnie@yoga-legal.com>  

Sent: Sunday, 11 August 2019 4:38 PM 

To: Shirlene YEO (CNB) <Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg>; Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 

Cc: Jun Tian LEE (CNB) <LEE_Jun_Tian@cnb.gov.sg> 

Subject: RE: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B 

  

Dear Sirs 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

For your information, PRI stands for Pre-Repair Inspection. 

  

Kindly let us have an offer within the next seven (7) working days hereof. 

  

Regards 

  

Winnie Phee 

M/s C. YOGARAJAH LLC 
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883 North Bridge Road 

#11-03 Southbank 

Singapore 198785 

Tel      :  (65) 6292 5838 

Fax     :  (65) 6292 5938 

Email :  winnie@yoga-legal.com 

(UEN No. 201333127N) (GST Reg No. 201333127N) 

  

Important Note: This electronic mail transmission (including any attachments) is private and confidential and may 

contain legally privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, you may not use, copy or disseminate 

the information contained herein.  Please delete this message and its attachments immediately and contact us at 

(65) 6292 5838, if you have received this message in error. Thank you. 

  

From: Shirlene YEO (CNB) [mailto:Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 29 July, 2019 9:44 AM 

To: winnie; Chris TAN (CNB) 
Cc: Jun Tian LEE (CNB) 
Subject: RE: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B 

  

Message Classification: Restricted 

Hi Winnie 

  

Any response on this, pls? Thanks.  

  

  

  

Shirlene Yeo  (Ms) 

Manager, Logistics Unit 

Corporate Services Division 

Central Narcotics Bureau 

DID:  (65) 6325 6626  
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Keeping Singapore Drug-Free 

Central Narcotics Bureau   W cnb.gov.sg    FB fb.com/CNB.DrugFreeSG   IG Instagram.com/cnb.drugfreesg 

  

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must 

not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized 

person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error." 

  

  

From: Shirlene YEO (CNB)  

Sent: Wednesday, 3 July 2019 4:52 PM 

To: 'winnie' <winnie@yoga-legal.com>; Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 

Cc: Jun Tian LEE (CNB) <LEE_Jun_Tian@cnb.gov.sg> 

Subject: RE: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B 

  

Message Classification: Restricted 

Hi Winnie 

  

What does PRI stand for? My colleague, Chris, is away and will be back next week. He will respond to you when he 

is back. 

  

Thanks 

  

  

  

Shirlene Yeo  (Ms) 

Manager, Logistics Unit 

Corporate Services Division 

Central Narcotics Bureau 

DID:  (65) 6325 6626  

  

    

Keeping Singapore Drug-Free 
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Central Narcotics Bureau   W cnb.gov.sg    FB fb.com/CNB.DrugFreeSG   IG Instagram.com/cnb.drugfreesg 

  

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must 

not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized 

person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error." 

  

  

From: winnie <winnie@yoga-legal.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 3 July 2019 10:29 AM 

To: Chris TAN (CNB) <Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg> 

Cc: Jun Tian LEE (CNB) <LEE_Jun_Tian@cnb.gov.sg>; Shirlene YEO (CNB) <Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg> 

Subject: RE: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B 

  

Dear Sirs 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

Please be informed that our client is claiming 15 days for loss of use (12 days as stated in the surveyor’s report + 3 

days for PRI period). 

  

As for accident report fee, we have yet to purchase the 3rd party report and will furnish it once we have done so. 

  

Kindly let us have an offer as soon as possible. 

  

Regards 

  

Winnie Phee 

M/s C. YOGARAJAH LLC 

883 North Bridge Road 

#11-03 Southbank 

Singapore 198785 

Tel      :  (65) 6292 5838 
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Fax     :  (65) 6292 5938 

Email :  winnie@yoga-legal.com 

(UEN No. 201333127N) (GST Reg No. 201333127N) 

  

Important Note: This electronic mail transmission (including any attachments) is private and confidential and may 

contain legally privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient, you may not use, copy or disseminate 

the information contained herein.  Please delete this message and its attachments immediately and contact us at 

(65) 6292 5838, if you have received this message in error. Thank you. 

  

From: Chris TAN (CNB) [mailto:Chris_TAN@cnb.gov.sg]  

Sent: Wednesday, 6 March, 2019 10:49 AM 
To: Lheny 

Cc: Jun Tian LEE (CNB); Shirlene YEO (CNB); winnie@yoga-legal.com 
Subject: RE: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B 

  

Message Classification: Restricted 

Without Prejudice 

  

  

Dear Lheny 

  

We have yet to receive any reply from you. Please provide the documents requested in the preceding 

email to facilitate our assessment of your client’s claim.  

  

2.            Thank you. 

  

  

Chris Tan 

Logistics Officer 

Corporate Services Division 

DID: (65) 6557 4315 
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Keeping Singapore Drug-Free 

Central Narcotics Bureau   W cnb.gov.sg    FB fb.com/CNB.DrugFreeSG   IG 

Instagram.com/cnb.drugfreesg 

  

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must 

not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized 

person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error." 

  

From: Chris TAN (CNB)  

Sent: Thursday, 31 January 2019 5:05 PM 

To: 'Lheny' <lheny@yoga-legal.com> 

Cc: Jun Tian LEE (CNB) <LEE_Jun_Tian@cnb.gov.sg>; Shirlene YEO (CNB) <Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg>; 

'winnie@yoga-legal.com' <winnie@yoga-legal.com> 

Subject: RE: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B 

  

Message Classification: Restricted 

Without Prejudice 

  

  

Dear Lheny 

  

Please provide the following information to facilitate our assessment of your client’s claim: 

  

a)            No. of days of Loss of Use 

  

b)            Invoice, receipt or any other proof of payment for Accident report fee 

  

2            Thank you.   

  

  

Chris Tan 
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Logistics Officer 

Corporate Services Division 

DID: (65) 6557 4315 

  

    

Keeping Singapore Drug-Free 

Central Narcotics Bureau   W cnb.gov.sg    FB fb.com/CNB.DrugFreeSG   IG 

Instagram.com/cnb.drugfreesg 

  

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must 

not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized 

person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error." 

  

From: Chris TAN (CNB)  

Sent: Tuesday, 29 January 2019 4:34 PM 

To: 'Lheny' <lheny@yoga-legal.com> 

Cc: Jun Tian LEE (CNB) <LEE_Jun_Tian@cnb.gov.sg>; Shirlene YEO (CNB) <Shirlene_YEO@cnb.gov.sg>; 

'winnie@yoga-legal.com' <winnie@yoga-legal.com> 

Subject: RE: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B 

  

Message Classification: Restricted 

Without Prejudice 

  

  

Dear Lheny 

  

Please be informed that we are looking into the claim and will request for more documents if required. 

We would appreciate it if you could hold your hands on this matter. 

  

2            Thank you.   
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Chris Tan 

Logistics Officer 

Corporate Services Division 

DID: (65) 6557 4315 

  

    

Keeping Singapore Drug-Free 

Central Narcotics Bureau   W cnb.gov.sg    FB fb.com/CNB.DrugFreeSG   IG 

Instagram.com/cnb.drugfreesg 

  

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must 

not copy, distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any information in this email to any unauthorized 

person is an offence under the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately if you receive this in error." 

  

From: Lheny <lheny@yoga-legal.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 29 January 2019 10:56 AM 

To: Jun Tian LEE (CNB) <LEE_Jun_Tian@cnb.gov.sg> 

Cc: winnie@yoga-legal.com 

Subject: FW: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B 

  

Dear Sirs 

  

We refer to our email on 13 December 2018. 

  

Please be informed that we have not received your offer till-date. 

  

Kindly let us hear from you within seven (7) days hereof. 

  

  

Best regards, 

  

Lheny 
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M/s C YOGARAJAH LLC 

883 North Bridge Road 

#11-03 Southbank 

Singapore 198785 

  

Tel: 6292 5838 

Fax: 6292 5938 

  

Email: lheny@yoga-legal.com 

  

From: Lheny [mailto:lheny@yoga-legal.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 13 December, 2018 3:57 PM 

To: 'lee_jun_tian@cnb.gov.sg' 

Cc: winnie@yoga-legal.com 
Subject: Our Ref: CY.10209A.18.GA(HW).wp(Lh); Your Ref: SLA 2103B 

  

Dear Sirs, 

  

Attached, please find our Letter of Demand with its enclosures. 

  

Best regards, 

  

Lheny 

  

M/s C YOGARAJAH LLC 

883 North Bridge Road 

#11-03 Southbank 

Singapore 198785 
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Tel: 6292 5838 

Fax: 6292 5938 

  

Email: lheny@yoga-legal.com 

  

  


