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Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701
GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 09 Apr 2020 / 15:32:17
Receipt Date/Time : 09 Apr 2020 / 15:32:17

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-200409-002084

Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference
No.

Amount
Before 

GST (S$)

GST
Amount

(S$)

Amount
After GST

(S$)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - SHA4117X
As at 07 Apr 2020/08:30:00
Insurance Co: MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LIMITED
1 Insurance Enquiry - SHA4117X

Enquiry Fee   
20200409153048774079

7.00 0.49 7.49

Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49

Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49

Rounding Difference 0.04

Total Amount Payable 7.45
 

Paid By

  421808XXXXXX2327   eNETS Credit Card 7.45

Total 7.45

Cash Change 0.00

Tendered Amount 7.45

Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

 

 

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

 

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee

may apply.
 

> Back to OneMotoring
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 25 November 2021 10:30 am
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20001832MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT *** LKK 

REF: CC4/FCI20005183/Qga3q2

Without Prejudice 
 
 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
Pls offer as per below: 
 
COR - $2,600.00 
LOU - $270.00 to $600.00 ($90.00 to $150.0 x 3 to 4 days) 
LTA Fee - $7.45 
Total -$2,877.45 to $3,207.45 
 
Regards. 
 
Chris Lim 
Motor Claims Dept. 
 
MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House #16-01 Singapore 068877  
| Tel: 6507 3848 | DID : 6507 3853 |  Fax No. : 6507 3849 |Email: ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg |Company Regn. No.
195000106C  
A Member of  Insurance Group 
 
Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"): 
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data. Please refer to 
http://www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement. 
 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged. If you are not the addressee or to 
whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it. If you have received this message in 
error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by return e-mail. 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 15 November 2021 3:34 pm 
To: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D20001832MFSH/1 // EXPRESS SETTLEMENT *** LKK REF: 
CC4/FCI20005183/Qga3q2 
 

Your ref : D20001832MFSH 

Our ref : CC4/FCI20005183/Qga3q2 
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Dear Sirs/Madam, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA 4117X & PA 9870B ON 07/04/2020   

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

It is a head-to-rear collision. Liability is not in our driver’s favour.  

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "AT AUTO CONSULTANT" at $3,327.45. 

  

The summary is as follows: - 

  

 Amount Claimed Amount Revised 

Cost of Repair  $  4,080.90 $2,600.00 
Loss of Use (4days x $180.00) $     720.00 $   720.00 (4days x $180.00) 
LTA/GIA Search Fee $         7.45 $       7.45 
Total $  4,808.35 $ 3,327.45 

 

  

**03 days recommendation for repair + 1PRS = 04 days 

  

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 

  

For your approval/instruction please 
 
 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence 

should be made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be 

in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 


