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As request following :  
  

1. RC                                    $3000 (  AS AGREED )  

2. Loss of use                     $560 ( $80  X 7 DAYS ) - 5 days recommend  + 1 day waiting PRS + 1 days 
weekend    

3. Towing fee                    $120 ( attachment bill )  

3. LTA    $7.45 
                  

  
@ 100 %  TOTAL       $ 3687.45  ( video - exit from car park)- submitted 12.5.20  
  
 
  
  
  
Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks  
  
 
 
Regards,  
Chris Chan Pick Yuen 
PERFECT WERKZ  
HP: 92712214 
 
 
 

From: chan pick yuen 
Sent: Tuesday, April 14, 2020 12:58 PM 
To: assignments@lkkauto.com <assignments@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: SJZ8518R DOA 9.4.20  
  
Dear Sir / Mdm ,  
 
Enclosed is estimate , log card & towing bill . 
Please print & pass Mr Adrian . Thanks  
 
Regards,  
Chris Chan Pick Yuen 
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Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 09 Apr 2020 / 22:27:07

Receipt Date/Time : 09 Apr 2020 / 22:27:06

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-200409-003274

Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference 
No.

Amount 
Before

GST (S$)

GST 
Amount 

(S$)

Amount 
After GST 

(S$)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - GBF9676K
As at 09 Apr 2020/14:00:00
Insurance Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.

1 Insurance Enquiry - GBF9676K
Enquiry Fee 
20200409222608293599

7.00 0.49 7.49

Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49

Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49

Rounding Difference 0.04

Total Amount Payable 7.45

Paid By

20200409222627291
Direct Debit: eNETS Debit 

(Internet Banking)
7.45

Total 7.45

Cash Change 0.00

Tendered Amount 7.45

Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service 
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee 

may apply.
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 14 May 2020 2:49 PM
To: BENNY.CHONG@DAIMLER.COM
Subject: RE: YOUR REF: GBF9676K (OUR REF: CC6/AIG20005158/Aga3) *** ACCIDENT 

INVOLVING GBF 9676K & SJZ 8518R ON 09/04/2020 ***

Our Ref: CC6/AIG20005472/ga3 
 
14 MAY 2020 
 
DAIMLER FLEET MANAGEMENT SINGAPORE PTE. LTD. 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 9676K & SJZ 8518R ON 09/04/2020 

We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster Company by your Motor Insurer (AIG 
Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.) to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance 
policy taken up with them. 
 
This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from SJZ 8518R. 
                 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate 
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 
within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles) 
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed 
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
 
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 
c.c   AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd       
           (Motor Claims Dept) 
 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 



2

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 



Print Received Message

This mail is associated with :

*SJZ8518R (3680132654SG)
[GBF9676K]

TP
REUS AUTO LEASING PTE LTD

Apr 9 2020 2:00PM
[DAIMLER FLEET MANAGEMENT SINGAPORE PTE. LTD.]

Sw Werkz Pte Ltd

From AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) (AIG_SG_EXPRESS), sent on 20/08/2020 09:47 AM. 
To   LKK_HQ 
Subject   Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$3367.45) - SJZ8518R - Claim Handler: MdNoor, Norsiah 

Approved:3367.45:COR $3000.00 LOU $ 240.00 (4Dx$60) - Recommended 2 days + 1day Sunday + 1 day 
PRI LTA $7.45 Towing $120.00 Total: $3367.45 
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