Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 5 December 2020 2:46 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGV4205B // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG18005807/R1pa3s2-1 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG) AND SGV 4205B ON 24/03/2018]

Attachments: SMOOTH DR.jpg; SMOOTH DR .jpg

Hi, Hsiao Tong
As attach ACRA.

Thank you
regards

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, November 27, 2020 2:42 PM

To: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SGV4205B // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG18005807/R1pa3s2-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG)
AND SGV 4205B ON 24/03/2018]

Without Prejudice
Hi,

If your client is not willing to pay for the ACRA payment, pls advise if there is any document to show that the driver
is the owner of vehicle? Or is there any company chop from your client?

Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 27 November 2020 2:36 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGV4205B // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG18005807/R1pa3s2-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG)
AND SGV 4205B ON 24/03/2018]




Hi Ms. Chew
Client’s question who is paying for ACRA print out?

Thank you.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, November 27, 2020 1:46 PM

To: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SGV4205B // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG18005807/R1pa3s2-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG)
AND SGV 4205B ON 24/03/2018]

Without Prejudice
Hi Mr Tan,

Please be informed that your client vehicle is registered under a company, company chop is required in Letter of
Authority. However, you informed us that your client does not have a company chop as he is a sole proprietor.
Therefore, we would require a copy of ACRA letter/ any supporting documents to show the driver is the owner of
the vehicle.

Thank you for your kind understanding.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 23 November 2020 4:20 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGV4205B // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG18005807/R1pa3s2-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG)
AND SGV 4205B ON 24/03/2018]

Hi Ms. Chew
Client is asking at whose cost it will be for the latest ACRA purchase, and for what purpose is ACRA for?
Thank you

Regards
Tan



From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, November 23, 2020 12:26 PM

To: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SGV4205B // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG18005807/R1pa3s2-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG)
AND SGV 4205B ON 24/03/2018]

REMINDER

Without Prejudice

Hi,

We refer to our below email.

Kindly provide ACRA letter for our action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 November 2020 5:56 PM

To: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Your Ref: SGV4205B // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG18005807/R1pa3s2-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG)
AND SGV 4205B ON 24/03/2018]

Without Prejudice
Hi,
We refer to our below email.

Kindly provide ACRA letter for our action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

*Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 July 2020 9:11 AM

To: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGV4205B // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG18005807/R1pa3s2-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG)
AND SGV 4205B ON 24/03/2018]

Without Prejudice
Hi,
Kindly provide ACRA letter for our action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 13 July 2020 3:33 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGV4205B // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG18005807/R1pa3s2-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG)
AND SGV 4205B ON 24/03/2018]

Hi Ms. Chew
Letter of Authority was given earlier to your good self.
Client do not have a company chop is a sole proprietor. His accident statement also does not have a company chop.

Please revert



Thank you

Regards
Kevin

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, July 13, 2020 9:18 AM

To: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGV4205B // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG18005807/R1pa3s2-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG)
AND SGV 4205B ON 24/03/2018]

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
Thank you for your acceptance.

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return together with the following document to us (LKK) for our necessary
action: -

1. Authorisation to Act signed by your client with company stamp/chop.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Xinya Auto Services <xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 9 July 2020 11:12 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGV4205B // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG18005807/R1pa3s2-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG)
AND SGV 4205B ON 24/03/2018]

Hi Ms. Hsiao Tong

Pls proceed to close at $5,830.00 all in.



Thank you
Kevin

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@I|kkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, July 8, 2020 9:43 AM

To: xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Your Ref: SGV4205B // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG18005807/R1pa3s2-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG)
AND SGV 4205B ON 24/03/2018]

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to our below email.
Please confirm acceptance.

Meantime, kindly provide after repair for SGV4205B. Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, 25 April 2020 12:44 PM

To: xinyaauto@singnet.com.sg

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: Your Ref: SGV4205B // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG18005807/R1pa3s2-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG) AND
SGV 4205B ON 24/03/2018]

Your Ref: SGV4205B Without Prejudice
LKK Ref: CC4/AIG18005807/R1pa3s2-1

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING EY 1292B(AIG) AND SGYV 4205B ON 24/03/2018



We refer to the above matter.
We propose settlement at a global sum of $5,830.00(all-in).
Please confirm acceptance.

Meantime, kindly provide after repair for SGV4205B. Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256 3561 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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