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wc &fer to rhe above accidol wh.re w rre eling for AIC Asia Pacilic Insuance Ple
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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Lim, Sheng Yang <ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>
Sent: 28 July 2020 11:33 AM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: Re - open claim - AIG REF:  TP / 2134505039SG  / INSURED SJZ 2709X ON 

23.04.2015 / TRANS-CAB SHC 5995K

Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Khanchna, 
 
Had reviewed both OI & TP GIA report along with the witness statement.  
 
Due to conflicting statement and accident happened when both parties turning to the same direction, proposed to 
settle under 50/50. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Lim Sheng Yang 
AIG 
Senior Claim Adjuster II 
Auto Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 
Tel 8001206556 | Ext: 1012101 
ShengYang.Lim@aig.com | www.AIG.com  
 
 

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 27 July, 2020 3:09 PM 
To: Lim, Sheng Yang <ShengYang.Lim@aig.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re - open claim - AIG REF: TP / 2134505039SG / INSURED SJZ 2709X ON 23.04.2015 / TRANS-CAB 
SHC 5995K 
 
This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Please be informed that this matter was temporarily closed due to no letter of demand 
from third party. 
 
Based on our records, we were instructed by AIG (Fiza @ Nor Hafizah) to not contact Insured as  AIG will contact 
Insured directly. 
 
Kindly let us have your approval on whether we could proceed to direct settlement as we have received a copy of 
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LOD from third party. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Tuesday, 14 July 2020 5:21 PM 
To: NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com; Divyashni.Subramaniam@aig.com; Ericweihong.Teo@aig.com; 
Yinrul.Hor@aig.com 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR CURRENT AIG OFFICER PIC AND TO RE-OPEN CLAIM ON MERIMEN - AIG REF: TP / 
2134505039SG (OI : SJZ2709X ) 
 
Dear All, 
 
Please let us know the current AIG PIC officer for this claim.  

 
 
Kindly also assist to re-open claim on Merimen as we have received Third party LOD. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not 
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" 
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any 
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is 
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is 
accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or 
damage arising in any way from its use. 


