


Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63   
Tel No.: 6287 6666   Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

Our Ref : AAD1505-020

Your Ref : SKB3361Y

Date : 13.April 2020

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD5211J AND SKB3361Y ON 02/05/15 11:50 AM  ALONG 
ALONG SLIP RD FROM ANG MO KIO AVE 1 INTO CTE CITY

It appears that the above accident was caused by your insured's negligence.  We, therefore 
seeking compensation from you for our financial loss as itemized below :-

1.               Cost of Repair (inclusive of 7% GST) $ 1,658.50

2.               Loss of Rental for _____ days @ $_______ per day $ 192.60

3.               Loss of Income for ______ days @ $________ per day $ 100.00

4.               LTA Search Fee $ 6.00

5.               Survey Fee $ 0.00

Total $ 1,957.10

We enclose a copy of the following documents for your consideration :-

GIA report lodged by our driver Rental rate and mileage records
Certificate of Insurance Authorization To Act
Original final repair bill LTA Search Fee

Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 14 days, failing which we shall 
proceed to hand over the conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further 
reference to you.

Yours Faithfully
Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

Jasmine Tan
General Manager
Tel No. : 6603 1250 (DID)
Note : Please email any further correspondence to claims@transcab.com.sg (6603 1259)
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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Lim, Sheng Yang <ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 15 April, 2020 10:22 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts

Subject: RE: 0685481055SG   - RECEIVED LOD - LKK REF CC3/AIG15007628/Kha3q2-1

Hi Vic, 

 

Claim reopened in Merimen and we agreed to settled at 50/50 for this TP claim. 

 

Thank you. 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Lim Sheng Yang 
AIG 
Senior Claim Adjuster II 
Auto Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 
Tel 8001206556 | Ext: 1012101 

ShengYang.Lim@aig.com | www.AIG.com  

 

From: Tan, Bennie-WZ <Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com>  

Sent: Monday, 13 April, 2020 11:57 AM 

To: Kaur, Baljit <Baljit.Kaur@aig.com>; AIGSS (M) - Claims SG Auto Express <AIGSSM-

ClaimsSGAutoExpress@aig.com> 

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: 0685481055SG - RECEIVED LOD - LKK REF CC3/AIG15007628/Kha3q2-1 

 

Hi Baljit and Team 

 

 

Date of Accident for this case: 02/05/2015. 

 

Vic’s email below refers. Kindly assist to reassign and handle.  

 

Thank you. 

 

 

Best Regards 

 
Bennie Tan 
AIG 
Senior Complex Claims Examiner 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd  
 
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1718 

 

Bennie-WZ.Tan@aig.com | www.aig.sg 

 

Advanced Leave Notification: 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, April 13, 2020 9:34 AM 
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To: Tan, Bennie-WZ 

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: 0685481055SG - RECEIVED LOD - LKK REF CC3/AIG15007628/Kha3q2-1 

 

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Dear Bennie, 

 

We refer further to the below email. 

 

The TP video footage was uploaded in merimen. Based on the footage, it seems both vehicles were moving 

changing/moving towards the same lane. 

 

If agreeable, we will propose for a 50/0 settlement to the TP repairer. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 

claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 

 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 13 April, 2020 9:07 AM 

To: Tan, Bennie-WZ 

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: 0685481055SG - RECEIVED LOD 

 

Dear Bennie,  

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

The matter was temporarily closed previously due to TP inactivity. 

 

Please be informed that survey report has been uploaded in Merimen and TP had provided to us their LOD and 

proposed for a direct settlement. 

 

If agreeable for us to handle the DS, kindly assist to reopen/sendback report in Merimen for our further action. 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 
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Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

IMPORTANT NOTICE:  

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, 

you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please 

immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or 

printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other 

defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of 

the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International 

Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any 

way from its use. 
















