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Re: FINALISE SMN9945L - BEFORE PAINT & ITEMS // LKK Ref:
CC4/FCI20005124/R1pa3

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Thu 17/6/2021 12:00 PM
To:  sharon@sngahtee.com <sharon@sngahtee.com>

1 attachments (338 KB)
DV_SMN9945L.pdf;

Without Prejudice

Dear Sharon,

We refer to your below email.

We confirm settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 1,563.06
2. Loss of Use (3days x $60.00) $    180.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $        7.45
4. Medical Fee (Driver - Chen WeiRong) $      48.00
5. Medical Fee (Passenger – Chai Jia Ling) $      51.00

Total $ 1,849.51

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return together with your client's authorisation to act to us(LKK)
for our necessary action. 


For your info, MS FCI need original DV to process payment.


“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: sharon@sngahtee.com <sharon@sngahtee.com>
Sent: Monday, 14 June 2021 1:58 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINALISE SMN9945L - BEFORE PAINT & ITEMS // LKK Ref: CC4/FCI20005124/R1pa3
 
Hi Hsiao Tong
 

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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Counter propose LOU $60x3days.
Please confirm.
 
 
 
Best Regards
____________________________________________

Sharon Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD  | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457

TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

 
 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, June 14, 2021 1:13 PM

To: sharon@sngahtee.com

Subject: RE: FINALISE SMN9945L - BEFORE PAINT & ITEMS // LKK Ref: CC4/FCI20005124/R1pa3
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sharon,
We refer to the above matter.
We propose settlement as follows: -
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 1,563.06
2. Loss of Use (3days x $50.00) $    150.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $        7.45
4. Medical Fee (Driver - Chen WeiRong) $      48.00
5. Medical Fee (Passenger – Chai Jia
Ling)

$      51.00

Total $ 1,819.51
Please confirm acceptance.
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 

http://www.sngahtee.com/
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From: sharon@sngahtee.com <sharon@sngahtee.com> 

Sent: Friday, 14 May 2021 5:36 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINALISE SMN9945L - BEFORE PAINT & ITEMS // LKK Ref: CC4/FCI20005124/R1pa3
 
Hi Hsiao Tong
 
Please refer to attachment.
Thanks.
 
 
 
Best Regards
____________________________________________

Sharon Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD  | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457

TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

 
 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, May 14, 2021 4:28 PM

To: sharon@sngahtee.com

Subject: Re: FINALISE SMN9945L - BEFORE PAINT & ITEMS // LKK Ref: CC4/FCI20005124/R1pa3
 
Without Prejudice
 
Hi Sharon,
 
Kindly provide a clearer copy of your client medical bill, unable to see the medical fee amount on last page.
 
Thanks.
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the
sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of
liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: sharon@sngahtee.com <sharon@sngahtee.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 7 April 2021 10:31 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
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Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINALISE SMN9945L - BEFORE PAINT & ITEMS // LKK Ref: CC4/FCI20005124/R1pa3
 
Hi Hsiao Tong
 
Enclosed is our LOD & relevant documents.
Please let us have your reply.
Thank you.
 
 
 
 
Best Regards
____________________________________________

Sharon Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD  | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457

TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

 
 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Tuesday, April 6, 2021 9:35 AM

To: sharon@sngahtee.com

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINALISE SMN9945L - BEFORE PAINT & ITEMS // LKK Ref: CC4/FCI20005124/R1pa3
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
Further to our below email.
 
Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental
receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action.
 
Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
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HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Monday, 5 April 2021 10:06 AM

To: sharon@sngahtee.com

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINALISE SMN9945L - BEFORE PAINT & ITEMS
 
Hi Sharon,
 
Finalised amount of $ 1,460.80 / 3 days of part by part repair is confirmed
 
 
 

 

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Saturday, 3 April, 2021 12:37 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: FINALISE SMN9945L - BEFORE PAINT & ITEMS
 
Hi Rasul,
 
Kindly assist to finalise. Thanks.
 
CC4/FCI20005124/R1pa3
 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, 22 January 2021 6:26 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: FINALISE SMN9945L - BEFORE PAINT & ITEMS
 
 

From: sharon@sngahtee.com

Sent: Friday, 22 January 2021 6:27:51 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
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To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); SUR

Subject: FINALISE SMN9945L - BEFORE PAINT & ITEMS

 
Hi Taufikh
 
Please check & confirm.
Thanks.
 
Best Regards
____________________________________________

Sharon Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD  | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457

TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

 
 

http://www.sngahtee.com/

