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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd <sinyewhup@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 6 August 2020 12:18 PM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Re: FW: FW: SLS4451M

Dear Jasper, 
 
We confirmed that the DV and ATA is signed by the owner Wong Sung Toon. 
 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Josephine Teo 
 
 
SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD 
T : +65 67600819 
F : +65 67690221 
 
 

To help protect your privacy, 
Micro so ft Office prevented  
auto matic downlo ad o f this  
picture from the Internet.

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

 
On Thu, Aug 6, 2020 at 12:00 PM Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Josephine , 

  

As spoken , owner ‘s signature is missing from the GIA report as attached. 

  

Kindy confirm again with us whether DV and ATA is signed by the owner “WONG SUNG TOON” 

  

Thanks   

  

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd <sinyewhup@gmail.com>  
Sent: Monday, 3 August 2020 10:05 AM 
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: FW: FW: SLS4451M 

  

Dear Jasper, 

  

We attached a copy of the duly signed Discharge Voucher for your perusal. 

  

As for the original copy DV, we will send to you by post.  Thank you. 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Josephine Teo 

  

  

SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD 

T : +65 67600819 

F : +65 67690221 

  

  

To help protect your privacy, 
Micro so ft Office prevented  
auto matic downlo ad o f this  
picture from the Internet.

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

  

On Thu, Jul 30, 2020 at 2:34 PM Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd <sinyewhup@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Jasper, 

  



3

We confirmed the settlement amount of $2,011.83.  Thank you. 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Josephine Teo 

  

  

SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD 

T : +65 67600819 

F : +65 67690221 

  

  

To help protect your privacy, 
Micro so ft Office prevented  
auto matic downlo ad o f this  
picture from the Internet.

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

  

On Thu, Jul 30, 2020 at 2:28 PM Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

  

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

  

As spoken over the phone, we accept the counter offer of LOU at 6 days x $60.00, total settlement 
amount of $2,011.83. 

  

Kindly confirm acceptance by duly sign the DV enclosed and return document to us (LKK) for our 
necessary action. 

  

Thank you. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 


