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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd <sinyewhup@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 3 August 2020 10:05 AM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Re: FW: FW: SLS4451M
Attachments: 03082020101255.pdf

Dear Jasper, 
 
We attached a copy of the duly signed Discharge Voucher for your perusal. 
 
As for the original copy DV, we will send to you by post.  Thank you. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Josephine Teo 
 
 
SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD 
T : +65 67600819 
F : +65 67690221 
 
 

To help protect your privacy, 
Micro so ft Office prevented  
auto matic downlo ad o f this  
picture from the Internet.

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

 
On Thu, Jul 30, 2020 at 2:34 PM Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd <sinyewhup@gmail.com> wrote: 
Dear Jasper, 
 
We confirmed the settlement amount of $2,011.83.  Thank you. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Josephine Teo 
 
 
SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD 
T : +65 67600819 
F : +65 67690221 
 
 

To help protect your privacy, 
Micro so ft Office prevented  
auto matic downlo ad o f this  
picture from the Internet.

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

 
On Thu, Jul 30, 2020 at 2:28 PM Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

  



2

Dear Sir/Mdm, 

  

As spoken over the phone, we accept the counter offer of LOU at 6 days x $60.00, total settlement amount 
of $2,011.83. 

  

Kindly confirm acceptance by duly sign the DV enclosed and return document to us (LKK) for our 
necessary action. 

  

Thank you. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Thursday, 30 July 2020 12:06 PM 
To: Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd <sinyewhup@gmail.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: FW: FW: SLS4451M 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

  

Dear Sir/Mdm, 
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As spoken, we withdraw the offer as global sum. 

  

New offer with breakdown as below :  

  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 1,644.38 
2. Loss of Use (3 days x $50.00) $    150.00 
3. LTA Search Fee $        7.45 

Total $ 1,801.83 

  

Kindly confirm acceptance. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Wednesday, 29 July 2020 4:34 PM 
To: Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd <sinyewhup@gmail.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: FW: FW: SLS4451M 

  

Without Prejudice 
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Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

Thank you for your email. 

  

We propose a settlement at a global sum of $1,800.00(all-in). 

  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

Best Regards, 

Jasper Chua| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd <sinyewhup@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 22 July 2020 9:53 AM 
To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: FW: FW: SLS4451M 

  

Dear Sun Pin, 

  

As spoken yesterday, kindly help us to check the offer for our claim for vehicle SLS4451M. 
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Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Josephine Teo 

  

  

SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD 

T : +65 67600819 

F : +65 67690221 

  

  

To help protect your privacy, 
Micro so ft Office prevented  
auto matic downlo ad o f this  
picture from the Internet.

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

  

On Mon, Jul 6, 2020 at 5:24 PM Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

  

  

From: Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd [mailto:sinyewhup@gmail.com]  
Sent: Monday, July 6, 2020 5:21 PM 
To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: FW: SLS4451M 

  

Dear Sun Pin, 

  

We attached a copy of the Letter of Demand and necessary documents for our claimant SLS4551M and your 
insured SHA5170J for the accident at/along Toh Guan Road on 04/04/2020. 

  

As for the original documents, we will send them by Post to Ms First Capital. 

  

Kindly let us have the settlement as soon as possible.  Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Josephine Teo 

  

  

SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD 

T : +65 67600819 

F : +65 67690221 

  

  

To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office 
prevented au tomatic download  of this picture  
from the Internet.
https://ipmcdn.avast.com/images/icons/icon-
envelope-tick-green-avg-v1.png

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

  

On Mon, Jul 6, 2020 at 12:49 PM Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd <sinyewhup@gmail.com> wrote: 

Dear Sun Pin 

  

Confirm amount $1,536.80, 3 days (Before GST) 

Thank you. 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Josephine Teo 

  

  

SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD 

T : +65 67600819 

F : +65 67690221 
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To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office 
prevented au tomatic download  of this picture  
from the Internet.
https://ipmcdn.avast.com/images/icons/icon-
envelope-tick-green-avg-v1.png

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

  

On Fri, Jul 3, 2020 at 10:42 AM Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Edwin, 

  

Kindly refer the finalize amount $1,536.8. Repair day 3 days. (P/P, before gst). 

  

Please confirm the amount by reply email. 

  

  

Thank you. 

  

Best Regards, 

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor 

  

LKK Auto Consultants 

  

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email:  Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

From: Sin Yew Hup Auto Pte Ltd [mailto:sinyewhup@gmail.com]  
Sent: Monday, June 22, 2020 10:23 AM 
To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: SLS4451M 
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Hi SunPin, 

  

Attached pls find the finalised report and necessary photos. 

  

Kindly go through and finalise. 

 
 

Best Regards, 

  

Edwin Yap 

  

SIN YEW HUP AUTO PTE LTD 

T : +65 67600819 

F : +65 67690221 

  

To help protect you r priv acy, Microsoft Office 
prevented au tomatic download  of this picture  
from the Internet.
https://ipmcdn.avast.com/images/icons/icon-
envelope-tick-green-avg-v1.png

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

  


