Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 April 2020 8:35 AM

To: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE; assignments; Admin A

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: Re: New Assignment PRS - Accident involving FBP4375) & GW8893H on

31/03/2020 - Oref: 19/20/20/VC05/023276 [External Confidential]

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue
1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: KENNY LIM CHING GHEE <kennylim@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 7 April 2020 5:47 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: New Assignment PRS - Accident involving FBP4375J) & GW8893H on 31/03/2020 - Oref:
19/20/20/VC05/023276 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential

Dear all

Please arrange for a PRS for t/p motorcycle FBP4375] at Ban Hock Hin Co.
Kindly assess liability and propose direct settlement if viable.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Kenny Lim

Asst. Claims Manager | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
DID: 6279 9256 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all (8885 lonpac.com.sg

_? Exp: Now

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: hasrianah@bhh.com.sg <hasrianah@bhh.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 7 April 2020 5:12 pm
To: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>




Cc: 'Raymond' <raymond@bhh.com.sg>
Subject: Accident involving FBP4375) & GW8893H on 31/03/2020

Dear Sir / Madam
We attached the third party claim documents for your perusal.

Appreciate for you to arrange for the pre-repair survey.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hasrianah

Insurance Department
Ban Hock Hin Co., Pte Ltd

Tel: (65) 6281 6520 x 222 | Fax:(65) 6281 2830
Visit us at http://www.bhh.com.sg

Facebook: http://www.facebook.com/bhhsg
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