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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>
Sent: 18 September 2020 2:33 PM
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Cc: CS A Team; Admin A
Subject: Re: EQ INSURED: GBB8123S    OUR REF: SLN4026J     D.O.A: 30.03.2020
Attachments: img-918142152.pdf

Dear Khanchna 
 
Kindly refer to the ATA attached for payment. 
 
Thank You. 
  
 
Regards, 
Jing Yee 
Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop 
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 Blk C 
#01-34/#01-61 
Singapore 417883 
Tel : 6746 5519        Fax : 6743 4896 
 

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Thursday, September 17, 2020 2:28 PM 
To: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: EQ INSURED: GBB8123S OUR REF: SLN4026J D.O.A: 30.03.2020  
  
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear  Jing Yee, 
  
We propose settlement on a global sum for $5,100.00(all in). 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
  
Kindly also send us the Authorisation to Act. 
  
Thank you. 
  
"Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the 
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this 
negotiation of terms/settlement. 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of 
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  

From: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>  
Sent: 17 September 2020 12:29 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: EQ INSURED: GBB8123S OUR REF: SLN4026J D.O.A: 30.03.2020 
Importance: High 
  
Dear Khanchna 
  
We refer to our email dated 18/06/2020. 
We had yet to get your reply. 
Kindly let us have your offer soonest. 
  
Thank You. 
  
  
Regards, 
Jing Yee 
Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop 
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 Blk C 
#01-34/#01-61 
Singapore 417883 
Tel : 6746 5519        Fax : 6743 4896 
  

From: Hua Meng 
Sent: Thursday, June 18, 2020 3:44 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: lkk claims <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: EQ INSURED: GBB8123S OUR REF: SLN4026J D.O.A: 30.03.2020  
  
Dear Sir/Madam 
  
We refer above mentioned accident. 
We would like to inform that we have finalized with your surveyor. 
Kindly refer to the attachment for your necessary action. 
Pls let us have your offer soonest. 
  
Thank You. 
  
  
Regards, 
Jing Yee 
Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop 
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 Blk C 
#01-34/#01-61 
Singapore 417883 
Tel : 6746 5519        Fax : 6743 4896 
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