04/04/2020 Invoice

~~

‘ GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

| 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm

GST Registration No: M400017735
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE D

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-20-054370
Date of Request: 04/04/2020 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enquiry Date 04/04/2020

“nquiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan
-~ Vehicle No. WC7550U

Accident Date 03/04/2020

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
WC7550U AXA Insurance Pte Ltd 01/11/2019-31/10/2020 6880 4888
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance Association of
Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of

or in connection with the reports or their images.

( isis a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninvtp&refid=2487401&CFID=69657046&CFTOKEN=a06... 1/2



04/04/2020 Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

ASSOCIATION Operating_ Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-20-054370

Date of Request: 04/04/2020 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883
Dear Sir/Madam,
Enquiry Date 04/04/2020
~=nquiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan
( . Vehicle No. WC7550U
Accident Date 03/04/2020
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S$)
TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 013
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Cheque

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid=2487401&CFID=696570468&CFTOKEN=a06... 2/2



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, July 22, 2020 10:08 AM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: New message for service request 167252, vehicle number SKH5885H

19/7/20 9:59 PM *** P|s proceed DS with quantum as proposed - MessagelLOR is subject to rental receipt & rental

agreement. - WANG Peter

From: peter.wang@axa.com.sg <peter.wang@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Sunday, 19 July 2020 10:00 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: New message for service request 167252, vehicle number SKH5885H

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number SOM0O2KWH.
Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided for in a written
agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.



Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, May 4, 2020 12:58 PM

To: WILLIAMQUEK@GW-GROUP.COM

Cc: Admin A

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING WC 7550U AND SKH5885H ALONG/AT HOLLAND ROAD ON
03/04/2020

G & W READY-MIX PTE LTD
[POLICY HOLDER]

Dear Sir/ Mdm

OUR REF : CC4/ASM20004942/Uka3
YOURREF : WC7550U
ACCIDENT INVOLVING WC 7550U AND SKH5885H ALONG/AT HOLLAND ROAD ON 03/04/2020

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor insurer,
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from M/S FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD acting on behalf of the owner of SKH5885H against your
motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, it was reported that your vehicle had collided to the Third party vehicle
SKH5885H. As such, liability is down against us.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the claim against your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according to the rights afforded under the
policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from
this incident, at your own cost and defence, please reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter. Your intent must
be formally expressed to us and acknowledged by us.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the following to khanchna@]lkkauto.com
within 10 days from the date of this letter_if not provided at our reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and
further document may be required:

Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence and status (if any)

Driver’s driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

Company Letter of Authorisation

Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)

Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third Party(s), you are to keep us informed
of your legal representative(s) and the status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with any of the Third Party(s) and/or
their legal representatives, or make any compromise or settlement without AXA’s prior knowledge and consent.
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This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any claim because of any breach of policy
terms and conditions you and/or your authorised driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep you informed of the final indemnity
upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6841 2360 or email us at khanchna@lkkauto.com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@Ikkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




