Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 April 2020 5:46 PM

To: ‘Justin Wong'; assignments

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: TPPD Survey: Claim ref:C10004081/KY || Ol- SKD6362P (Black) TP-SLP5232M ||

Est:0.00 || Team AutoPro

Dear Justin,

Received with thanks.

G.NIVITHA
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Justin Wong <justin.wong @budgetdirect.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 2 April 2020 5:39 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TPPD Survey: Claim ref:C10004081/KY Il OI- SKD6362P (Black) TP-SLP5232M Il Est:0.00 I
Team AutoPro

Hi Team,
Please find part 2 of the documents.
Regards,

Justin Wong
Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2184
F +65 6725 0853
E Justin.wong@budgetdirect.com.sg
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Singapore
239924
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auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct
Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

From: Justin Wong

Sent: Thursday, 2 April 2020 5:32 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Cec: SUR <sur@]lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: TPPD Survey: Claim ref:C10004081/KY Il OI- SKD6362P (Black) TP-SLP5232M Il Est:0.00 I
Team AutoPro

Hi Team,

Please arrange to conduct paper-resurvey for third-party vehicle no: SKD6362P
Kindly find part 1 of the documents attached.

Regards,

Justin Wong
Executive, Claims

T +65 6540 2184
F +65 6725 0853
E Justin.wong@budgetdirect.com.sg
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auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct
Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 September 2019 1:00 PM

To: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Justin Wong <justin.wong @budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: RE: TPPD Survey: Claim ref:C10004081/KY Il OI- SKD6362P (Black) TP-SLP5232M |l Est:0.00 I
Team AutoPro

Dear lvy,
Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that repairer arrange the survey on 24/09/2019.

Best Regards

Celine Fong
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ivy Ratilla [mailto:ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 23 September 2019 11:42 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Cec: sur@lkkauto.com; Justin Wong <justin.wong @budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: TPPD Survey: Claim ref:C10004081/KY Il OI- SKD6362P (Black) TP-SLP5232M |l Est:0.00 Il Team
AutoPro

Hi team,

We would like to arrange TP PRS for SLP5232M.

Contact Person Eric Lee 8269 9999




Email Address teamautopl@gmail.com

Survey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Singapore 575722

Please confirm.

Regards,

Ivy Ratilla
Executive, Claims Admin

T +65 6540 2185
F +65 6725 0853
E ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg
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auto & general

Auto & General Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Limited (Co. Reg. No. 201626103G) trading as Budget Direct
Insurance.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email)
reflect the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is
confidential and subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee,
confidentiality and privilege have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this
email is unauthorised.

This email is sent by Auto & General (SEA) Services Pte. Limited or a related body corporate (Auto &
General) and is for the intended addressee. The views expressed in this email and attachments (email) reflect
the views of the stated author but may not reflect views of Auto & General. This email is confidential and
subject to copyright. It may be privileged. If you are not the intended addressee, confidentiality and privilege
have not been waived and any use, interference with, or disclosure of this email is unauthorised.

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl @ gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 23 September 2019 10:08 AM




To: Ivy Ratilla <ivy.r@budgetdirect.com.sg>

Cc: Claims <claims @budgetdirect.com.sg>; Justin Wong <justin.wong @budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: Re: 2 Days Notice: SLP 5232 M (Our Ref) and SKD 6362 P (Your Ref) Dated 21st September 2019
C10004081

Dear Sirs,

With reference to your list of surveyors, we are agreeable with the appointment of LKK Autoconsultants as
the SJE for subject claim.

Kindly note our personnel in charge for the survey as follows:-

Contact Person Eric Lee 8269 9999

Email Address teamautogl@gmail.com
Survey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Singapore 575722

Thank you for your kind attention to our request.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not
prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Cheers,

Peach

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd
Tel: 6258 1955

Fax: 6258 1956

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

From: TeamAutoPro North <teamautopl @ gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 21 September 2019 2:17 PM

To: Claims <claims @budgetdirect.com.sg>

Subject: 2 Days Notice: SLP 5232 M (Our Ref) and SKD 6362 P (Your Ref) Dated 21st September 2019

Dear Sir/Madam,

Road Traffic Accident Involving SLP 5232 M (Our Ref) and SKD 6362 P (Your Ref)
Dated 215 September 2019, Time around 20:35HRS

@ CTE TWDS SLE/TPE



We represent our client; Michelle Ong Chin Swan, to notify you of the aforesaid road traffic accident
involving our client‘s vehicle registration number: SLP 5232 M and your insured’s vehicle registration
number:SKD 6362 P .

Enclosed herewith a copy of our 2 Days Notice Letter and the relevant Singapore Accident Statement filed for your reference.

Please let us know within 2 working days from today, your list of at least ten (10) motor surveyors, via email to the following
personnel:-

Contact Person Eric Lee 8269 9999
Email Address teamautopl@gmail.com
Survey Address 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Thank you for your attention to this email and we look forward to your earliest reply.

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not
prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Cheers,

Peach

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd
Tel: 6258 1955

Fax: 6258 1956

(Newly Shifted) Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr, #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722
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