admin

From: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 1 April 2020 5:01 PM

To: Vision Autowork; 'admin-d@lkkauto.com’; ‘assignments@Ikkauto.com’;
sur@lkkauto.com

Cc: Gnoh, Pau Loong

Subject: CMTD2001360/GPL - LKK(NR)/ FBP4469Y & SLX4039U ACC ON 01.04.20

Attachments: 01042020145744.pdf

Our Reference: CMTD2001360/GPL
Your Reference: SLX4039U

Without Prejudice
Date: 01/04/2020 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg

Attention:
M/S VISION AUTOWORK PTE LTD

Dear Michelle,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBP4469Y & SLX4039U ON 01.04.2020
We refer to your email reply of today.

We will appoint LKK Auto to conduct the survey.

Hi LKK Auto,
Please make the arrangement to survey for SLX4039U on a without prejudice and any admission of liability basis.

Please be informed that Mr. Gnoh Pau Loong is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 217/
PauLoong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg .

Please revert your report upon completion of survey to my colleague, Mr. Pau Loong.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555



For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg
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From: Vision Autowork <visionautowork@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 1, 2020 4:57 PM

To: Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>

Cc: Gnoh, Pau Loong <PauLoong.Gnoh@sompo.com.sg>

Subject: Re: CMTD2001360/GPL - PRI(NR)/ FBP4469Y & SLX4039U ACC ON 01.04.20

Dear All,

Thanks for reply.
Please arrange LKK Auto Consultants to survey the above vehicle.

**Please advise liability **

Thank You
Yours faithfully,

Michelle
Hp: 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4,
#08-09,Premier @ Kaki Bukit,
Singapore 415875

Tel: 6341 6789

Fax: 63416778



On Wed, Apr 1, 2020 at 4:21 PM Teo, Grace <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg> wrote:

Our Reference: CMTD2001360/GPL

Your Reference: SLX4039U

Without Prejudice

Date: 01/04/2020 EMAIL ONLY

OUR Email: motorsurvey @sompo.com.sg

Attention:

M/S VISION AUTOWORK PTE LTD

Dear Michelle,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBP4469Y & SLX4039U ON 01.04.2020

We refer to your Notice of Accident dated 01/04/2020.

Please be informed that Mr. Gnoh Pau Loong is the handler of this case who can be contacted at 63295 217/
Paul.oong.Gnoh @sompo.com.sg .

Please be informed that we are unable to revert on liability for direct settlement as we have yet to receive our
insured’s accident report.



We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client’s/your customer’s vehicle jointly with
your client/your motor workshop. We propose to use one of the motor surveyors named in the attached list to
conduct the joint pre-repair survey as a single joint expert.

Pre-Repair Survey

Motor Surveyor

1 Raleigh Services

Surveyor
Andrew Ow Yong

Selection (Indicate as
tick)

Vincent Ng

2 LKK Auto Consultants

Kenneth Kong (North
area)

Marcus Chua (East area)

Mohd Rasul (West area)

Mohd Taufikh (West area)

3 Priority Services

Jimmy Lee

Lawrence Ng

Jeffrey Ong

Please let us know within two (2) working days whether you agree to the appointment of any of these motor
surveyors as a single joint expert. You may select up to two of the listed motor surveyors. We will bear the
cost of the pre-repair survey carried out by the single joint expert.

Best Regards
Grace Teo
Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555

For motor claims survey request, please email to motorsurvey@sompo.com.sg
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From: Vision Autowork <visionautowork@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, April 1, 2020 3:00 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey <MotorSurvey@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: SLX4039U (Pre-inspection) / Your vehicle : FBP4469Y

Dear person in charge,

Please refer to attach file and arrange for pre-inspection.

Hope we can do Direct Settle and please provide the surveyor firm or surveyor name list to conduct the joint pre-repair survey
as a single joint expert



** PLEASE ADVISE LIABILITY**

Thank You

Yours faithfully,

Michelle

Hp: 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4,
#08-09,Premier @ Kaki Bukit,
Singapore 415875

Tel: 6341 6789

Fax: 6341 6778



