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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 14 April 2020 11:00 AM

To: Sam Ng

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: SJN 7560 - Finalize

Dear Sam, 

 

The LOD sent to Insurance. 

 

 

 

 

 

Thanks 

 

Best Regards, 

Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor 
 

LKK Auto Consultants 
 

Phone: 6256 3561| Email:  SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Sam Ng [mailto:samuel.auburnauto@gmail.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, April 14, 2020 10:46 AM 
To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) 

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) 

Subject: Re: SJN 7560 - Finalize 

 
hi steve, 
 
accepted , kindly revert to the relevant personal. 
 
 
 
with regards 
Sam 
Auburn Auto Pte Ltd 
+65 9787 5558 
 
On Thu, 9 Apr 2020 at 11:46, Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Sam, 

  

Kindly refer our finalize $750 (L/S, before GST). 2 repair days. 
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Please confirm. 

  

  

Parts -   $644.50 

                -25% 

                $483.37 

  

Nett -     $30 

  

Labour - $430 

  

Total -  $943.37 

  

Lumpsum - $754.69 

                    = $750 

  

  

  

Thanks. 

  

Best Regards, 

Steve Chen| Assistant Automotive Assessor 

  

LKK Auto Consultants 

  

Phone: 6256 3561| Email:  SteveChen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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