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Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 19 May 2020 11:28 am

To: Kelvin.chew@alpinemotors.sg

Cc: suhaimi@firstautoworks.com.sg; SUR

Subject: RE: SFB 3344 G CHEVROLET ORLANDO LONPAC OD DOA 27.03.2020

Dear Kelvin, 

 

Finalize amount confirmed. 

 

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission 

of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

From: Kelvin Chew <Kelvin.chew@alpinemotors.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, 14 May 2020 12:08 pm 

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: suhaimi@firstautoworks.com.sg 

Subject: SFB 3344 G CHEVROLET ORLANDO LONPAC OD DOA 27.03.2020 

 
  
Hi All, 
  
attach is finalise report. 
part by part $9684.80 before excess $500.00 & 4 working days. 
vehicle survey by Mr. Steve on 02/04/2020. 
please check & confirm with me. 
thanks. 
  
  
from, 
kelvin chew 
8292 5595 
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The information contained in this message is intended only for the recipient, and may be a confidential attorney-client communication or may otherwise be 
privileged and confidential and protected from disclosure. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, or an employee or agent responsible for 
delivering this message to the intended recipient, please be aware that any dissemination or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have 
received this communication in error, please immediately notify us by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer. 

 


