Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: My Car Consultant <admin@mycar.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 16 April 2020 11:26 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: TG Lim (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: SKQ3337P

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Shiau Chan,
Yes. Please advice whether LOD to you or insurance

Best Regards,

Huiqin

Claims | My Car Consultant Pte Ltd
+65 88668832

Admin @mycar.sg

Mycar.sg

53 Ubi Ave 1, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, 01-33, S408934

This Email, including attached files, may contain confidential information and is intended only for the use of the individual and/or entity
to which it is addressed. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender of the error and delete the message.
Thank you.

From: "Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)" <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: 4/16/20 11:23 AM

To: "admin@mycar.sg" <admin@mycar.sg>

Cc: "TG Lim (LKK Auto)" <TeowGuan@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SKQ3337P

Dear Hui Qin,

Which mean you are agree the amount as we offer as Lump Sum $1,400 and 4 repair days of SKQ 3337P?

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thanks & Regards,



Shiau Chan (Ms)

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: My Car Consultant [mailto:admin@mycar.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 16 April 2020 10:48 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SKQ3337P

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Shiau Chan,

Please close at the same.

Best Regards,

Huiqin

Claims | My Car Consultant Pte Ltd

+65 88668832

Admin @mycar.sg

Mycar.sg

53 Ubi Ave 1, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, 01-33, S408934

This Email, including attached files, may contain confidential information and is intended only for the use of the individual and/or entity
to which it is addressed. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender of the error and delete the message.
Thank you.



From: "Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)" <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: 4/15/20 1:09 PM

To: "admin@mycar.sq" <admin@mycar.sg>

Cc: "TG Lim (LKK Auto)" <TeowGuan@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SKQ3337P

Dear Hui Qin,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Offer Lump Sum $1,400.00 and 4 repair days.

Kindly check and confirm.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Thanks & Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms)

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: My Car Consultant [mailto:admin@mycar.sg]
Sent: Monday, 13 April 2020 5:11 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SKQ3337P

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Shiau Chan,
Quantum for SLM816C is not agreeable. Might revert to lawyer to handle the case.

Please do update on finalised amount for SKQ3337P asap.



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Huiqin

Claims | My Car Consultant Pte Ltd

+65 88668832

Admin @mycar.sg

Mycar.sg

53 Ubi Ave 1, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, 01-33, S408934

This Email, including attached files, may contain confidential information and is intended only for the use of the individual and/or entity
to which it is addressed. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender of the error and delete the message.
Thank you.

From: "Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)" <siewsc@lkkauto.com>
Sent: 4/8/20 4:28 PM

To: "admin@mycar.sg" <admin@mycar.sg>

Subject: RE: SKQ3337P

Dear Hui Qin,

| will check on the matter of SKQ 3337P.

How about the finalise of SLM 816C, can confirm?

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.



Thanks & Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms)

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

From: My Car Consultant [mailto:admin@mycar.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 8 April 2020 4:20 PM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: SKQ3337P

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Shiau Chan,

Mr Lim mentioned for the above stated vehicle that the case has been passed to you. If possible, pls revert the
finalised amount.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Huiqin

Claims | My Car Consultant Pte Ltd

+65 88668832

Admin @mycar.sg

Mycar.sg

53 Ubi Ave 1, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, 01-33, S408934

This Email, including attached files, may contain confidential information and is intended only for the use of the individual and/or entity
to which it is addressed. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender of the error and delete the message.
Thank you.



