Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: sm automotive <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 April 2020 3:36 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SNM20D201523 - CTPI - OD CLAIM - SJN4210S DOA:27.03.2020
Attachments: SIJN4210S INVOICE.pdf; SIN4210S DV.pdf

Without Prejudice
Hi Veron
Enclosed invoice and DV for your reference,thanks.

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, April 27, 2020 8:43 AM

To: sm_automotive@hotmail.com <sm_automotive@hotmail.com>
Subject: RE: SNM20D201523 - CTPI - OD CLAIM - SJN4210S DOA:27.03.2020

Dear Sukyi,

Kindly amend invoice , there is an excess of $1000.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 25 April 2020 1:34 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SNM20D201523 - CTPI - OD CLAIM - SJN4210S DOA:27.03.2020

CS/CTI20004716/Avf3s2




From: sm automotive [mailto:sm automotive@hotmail.com]

Sent: Friday, 24 April 2020 2:36 PM

To: Admin A

Subject: SNM20D201523 - CTPI - OD CLAIM - SJN4210S DOA:27.03.2020

Without Prejudice
Hi All

Enclosed Invoice & discharge voucher for your reference,thanks.

Regards,

Sukyi Chong
SM AUTOMOTIVE

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6

Blk C #01-43

Singapore 417883

Tel: 6747 9241 Fax: 67417276



