Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent; Saturday, 11 April 2020 2:24 PM

To: '‘Motor Claims'; SUR

Subject: RE: Our ref:CLMOMVC000003741, SURVEY INVITATION for accident on 22/10/2019
at CTE towards PIE Changi (Aft exit 11) involving vehicles GBH708B & GBD6463M
(urgent)

Attachments: GBH708B DOA 22102019.pdf

Dear Sir/ Mdm

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GBH708B
Date of survey : 03/04/2020
Number of days : 3 days

Best Regards,

Yvonne Wong (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Motor Claims <motorclaims@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 31 March 2020 10:43 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our ref:CLMOMVC000003741, SURVEY INVITATION for accident on 22/10/2019 at CTE towards PIE
Changi (Aft exit 11) involving vehicles GBH708B & GBD6463M (urgent)

Hi LKK
Video to verify damages consistency.

Regards
Sharon
Great American

From: Motor Claims

Sent: 30 March 2020 5:16 PM

To: Jessie Ong' <jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; 'Nivitha (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>;
'sur@lkkauto.com' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Ng, Sharon <sharon.ng@sg.gaig.com>; rizan@panpacificleasing.com.sg

Subject: RE: Our ref:CLMOMVC000003741, SURVEY INVITATION for accident on 22/10/2019 at CTE towards PIE
Changi (Aft exit 11) involving vehicles GBH708B & GBD6463M (urgent)

Without Prejudice

Dear Jessie,

Noted on your request, we will survey on a without prejudice basis.

Aside to LKK,



! ", V Auto

- Consultants
L Pte Ltd

51 UBT AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: Date: 09 Apr 2020

Our Ref: CS/GAI20004682/Qyd3

The Motor Claims Department
GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _ GBH708B .

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle
on 3/04/2020 at the premises of M/s EFFICIENT MOTOR & ENGINEERING WORKS
PTE LTD and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 8§  4.760.86
Revised Estimate Amount - S$ 1,028.19
*Check” Items Amount : S% 854.08
Market Value + 85
LTA Reimbursement Value o
Nett Value : S%

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages
At the rear portion

rear

Yours faithfully

Ram
Automotive Assessor



