Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 17 April 2020 11:04 am
To: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)
Subject: Fw: GBA 7735M

LSump $2600.00 confirmed.

Tailgate bent price change $2398
Rear taillamp @5288.00
Spare tyre bracket bent $336.00

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ilkkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 15 April 2020 4:28 PM

To: Autoexcel Engineering Pte Ltd <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: Re: SCR8398U - GIA

Hi Ryan, GBA 7735 L/Sump $2600.00, 3days. Kenneth

From: Autoexcel Engineering Pte Ltd <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 7 April 2020 1:52 PM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SCR8398U - GIA

Hi Kenneth,

Attach GIA report SCR 8398 U

Thank you & Regards

Ryan Soh ( Manager )

Handphone : 93825367 / 90030857 .
DirectLine : 64535654

Fax : 64591698

From: Danny Ong <danny.ong@mbmwheelpower.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 7 April 2020 1:04 PM

To: 'Autoexcel Engineering ' <aeexcel@singnet.com.sg>
Subject: SCR8398U - GIA

Ryan



Enclosed GIA Report

Best regards,

Danny Ong | Claims Advisor
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