&=
FT— | REE: sle 17200 04652/ Uvd fpes e .
W— _ASSIGNMENT (Ofice)
=2 Paline Soh — o gt pemime:_30J3] 200 12:18Pm
Bill to:
mmronm:mum:mm
To Inspect Velsicle No: - SIM 96847 et MDAG35G
Wy up Mofor Tadind, . e ag15 465
o Bleapnd Tampings si. 43 #—aT-’-fm
- PN CismNe: COMPG20000536
Sum Insured: B
Bt B pos 08/03/2030
(Client's Record)

CA | BEV | REP. / REV Eltsr'u'P) ) HOD. Eodersemeat:
L2 30l3{ 2020 Person Contactad: Dﬂ"dd = @.LD

. Ve T
Date/Time | Action/Tostruction. Yoty 07

:_,I_!’l ¥ | .-;-If_ d

W FA 5L -

e "Eﬂ_‘:&h_!mﬂ'b Pl vz B




payeny wel
ASS. REC.BY: Horea [ e i/z'f/ ‘
' ASSIGNMENT
- Date: Veh g, SEM {7.’6& T YrRegn: V’a "7
Estimated Cost: Type | M.Cycle | Bu: I Van | Lorry | Taxi | Prime Mover |
JTPIWS I TPRE Truck | Trailer or /
AV g 3T Fpfe confpritr, 158
at Workshop m's Calour AT Insured | Std [ NI f NA
ol Sp.Reading '? 0 W T/Radio Insured | Std | NI | NA
Insured Enrg.lN-:
Policy No &MBRLH famlgﬂ-—f
Claims No. Gen Cond@lfuirﬂwi Burnt
Sum Insured: Excess: Stearing | Jammed | Leaked | Burmt or
[Client's Record) Brake: i Jammed | Leaked | Burnt or
Make of Vah Modi- NIl | STDMHim ar
TyreSizz F: / (éf /Z ,/?'
{Palicy Condition) R
Remark The veh had commenced its NS | OS | | BSIDUNIEXNOVA I GY [FS/LIZA @gr OHTSU / PIR | SUMI I

repair at the time of inspection,

ble.

TOYO | YOKO ar

Bal of Market Value: Fron} Rear

IDAC Accident Rport Consistent? : Yes or No RiBal 7 Y

GlA | PR Seen: Consisten? : Yes or No LiBal 7 mm Ligal 7 g

Est. Repairs: ?’ days FRes: Yes or No D.OA 2:?/}/30 0.0l 30/3/2,0

Lum Sum 20 o, 3Val: Yes or Ne Survey held al —

CA | REv | Rep. | 24vrs  ATA CISD\D | Des of Damages:Frt)l Reap)l OIS | NIS | UIC I Rootop or

Wehick, IN/OUT / [é/

Gk Person Cantactad: The UIC | Chassis frame | Body Structure afiecied due to colision.

Date /Time  Action / Instruction

.: MUI

/o cont j?o /

Dats(Tene. File Pass 107 D: Preli, Report

3 [_]: Final Report

Data/Time, Fie Return o7

2 Ay - .BRM

Report Format : Memen
Lump Sum /18: (S 550 )

< 2U%0 wil Dou d . (Red Usblug (S

Add Fee:

Days Of Repair: - I-\- -
Resurvey No. of Trip: [ Survey Fee:
Transsertaten 250
‘Site Insp (S ) _S+RS__§! I
Interview (S ) Phows
Tech, Invs (8 ) Ciners
‘Weekend (S )
TOTAL JE'. |




- o - Convuttanis

e P L Cosmparny Reglatration Mo 108807 188R
SLUMEANE L o#l-25 PAYVA URD ISIDUSTRIAL PAKK. SISGATHIKE 08983 TEL - 3 2550l FAN © (065 a25adl) S
Your Ref: CDMPG20000536

Our Ref: CS/EGIZ0004652/Uvd3 Date: 31/3/2020

The Motor Claims Department
Mis: ERGO INSURANCE PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

Withour Prejudice

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.SLM 96897

We thank you for vour instruction on

30/3/2020

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

30/3/2020 at the premises of M/s

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Eevised Estimatle Amount
"Check" ltems Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Mett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle susiained damages at the
n/s fronl portion

Comments/Present Status:

Damages Consistent

Yours faithlully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser

HUP MOTOR TRADING & SERVICE

: 85741140
: §53,189.75
{1 5%
1 8%
. 85
: 8%
i
offside
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coresnoe 1sssorissr
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

Tow: ERGO Insurance Pte. Lid. From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

5 Temasek Boulevard 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

#04-01 Suntec Tower Five Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 038985 Singapore 408933
Atln: Date: 31 Mar 2020

Preliminary Advice

Insured Viahicle No : SMD7935G
TP Vehicle No : SLMo8BaT Accident Date : 2B/03/2020
Make : TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS Assignment Data : 30/03/2020
Date of Inspection : 30/3/2020 Est. Duration of Repair 4
Inspection At ‘HUP MOTOR TRADING & SERVICE

Point of Impact | General Description of Damages

The vehicle sustained impact / damages n/s front portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross) S5 741140
Ravised Amount S5 3,189,775
Check ltems (Estimated) 55 0.00
Total 55 3,188.75
Lump Sum Repair 5%

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value 5%
Pre-Accident Value 5%
COE !/ PARF Rebate 5%
Salvage Value S$
Margin for Repair 5%

Remarks

The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage.
Kindly let us have your authonsation.

The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

Other comments - The above survey was conducted on a ‘Without Prejudice’ basis

e B e e D

hitps /isingapore. merimen.com/claims/index ofm Hussbox=MTRadusterdfuseaction=dsp_rptsArptmode=24caseid=0206588extid=3352428adjcu. .

"



"~ Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 31 March 2020 2:45 PM

To: ‘ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)’

Ce: ‘Zheng Hanyang'; 'Phoebe Xie'; SUR

Subject: RE: Claims ref no. (F) COMPG20000536 ACCIDENT ON : 28/03/2020, INVOLVING

CLIENT'S (SLM 9689 T) & YOUR INSURED (SMD 7935 G, ALONG SERANGOON
CENTRAL TWDS Y10 CHU KANG RD
Attachments: SLM 9689T PREL| REVISED pdf

Dear Pauline,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLM 9689T
Date of survey: 30/3/2020
Number of days (estimated) :4 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #D2-25 | 5{408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuUto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com=>

Sent: Monday, 30 March 2020 12:30 PM

To: 'ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department)’ <claims@ergo.com.sg>; assignments
<assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Zheng Hanyang' <hanyang.zheng@ergo.com.sg>; 'Phoebe Xie' <phoebe.xie@ergo.com.sg>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Claims ref no. (P) COMPG20000536 ACCIDENT ON : 28/03/2020, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SLM 9689 T) &
YOUR INSURED (SMD 7935 G, ALONG SERANGOON CENTRAL TWDS YIO CHU KANG RD

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Thank you for the assignment.

G.NIVITHA
LEK Auto Consultanis Pie Lid

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: gssignments@lkkanto com | fax: h256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(408033)

From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 30 March 2020 12:18 PM

To: Admin A (admin-a@lkkauto.com) <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D {LKKAuto (admin-d@lkkauto.com) <admin-
d@ikkauto.com>; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto (Meikwan@Ikkauto.com) <Meikwan @|kkauto.com>

Cc: Zheng Hanyang <hanyang.zheng@ergo.com.sg>; Phoebe Xie <phoebe.xie@ergo.com.sg>

Subject: Claims ref no. (P) COMPG20000536 ACCIDENT ON : 28/03/2020, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SLM 9689 T) & YOUR
INSURED [SMD 7935 G, ALONG SERANGOON CENTRAL TWDS YIO CHU KANG RD

Importance: High




Date Classification : Confidential, C3

** NOTE: Please create case, input our Claim ref no. and upload ALL survey related documents into
Merimen. Payment invoices shall be ignored for cases that are not submitted via Merimen.

Hi LKK,

Please conduct this survey request.
(Note: Survey vehicle only, LOD will be handled by Ergo)

Kindly inform us if you are not able to attend it.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,
Pauline Soh
Executive

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.
& Temasek Boulevard #04.05 | Suntec Tower Five | Singapore 038985
CID - +55 6B20 9154

ling. r9o. | www.ergo.comsg

ERGO

A Munich Re comparny

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups n Germany and Eurcpe Worldwide. ERGO Is represanted in maore than 30 countries and concantrates
on Europe and Asin. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one af tha workd's leading risk carriers

Crnctaimar Thes message and ity attschments are confidennsl, intended only for e named aodresses, and may o= priviegsd. H you are not (ne iINended recpien], you
should not disciose, distribule. copy or Ute this communicatian. if you ame not the intended recipient. please nolify the sender by miturm smail and delets this mesasge
By opening any attachmant (o this message. you agree to accept fhe ek that it may contain @ vines o demeging code. and you agres that ERGO Insurence Pia Lid wiil
red b liabém for any losa or damage thereby caused

From: David Ang <hupmator@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 30 March 2020 10:33 am

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>

Subject: RE : ACCIDENT ON : 28/03/2020, INVOLVING CLIENT'S [SLM 9589 T) & YOUR INSURED (SMD 7935 G, ALONG
SERANGOON CENTRAL TWDS Y10 CHU KANG RD

Dear Sirs,

Attach our estimate bill, GIA third party Insurer search, Client's GIA report, insurance certificate & log
card for your reference & attention,

Kindly assign your panel surveyor M/S LKK auto consultants (One of our insurer panel also) to survey
client's damaged vehicle on today, as client's vehicle was parked in our garage, after the accident,
Please revert & confirm the survey assignment

Kindly revert & confirm client's third party claims liability, reference & OIC, as we are looking for direct
settlement,

2



Best Regards

Cavid Ang

Tel : 6764 0038, Fax: 6784 0076, HP : 8815 4655
Mailing Address -

Hup Motor Trading & Service

Bik 2004 Tampines 51 93

#01-120

Singapore 523838

Virus-free. www.avg.com

Best Regards

David Ang

Tol : 6784 0038, Fax: 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655
Malling Addross :

Hup Motor Trading & Sarvice

Bik 8004 Tampines 5t 83

#01-120

Singapore 528838
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From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Maonday, 30 March 2020 12:18 PM

To: Admin A {admin-a@lkkauto.com); Admin-D (LKKAuto (admin-d@®lkkauto.com); Mei
Kwan (LKKAuto (Melkwan@lkkauto.com)

Cc: Zheng Hanyang, Fhoebe Xie

Subject: Claims ref no. (P) COMPG20000536 ACCIDENT ON : 28/03/2020, INVOLVING CLIENT'S

{(5LM 9682 T) & YOUR INSURED (SMD 7935 G, ALONG SERANGODON CENTRAL TWDS
¥YIO CHU KANG RD
Attachments: SLM 9689 T.pdf

Importance: High

Date Classification : Confidential, C3

** NOTE: Please create case, input our Claim ref no. and upload ALL survey related documents into
Merimen. Payment invaices shall be ignored for cases that are not submitted via Merimen,

Hi LKK,

Please conduct this survey request.
(Note: Survey vehicle only, LOD will be handled by Ergo)

Kindly Inform us if you are not able to attend it.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,
Pauline Soh
Exacufive

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.
& Temasak Boulivard #04-05 | Suntec Towesl Fiva | Singacore 038885
DID. .E58820 0154

Soh@ermo.com.sg | www.ergo.com.sg

ERGO

i Minich ly comgany

ERGO is one of the major insurance groups in Germany and Europe, Worldwide, ERGO is ropresented in more than 30 countries and concentrales on
Eurppe and Asia, ERGO i pan of Munich Re (Group), one of the world's Isading risk camiers

Crscimaror: Thes message and i atactments aoe confdental, mbeneed anky fon the mamen podressne, and may be prviegen. i youo ar Aoy e Peene e, yo
Enould not Disclose, dEinibule, copy o use this communication, Il you ame nat the (Mended recipiont, please nodily the sender by return smsl g delete tis message. By
apening any wiachment 10 (nis mesnage. you agres 1o sccepd the rek thal il may comtain 8 v or demaging cooe, and you agres that ERGD nsursnes Pta Lid. will nal be
ligthsle i pry koas or damags sty cactsd

|



Fram; David Ang <hupmotor@gmail com=

Sent: Monday, 30 March 2020 10:33 am

To: ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>

Subject: RE : ACOIDENT ON : 28/03/2020, INVOLVING CLIENT'S (SLM 9689 T) & YOUR INSURED (SMD 7935 G, ALONG
SERANGOON CENTRAL TWDS5 Y10 CHU KANG RD

Dear Sirs,

Attach our estimate bill, GIA third party insurer search, Client's GIA report, insurance certificate & log
card for your reference & attention,

Kindly assign your panel surveyor M/S LKK auto consultants (One of our Insurer panel also) to survey
client’s damaged vehicle on today, as client's vehicle was parked in our garage, after the accident, Please
revert & confirm the survey assignment

Kindly revert & confirm client's third party claims liability, reference & OIC, as we are looking for direct
settlement,

Best Regards

David Ang

Tel : 6784 0039, Fax : &784 o076, HP : 9815 4655
Malling Addresa :

Hup Molor Trading & Servics

Bik 9004 Tampines 5163

#01.120

Singapore 528838

Virus-free. www.avg.com

Best Regards

David Ang

Tel 1 6784 0009, Fax : 6784 0076, HP : 9815 4655
Mailing Address ;

Hup Mator Trading & Service

Blk B004 Tempines 5193

#01-120

Singapore 526838



Used Altis Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart Page 1 of 3
sCarRMART.COM Login  Sign up

Mew Garg Usnd Cars Rental Care Sali My Car Directory Products insurance Articlis Farum Hesources

CONNECTING CAR BUYERS & SELLERS. CONNECT \

I We'll handle your loans, insurance & other paperwork for FREE.

[ i 207 f ’ ]
Post an Advertisemant MW 200 Coupel.0 Turba Engine. B Spesed, Sunroof,

Sall if yoursell Advertss it A jus L

$58 until it's SOLD!

Browse by Category hd «Back{123) Nt Sort by Date Posted :i 10 resuits/ page v_-|
41 vehicles Alfs N Sabmin
Moel Price Cegrecanion i i Eng Cap Miligs wen Type
Search Selection  Altls iy A w017 Ry \ Ay Avallabie
Toyots Corolls Alvis 1 88 #E5.800 S8, D60 Sy 01-Mar-2017 15598 o 0,000 lkm Sedan Awnilabbe
Elegance
Driven By Prevous Mature Owner! 58 Servicing And Masstenance Comg By Broneo Motors' Perdect Gloss White Paintwork: [n Oraginal Con T
Toyots Cornlla Altis 1.6A 169,000 $SE.590 /v 15-Mue-2017 1.588 cc 45,000 km Sedan Availabie

Only § Cwner With Full Service Record With Borneo Motor. 100% Accident Free And Genuine Milsage. Higher Loan And Trade In Weico

Toyota Corolla Adss LGA BE1,BOO £2,000 fye L 8-D- 2017 L59E o 15, 500 km Sexdan Availabie
Standard [ OPC)

Condition Like 95% New Carl Facelift Model, 1 Dwner. 56l Under § Years Agent Warranty. Pristine Condibion. High Trade-1n Price, Flexib

Ty Motor & Coié M L50

Toyota Corolla Adls 1.6A A&7 000 58,330 iy O8-Mar- 2017 1598 cc &31.526 km Sedian Awinilalle
Elegance
| Owmer! Az Good As New Car Condition! Most Fopular Toyota Sedan Foe Your Family, Spacious And Relisble! Fexible Bank/ln House Lo

[ =namiow an |
Berellt Auen Erdeipise Phe (02 —

2011 Toyota Corolla Altds [Private Hire Rontal)
$ 350/ week Toyom Corolia Alts 3011 15 avaiabie for PHY rent. Pease commact 90680030 | B51E208] [ 96566568 for mam informanon

More IS Bbout thes veiCle

Toyota Corolla Alths 164 646000 $8.120 Pyt I1-Mar-2017 1.598 cox ¥3.788 km Sedan Avallabie
Elegance
st Aurroed With New Car Condinon, Beauniul Peal Wiz Coiour, Best Salng Model With Lom OF Good Feedback For Fuel Effcency, |
) Fermm a8 |
AL Ayt Pre Lid
Toyota Corolla Altis 1. BA &S, 000 B8, 240 'y 29 My JO1 7 1,598 Sadan Awvailalile

Elegances
Ewegant Grey, Elegance Moded, One Owner Oinly, Low Mieage Done, Accident Free, Low Manterance Cost. Very Well Maintaned, Easy F

Prame Motor B Leasing

Compars

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing. php?RGD=2017&MOD=Altis& RPG=20& VEH=0&AVL=2 30-Mar-20



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Page | of |

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner I1D Type:

Owner ID:
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Singapore NRIC
945A

SLM9689T

Mo

30 Mar 2020

TOYOTA
COROLLAALTIS1.6CVT
Black

2016

1ZRY346625
MRO53REH104562305
20.0 kW (120 bhp)
$19,995.00

19 Apr 2017

19 Apr 2017

0

$19,995.00 7991

Yes
18 Apr 2027
$14.996.00

18 Apr 2027

A - Car up to 1600cc & 97kW (130bhp)
10

$51,765.00

$36,508.00

$51,504.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 30 Mar 2020

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDeregInput ?FUNCTION _[D=F030... 30-Mar-20
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- .1_..5* ® |Nm.n s VA IN TERNATIONAL INSURANCE Pt Lip
= T ACCIDENT REPORTING CENTRE Civ Beg M PR NET Bz bim W2 P g
iMT!\N‘.i.TH‘!hL L AUTHORISED WORHSHDP: PG St £ W0 S | i | 0D Hunid o | Yngap
INWWH HUP HQTDR WG EEERva i¥le |85 gratepnn s o) TR ]
el -2 L5 BLK 3004 TAMPINES STREET B3 Fau (R AN Wirkwib v e o
e R 801120 EJNG-‘HHE S2B53A ! .
TEL &7BACO30 (24 hra) HP 58 154655
Email hupmplo-@igmai com
CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE
CROTTIR ¥ EHICLES (THID-PARTY WIBKS AND COMPENEA THING AT IEHAFTER | ks
SOTOR W EHICLES [THMD- P8 T RIBKE ANEY EOMAFES €A TO0) RLLES VI ROAL TRANIPORT ACT, /967 iMALAYRLA
MOTOR VECLES (THIMD-PARTY BHKS) §LL ES |ein ALAYSIN
All Accidents must be reported within 24 hours of the incident regardless of whether it will beadd 1o w elaim,
—
CERTIFICATE NO,: DSMPCON01 746 COVER: COMPREHENSIVE
I. Index Mark and Registration Number af Viehicle SLMBaRGT
Chassis Nn MROZIREH 104561305
L. Name of Policyholder LR Y |
3 Effective date of Insurance 1% Apr 2019
4. Expiry dete of Insurance I8 Apr 2010
5. Persons ar Classes of Persons autiiled iy drive®

(a} The Palicyholdes

employer o hisher parmer

Vehicle
& Limitathons s to ose®

The Policy does not cover

4) Lige for hire or rewand
b} Lise for mcmg, pace-making, miiahility mal, speed -testing

d} Use for any purpose i connection wiih the Maotor Trads

The Palicyholder may alsa drive & Moser Car not belongimg 10 or hised (under a ire purchace sgreement o otherwig 1o himhe: o i huisr

(b} Any other person whe is driving on the Palcyhaldery arder oe with bigher PTG,
Provided that the person detving is permiitted in accordance with the heensing ot alher laws or regulations 16 drive the Motor Vehicle or has been s
permined and i not disqualified By arder of 8 Court of Lew or by resson of any suactment o regulation in that behalf fromn driving the Mo

Use anly for social, domestie and plesmre purpeses and for the Policybolder's business

o) LUse for the carmage of goods ather then sampiles in cormection will any trade or busmess.

*Limitathonms rendered mopeanye by Section B of the Motor Vehjshes | Third-Parry Rinks and Compensation) Act iFsapier |8%nd Secnon 95 of the Road
Transpoit Aed, | 987 (Malaysial, are not to be meluded under these headings.

Insured & Named Drivers Sweess Sect | - SGD600.00
Linnimed Drivers Excess Sest | G0, 100,00
Windicreen Excess SCHON 00 .00

Hire Purichase Compuny
FOR DRIVERS BELOW 2)

Umited Overseas Bank Limited

YEARS OR ABOVE 65 YEARS OF
ATDITIONAL EXCESS OF $2500¢. (% SECTTON | WILL BE APPLICABLE.

AGE &/0R LESS THAN 2 YEARS SINGAPORE DRIVING LICENCE,

Agent Prokes ATHEIEM Mg Comsul tey
Datn of lasse W0 L2302
MX 1 -Private Car (Tnir=d Priving)

L

L'We HEREBY CERTIFY ihal the Poliey 1o which this Cermificate relares 15 ssucd in scconfance with the Frovimions ul the Motor Vehicles (' Third-Party
thmtmmm: ALt (Chaprer 159) and Part IV of the Road Transpor Aoy, 1987 [Malayuia;

Forlndia airrnational Insarance Pte Lid

.

Autnonsad Sigrabony

huevweon/ 202009 | |23 12

IWAL2009 | 12437
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HUP MOTOR TRADING & SERVICE

Bik 9004 Tampines Street 93 #01-1720 Singapore 528838 Tel: 6784 0039 Fax 6784 0076 Emall hupmotos@ gmail com Reg No. 37809100W

TF 299C/03/20 A Date: 20 bl karcr 2020

Our Ref ___ 3 :
vt A
MR JIN ¥YX
ELE 550, «18=35 {
ZZATC00T NCRTE AV 3 < %
SINGATCZE 550550 )?c. M/f»\/‘-ﬂ

- — - ey —— 1 - -
T

Betimete cost of repeir to 2CYCTA COROLLA AlLTIS 145 (a,) Ssloon - SLi 9669 1T

1 pe front bumper 3#:"?4“‘7 § 453,10~

16 pes front bumper clips AA ¢ 5 3.50 52 40 —
1 pe front busper n/s side retaicer 441 ags.7c ¥

1 pe front nfs faader 4. 716,60 X

1 pe  front r..f:s fender 'VVI-1' enblams e C 34, 30—

1 pc front n/s fender irmer shield 163.4C

8 pes Tront nfs fander inner shiesld :‘:11:. UA 5 3.8C 3?,;(}}5"‘"
1 pe  front n/s Tender 'Tufi-Kote' sticker Al 58.50 "
1 pe front n/fs door mirror sosp 9#9;..-;/07{ 1,23C.10 , —

1 setl front n/s door freme sticksr A+ £2.90 x

1 pec front n/s sport reim tv?) 680,00 —
1 pc front a/s fender end top garris: o7 39,80 ¥

1 pe nfs hesd lanp Essy W 1 2,210,80 ¥

e

door mirror case cover Cu? 88.4

- 5|935-2C
Less 25: $ 1,483.80

AW e 4,431.40

3
[t]
s |
H
=]
3
e+
<
]
o .

o rezove £ refif frant n/g door inner tri- boerd cover, 5-883,
rasulsfor & necessury parts, to snsple rspeir for side girrer h/
repeir door. A= 220.00

¢ check & pdjust front wheel elignment & belancing. 15(__(:(:&)

iring 8] 50.00 20
Labectir clarge %o remove & out out damaged perts, te izclk,
streighten & Ernookirs oiit frent n/s door & neceseary garts, to
wels, renew k glisn sbove paris, 350.00 #ﬂo
Mo mammvet M T b s w1 FPondad pmnl damd mapso
¢ respray TuTf-Kote an al) affected acciiens parss, 4 190400 )4

2 putty & respray painting on all sffected sccldent

3
il
L=

o+
T

= 1,500.00 7,5

3 Ti'¢1 1;45

EFESSFFEEEETEE

Dollars : Seven Thousand Four Hundref Eltm‘;ﬂ?ﬁimmmv_?ﬁ!ﬂty Cz1 ]. 1"“] h
¢ e iy fodlow = 'lrl"llf




d/62020 Adjuster Repart
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregnesssoriser)
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Emall: sur@lkkauto.com;assignmentsi@ikkauto.com
VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT
Our File No: CS/EGI20004652/UVD3N2
Date: 06/04/2020

REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: ERGO Insurance Ple. Lid. Paolicy No:
puimant Vehicle - simoeegT Insured Vehicle No:  SMD7935G
Date of Loss: 28/03/2020 Mature of Claim: T Claim No:  COMPG20000536
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No SLMBEBAT
Make & Modsl TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS, 1.6 CVT (A) Engine No: 1ZRY 346625
Reg. Date 19/04/2017 (Man. Year. 2016) Chassis No: MROS3REH104562305
Colour: Black Cdometer: 70254 km
Engine Capacity: 1598 cc
Market Value/New Car Price:  N/A
Sum Insured (S$): Market Valua/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Stearing (Servicaabla), Yes Foothrake (Serviceable). Yes
Handbrake (Serviceabla): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 215/45R1T Rear Tyre Siza: 215/45R17
Front Left Side: Michelin 7 mm Rear Laft Side: Michelin 7 mm
Froni Right Side: Michelin 7 mm Rear Right Side: Michelin 7 mm
The sbove vilues represent ine mmaming hyre freads depth
\COST OF CLAIMS B Repairer's Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Paris 4.451.40 1,989.75 246165 55,30
Miscallaneous tams 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2,860.00 1.200.00 1.760.00 59.46
Paintwark Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Tawing 0.00 0.00 0.00

Calculated Gross Total (S$) 7.411.40 3,189.75 4,221.65 56.96

Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 2,550.00
Nett Amount (S§) T.411.40 2,550.00 4,861.40 65.59
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 30/0372020
Hup Maotor Trading & Service (HQ)
Date Inspected; 30/03/2020  Inspectad Al Blk 9004 Tampines Streat 93, #01-120
Singapore 528838

Estimatad Pariod of Repair; 4.0 days
Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: VERON CHEN

NOTE: This report represants awr findings af the ime and place of inspaction staled hareine Such inspection has bopn carried ouf to the best of our knowledpe and
ability buf any other labiity under nmy other cvcumsfances i3 hereby sxprassly sxcluded

tittps /singapore, mermen comitiaims/index ofmPfusebox=MTRadjuster&luseaclion=gan_printrptAcaseid=0296585exiid=33524 25 CFID=697094...
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4182020 Adjuster Repart
REPAIR DETAILS
Reference
Part Source: MRM-SG Version: 1.0 (Lasl Synchronised: 06 Apr 2020)
Parts: 143 TOYOTA COROLLA ALTIS 1.6 CVT (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
Labour: Repairar's {Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Linsubmitied, no print-code for SLMSG8ST)
These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page numbers with

Validity:

the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last eslimate page
Further Info: llems/values nol in reference calalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Gty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Deep Cut 458 10FL “458.10FL
2 18 *FRONT BUMPER CLIPS Necassary G62.40FL *62.40FL
3 1 *FRONT BUMPER N/S SIDE RETAINER Not Mecessary BA.TOFL *-FL
4 1 *FRONT N/S FENDER Repair T16.60FL *-FL
5 1 *FRONT N/S FENDER VVT-| EMBLEMS Necessary 3430FL  *3430FL
6 1 *FRONT N/S FENDER INNER SHIELD Mot Necessary 163.40FL *-FL
[ a8 *FRONT N/S FENDER INNER SHIELD CLIPS MNecessary 31.20FL *31.20FL
8 1 *FRONT N/S FENDER TUFF-KOTE STICKER Necassary 58.50 FL “58.50FL
a 1 *FRONT N/S DOOR MIRROR COMP Deep Cut/Damaged 1.230.10 FL  *1,230.10FL
10 1 *SET FRONT N/S DOOR FRAME STIKCER Mot Necessary 62890 FL *-FL
1 1 *FRONT N/S SPORT RIM Cut 880.00FL *680.00 FL
12 1 *FRONT N/S FENDER END TOP GARNISH Mot Necessary 39.80 FL “-FL
13 1 *N/S HEAD LAMP ASSY Not Necessary 221080 FL *.FL
14 1 *FRONT N/S DOOR MIRROR CASE COVER Cut 9840 FL *98.40 FL

FeFranchise parl. L=LislBemDisc

Sub Total ()  5,935.20 2,653.00

- List ltem Discount on L Items 25.00/25.00% (5%) 1.483.80 663.25

Total Parts (55) 445140 1,988.75

Report was unsubmitied during this print-aut.

https:fisingapore.merimen. comiclaims/index.cim Musebox=MTRad|uster&fuseaction=gen_printrplicaseid=020658exlid=3352428CFID=697004.., 203



4872020 Adjuster Report
Recommended Miscellaneous Items

Thare are no new miscellanecus items solectod,

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO REMOVE & REFIT FRONT N/S DOOR INNER TRIM BOARD New 220.00 0.00

COVER,GLASS REGULATOR & NECESSARY PARTS TO ENABLE
REPAIR FOR SIDE MIRROR & REPAIR DOOR

2 TO CHECK & ADJUST FRONT WHEEL ALIGNMENT & BALANCING New 150.00 80.00
3 TO WIRING CHECK UP FOR AFFECTED WIRING SYSTEM New 50.00 20.00
4 LABOUR CHARGE TO REMOVE & CUT OUT DAMAGED PARTS,TO New 850.00 400.00

JACK,STRAIGHTEN & KNOCKING OUT FRONT N/S DOOR &
NECESSARY PARTS,TO WELD,RENEW & ALIGN ABOVE PARTS

5 TO RESPRAY TUFF-KOTE ON ALL AFFECTED ACCIDENT PARTS MNew 80.00 0.00
6 TOPUTTY & RESPRAY PAINTING ON ALL AFFECTED ACCIDENT New 1,500.00 700.00

PARTS
Gross Labour Cost (5%) 2,960.00 1,200.00

Repon was unsubmitted during this print-oul.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

hitps /isingapore. marman.comiclaims/indax efmTfusebox=MTRadjuster&fussaction=gen_pnnirpl&caseld=0286588extid=3352428CFID=607084 ... 33



