admin

From: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 30 March 2020 10:54 AM

To: Nabilah; SUR

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl; admin-d@Ikkauto.com; assignments@Ilkkauto.com

Subject: RE: O/R : SNM20D201540/CB6502H/PAULINE - TP Claim - SLE4845) - DOA :
27/03/2020

Attachments: SAS2770402.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Nabilah

Our surveyor will contact you for the PRS.

Dear LKK

Please conduct PRS.

Thanks.

Pauline Tham
Senior Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6541 | F:(65) 6224 7175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: X3 i Taiping SG

From: Claims Dept of CTI

Sent: Monday, March 30, 2020 10:13 AM

To: Pauline Tham <pauline.tham @sg.cntaiping.com>; Nabilah <nabilah@mova.com.sg>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: O/R : SNM20D201540/CB6502H/PAULINE - TP Claim - SLE4845]J - DOA : 27/03/2020

Dear Pauline,
Please conduct PRS for SLE4845).
Note : officer in charge — Pauline 63896541

*** Kindly quote our reference number when replying.



Thank you

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower
Singapore 079909

DID: (65) 63896116 | F:(65) 62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: X4t Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Nabilah <nabilah@mova.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, March 30, 2020 9:47 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cec: billy@mova.com.sg; nitha@mova.com.sg

Subject: TP Claim - SLE4845] - DOA : 27/03/2020

Your Ref : CB6502H
Dear Sir/Mdm,

Kindly assist to arrange survey for SLE4845] on 30/03/2020 (Monday) at Mova (Fan Yoong).
There’s an ongoing rental for this claim.

Kindly assist to advise on OIC and direct settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Nabilah Senin
MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd

15 Fan Yoong Road

Singapore 629792
Tel: +65 6262 3377
Fax: +65 6264 3151

@MOVA

Aulomative Pla Lid

Connect with us on ‘jm



