Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Leong Auto <sales@leongauto.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 December 2020 1:14 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Cc: Ops Leong Auto; Leong Auto Admin; Admin A

Subject: Re: Finalised: Letter of Demand - Accident Involving SLR3305P & SLH2402B on
25/03/2020 Your Ref: PNPV2017-00008500-02 *** LKK REF: CC4/FWD20004629/Kra3

Attachments: SLR3305P - Tax Inv 202012009.pdf; SLR3305P - DV, LOA Owner.pdf

Jaslin,

Attached are the duly signed DV, LOA from Owner & Tax Invoice for your necessary action.
Wishing you, family & all at LKK a Blessed Christmas!

Regards,

Leong Auto Pte Ltd

Cady Lee

Office : 6266-6448 Fax : 6266-6358

Please consider the environment before printing this message

This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

Facebook page at: https://www.facebook.com/leongautogroup

On Wed, Dec 23, 2020 at 12:13 PM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ilkkauto.com> wrote:
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Thank you for acceptance.

Please duly sign the Release Voucher enclosed and return to us(LKK) for our necessary action.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Thank you.

Best Regards,



Jaslin Kok | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ops Leong Auto <opsl@leongauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 December 2020 10:56 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Leong Auto Admin <tjh@leongauto.com.sg>; Leong Auto <sales@leongauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-
a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Finalised: Letter of Demand - Accident Involving SLR3305P & SLH2402B on 25/03/2020 Your Ref: PNPV2017-
00008500-02 *** LKK REF: CC4/FWD20004629/Kra3

Without Prejudice:

Dear Jaslin,

We accept the offer of $4,588.69 for property damage only.

Thank you for settling the claim swiftly & amicably. Please release the DV to us.

Best Regards,

Leong Auto Pte Ltd

Shawn Chen

Office : 62666448 Fax : 62666358

Please consider the environment before printing this message

This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

Please like our Facebook page at: https://www.facebook.com/leongautogroup




On Mon, Dec 21, 2020 at 5:56 PM Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Your Ref: SLR 3305P

LKK Ref: CC4/FWD20004629/Kra3 Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLH 2402B AND SLR 3305P ON 25/03/2020

We refer to the above matter.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 4,288.69
2. Loss of Rental (3 days x $100.00) $300.00
Total | $ 4,588.69

Please confirm acceptance.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Leong Auto Admin <tjh@Ileongauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 15 December 2020 3:58 PM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Leong Auto <sales@leongauto.com.sg>; Ops Leong Auto <Opsl@Ileongauto.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>




Subject: Re: Letter of Demand - Accident Involving SLR3305P & SLH2402B on 25/03/2020 Your Ref: PNPV2017-
00008500-02 *** LKK REF: CC4/FWD20004629/Kra3

Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/Madam,

We will provide you with the Final Tax Invoice once we reach the settlement.

Best Regards,

Daniel Tan/Cady Lee

Leong Auto Pte Ltd

Office : 6266-6448 Fax : 6266-6358

Please consider the environment before printing this message

This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

Please like our Facebook page at: https://www.facebook.com/leongautogroup

On Fri, 11 Dec 2020 at 11:11, Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We are currently pending approval from our principal, shall revert to you once our principal approved.
Meanwhile, kindly provide us a Final bill as Proforma Bill is not acceptable by insurer.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 10 December 2020 2:46 PM

To: Venessa Chan - SGUser <venessa.chan@fwd.com>; Leong Auto <sales@leongauto.com.sg>; Josey Loh Kah Wai -
SGUser <josey.loh@fwd.com>; 'admin-d@lkkauto.com'; 'admin-a@Ikkauto.com'; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)
<jaslinkok@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Ops Leong Auto <Opsl@leongauto.com.sg>; Leong Auto Admin <tjh@Ileongauto.com.sg>; Motor Claims SG - SG
Common <motorclaims.sg@fwd.com>; Eileen Bay - SGUser <eileen.bay@fwd.com>; Admin A <admin-
a@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Letter of Demand - Accident Involving SLR3305P & SLH2402B on 25/03/2020 Your Ref: PNPV2017-
00008500-02 *** LKK REF: CC4/FWD20004629/Kra3

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Jaslin,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021"

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Venessa Chan - SGUser <venessa.chan@fwd.com>

Sent: Thursday, 10 December, 2020 2:36 PM

To: Leong Auto <sales@leongauto.com.sg>; Josey Loh Kah Wai - SGUser <josey.loh@fwd.com>; 'admin-
d@lkkauto.com'; 'admin-a@Ilkkauto.com'

Cc: Ops Leong Auto <Opsl@leongauto.com.sg>; Leong Auto Admin <tjh@leongauto.com.sg>; Motor Claims SG - SG
Common <motorclaims.sg@fwd.com>; Eileen Bay - SGUser <eileen.bay@fwd.com>

Subject: Letter of Demand - Accident Involving SLR3305P & SLH2402B on 25/03/2020 Your Ref: PNPV2017-
00008500-02

Hi LKK Team,
Please assist with the following email below.
Thank you.

Best Regards,



Venessa Chan

Administrative Assistant, Operations

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.
6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986

E venessa.chan@fwd.com
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From: Leong Auto <sales@leongauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 10 December 2020 1:45 pm

To: Josey Loh Kah Wai - SGUser <josey.loh@fwd.com>; Motor Claims SG - SG Common <motorclaims.sg@fwd.com>
Cc: Ops Leong Auto <Opsl@leongauto.com.sg>; Leong Auto Admin <tjh@Ileongauto.com.sg>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Fwd: Letter of Demand - Accident Involving SLR3305P & SLH2402B on 25/03/2020 Your Ref:
PNPV2017-00008500-02

Without Prejudice:

Dear Sir/Madam,
Further to our email dd 21/11/2020, we would appreciate it if you could advise the status of the claim.
Kindly advise the officer in charge of this claim.

Thanks + Regards,
Leong Auto Pte Ltd



Cady Lee

Office : 6266-6448 Fax : 6266-6358

Please consider the environment before printing this message

This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender
immediately.

—————————— Forwarded message ---------

From: Leong Auto Admin <tjh@leongauto.com.sg>

Date: Sat, Nov 21, 2020 at 2:03 PM

Subject: Letter of Demand - Accident Involving SLR3305P & SLH2402B on 25/03/2020 Your Ref: PNPV2017-
00008500-02

To: Motor Claims SG - SG Common <motorclaims.sg@fwd.com>

Cc: Leong Auto <sales@leongauto.com.sg>, Ops Leong Auto <Opsl@leongauto.com.sg>

Without Prejudice
Dear Sir/Madam,

Attached is the LOD on behalf of our client.
Please help to relay to the officer-in-charge.
We look forward to your early response.

Best Regards,

Daniel Tan/Cady Lee

Leong Auto Pte Ltd

Office : 6266-6448 Fax : 6266-6358

Please consider the environment before printing this message

This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or
partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender
immediately.

Please like our Facebook page at: https://www.facebook.com/leongautogroup

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please notify the sender
immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not use, disclose, copy or
store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT been
scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any attachments.



