Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Jonathan Tan <jonathan@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 9 April 2020 5:53 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: mrstan@huahong.com.sg

Subject: RE: TENDER FOR LUMP SUM REPAIR COST OF SLE 1570X -DOA: 22/3/2020 (ALLIED
WORLD)

Dear Veron,

We offer lump sum repair $4,100/- for this case.

Regards,

JONATHAN TAN
DIRECTOR

HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

25D SUNGEI KADUT STREET 1, SINGAPORE 729332
T. 6661 9696 | F. 6661 9699

Website @ http://www.huahong.com.sg

Disclaimer: This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the
recipient(s) named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete
all copies of it. Thank you.

From: Mrs Tan <mrstan@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 9 April 2020 5:45 PM

To: jonathan@huahong.com.sg

Subject: FW: TENDER FOR LUMP SUM REPAIR COST OF SLE 1570X -DOA: 22/3/2020 (ALLIED WORLD)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, 9 April 2020 5:43 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; mrstan@huahong.com.sg

Subject: TENDER FOR LUMP SUM REPAIR COST OF SLE 1570X -DOA: 22/3/2020 (ALLIED WORLD)

Dear Mrs Tan,

Kindly check above vehicle able to repair on Lump Sum basis or if have used parts.

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.



Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



