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&M/2020 Adjusier Immediate Advice
' Mole: This document has not been finalised.

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coreqne 1sesoriass

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Emall: sur@lkkauto com;assignmants@Ikkauta,com

To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Lid. From: LKK Auto Consuitants Pte Lid
5 Temasek Boulevard 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25
#04-01 Suntec Tower Five Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 038985 Singapare 408933
Attn: Date: 01 Apr 2020
Preliminary Advice
Insured Vehicle No @ YP2394U
TP Vehicla No : GBDSB4BZ Accident Date | 24/03/2020
Make : TOYOTA HIACE Assignmeant Data . 27103/2020
Date of Inspection  : 30/03/2020 Est. Duration of Repair :4.00
Inspection At : AUTOMOBILE INTEGRATED MANAGEMENT PTE LTD (HQ)
23 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4 #04-01, KAKI BUKIT (SOUTH WING)
SINGAPORE 415933

Point of Impact /| General Description of Damages
The vehicle susteined impact / damages n/s front partion and paris claimed are consistent to the accident

Repalrer's Estimate (Gross) 5§ 12,308.51
Revised Amount 5% 4 058.89
Check ltems (Estimatad) 1 0.00
Total 5% 4,0568.89
Lump Sum Repair 5§ 3,200,00

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value 58
Pre-Accidant Value 55
COE | PARF Rabate 5%
Salvage Valua 88
Margin for Repalr 53

Remarks

{ ) The vehicle is repairable at cur adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage. Kindly
let us have your authorisation.

{ ) The vehicle is uneconamical to be repaired, you are advised to Invite tender for the wreck.

( )} Other comments :

hitps:/isingapora.menmen.com/claimafindex.cim Husebox=5VCdockfuseaction=dsp_viewarsmart&docid=52225404 &proview=1&nckyout=1&8CF1...

in



admin

From: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 27 March 2020 10:57 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAute (admin-d@Ilkkauto.com), Admin A (admin-a@lkkauto.com); Mei
Kwan (LKKAuto (Melkwan@lkkauto.com)

Ce Zheng Hanyang; Phoebe Xie; automim.claim@gmail com

Subject: FW: Claims ref no. (P) COMFG20000517 NOA- GBDSB46Z // TP Claim 24.03.2020

Date Classification : Confidential, C3

** NOTE: Please create case, input our Claim ref no. and upload ALL survey related documents into
Merimen. Payment invoices shall be ignored for cases that are not submitted via Merimen.

HI LKK,

Please conduct this survey request.
(Note: Survey vehicle only, LOD will be handled by Ergo)

Kindly inform us if you are not able to attend it.

Thank you.

Warmest Regards,
Pauline Soh
Executive

ERGO Iinsurance Pte. Ltd.
& Tomusek Boulevird #04-05 | Suntec Towar Five | Singapom 038985
MO, +85 6820 9194

i .80 | www.ergo com.sg

ERGO

A Munich Re company

ERGC s one of the major ingurance groups in Garmany and Europe. Worldwida, ERGO la raprasented In more than 30 countries and concantriales on
Europe and Asia. ERGO is part af Munich Re (Group), one of the world's leading risk carriers

Disclaimer: This message and is afischments are conlidential, intended only lor the namsyd sddmssss, and may be privileged. || you e not the intended recipenl, you
should not disclose, distribute. sopy or use This communication. If you arm not fhe inlended recipaent. plesse nofify the sandar by return email and deliete fhe message. By
ppening any attachmaent 1o this message. you agres 1o accapt the risk thal if may comain a vires ar damaging code, and you agres that ERGO imsurance Pie Lid will not be
liabla for any nss o damage thereby caused

From: AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com:

Sent: Thursday, 26 March 2020 9:31 am

To: ERGO Insurance Pte, Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>

Cc: Jacelyn Foo <jacelyn.foo@ergo.com,sg>; Zheng Hanyang <hanyang.zheng@ergo.com.sg>; Phoebe Xie
1



" <phoebe.xie@ergo.com.sg>
Subject: Re: Claims ref no. (P) COMFG20000517 NOA- GBDS846Z // TP Claim 24.03.2020

Hi Pauline,

We would like to appoint surveyor from LKK to conduct survey.
Thank you.

Regards,

Jacyne

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd (aim)

Office: 28 Sin Ming Lane #07-147 Midview City Singapore 573972

W/S: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933
Tel: 91198371

On Thu, Mar 26, 2020 at 9:30 AM ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg> wrote:

Date Classification : Confidential, C3

Dear Jacyne,

We would like to conduct a PRI survey, please refer to our list of surveyors ;

1| AIS | Automoblle Inspection Services Pte Ltd
2 | FTA FormTeam Consultancy Pte Ltd
3 | IAS Infiniti Appraisal Service

4 | JPK JP Knights Pte Ltd

5| LBS L.B.S Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

6 | LKK LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

71 PS Priority Services

8 | VAC Vicom Ltd




9 | AJAX AJAX Inspection Services Ple Lid
10| AA - Appraisal Associate

Warmes=l Regards,
Pauline Soh

Executive

ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd.
5 Temasak Boulevard 804-05 | Suntec Tower Five | Singapore 038585

DiD.: -55cB29 69194

ling.so | www.sro0 com.sg

ERGO

A Mynich Re company

EAGO s one of tha major insurance groups in Garmany and Europa. Worldwide, ERGO 8 represented in more than 30 countries and concentrates on
Ewops and Asia. ERGO is part of Munich Re (Group), one ol the world's leading risk carrlers.

[esclaimes This message and s afinchments are confidential, intanded only for the ramed addnessse. and may be privieged. If you are nol the ntended rocipenl you
shausd not decliose, deinbule. copy or use this communication If you am not the intended recipient, please noiily the sender by refurn email and delots this message. By
apening any attachmani 1o this message. you agres 1o accopt the risk thal it may contain & viris or damaging code. and you agros that ERGO Inswance Pte Lid. will hot be
limbles far any |loss or damage thereby caussd.

From: AIM PTE LTD <automim.claim@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 25 March 2020 3:21 pm



" To: ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Claims Department) <claims@ergo.com.sg>
Subject: NOA- GBDS846Z // TP Claim 24.03.2020

Hi,

Please find attached to advise further.

Thank you.

Regards,

Jacyne

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd (aim)
Office: 2B Sin Ming Lane #07-147 Midview City Singapore 573972
W/S: 23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4, Kaki Bukit Vicom #04-01 (South Wing) Singapore 415933

Tel: 91198371



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

—
From: Do-Not-Reply <do-not-reply@merimen.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 31 March 2020 3:00 PM
To: do-not-reply@merimen.com
Ce: SUR
Subject: TP VEHICLE GBD 58467 [YOUR REF: CDMFG20000517)

This mall is associated with :
*GBD5B46Z
[YP2394U]

TP
Mar 24 2020 12:00AM

Automobile Integrated Management Pte Ltd
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GBD 58467 on 30/03,/2020,
We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Thanks & Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms)

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Tel: 6256 3561

This is an auto-generated email. Do not reply to this email.

Sent by : SHIAU CHAN (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd)




Used Hiace Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart
scCARMARTYT.COM

New Cars Uged Cars Rental Carx Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance

%O“EEE[TIHG CAR BUYERSEE- fELLERS. .
e’ll handle your loans, insurance & other paperwork for .
AaA

2017 Vol GP 1.4 Lady Dw
Post an Advertisemeant DRgan Smacon BF 1.4 Lady Dum *

Saill it yoursel Advertme it Gt just F‘ L i
$58 until it's SOLD! Puckiad I
[irwet Chginay I |
firowse by Categary ]
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Search Selection  Hisce - B 1018
. J Toyots Hiace Commuter 3.04 43, 800 BTN fyr Sh-Mae- 2015 49082 o
A GL
Fusl Type: Dirsel
Thimi Cine Ao & Trading
Toyota Hiace 3.04 DX 335 800 $7.240 fyr 28-4pr-2015 L0967 =

Fuel Type: Diees

- Mg LIl PoLACH

Toyola Hiace Commuter 3,08 45 B00 S8, 100 e Z5-Nov-2015 L9682 cc
Fusl Typa: Diessl
Please Call To Armange For Viewmng Thans ¥ou

Toyota Hiace 3.0 36,800 47,400 (e 20-Mar-2015 L9 o

Fuel Type: Diessl

Toyola Hisce [For Lease]
S1L.250/rmth Tipdots Miace is tailored to sull your business requirernemss. i@ onby §1150/mth 1

More info bl e weficle

Toyota Hiace Commuter 3.04 =4 7.000 £8,420 (yr 12-Dec-2015 2582 cc
High Roof

Fuel Type: Diessl

& Manths Warranty, Escallent Condition, Bank Loan/In House Loan Available, Trade In Welcome.
Toyota Hiace 3.0A DX S0 800 47,400 O3-Mov-2015 2000 o

Fusel Typa: Ciesel
1173015 Tovols Hiace 3.0 DX Autn § Doors Rear Aircon, One Owner, COE $36, 312 New Paint And New Faceidt

Thir D Auforotds b Trading

Toyota Hisce 3.04 DX 12 800 $8,080 i 16-Jul-201% 2982 o

Compare

https://www.sgcarmart.com/used_cars/listing.php?RGD=2015&MOD=Hiace& RPG=20& VEH=0&AV ...
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PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry

> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars

Owner |D Type: Business
Owner 1D: 226D
Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: GBD5846Z
Vehicle to be Exported: No
Intended Deregistration Date: 30 Mar 2020
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA

Vehicle Model: TOYOTA HIACE VAN TURBO 5 DR
MANUAL

Primary Colour: White

Manufacturing Year: 2014

Engine No.: 1KD2461512

Chassis No.: JTFHTO2P900153925

Maximum Power Output: -

Open Market Value: $27.502.00

Original Registration Date: 02 Jan 2015

First Registration Date: 02 Jan 2015

Transfer Count: 1

Actual ARF Paid: $1,376.00

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility: No

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -

PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00

Intended COE Rebate Details

COE Expiry Date: 01 Jan 2025

COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus

COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: $61,000.00

COE Rebate Amount: $29,007.00

Total Rebate Amount: $29,007.00

Page | ol |

The information contained herein is correct as at 30 Mar 2020

OK

hitps://vrl. lta.gov.sg/lta’vrl/action/enquireRebate By PublicBeforeDereglnput ZFUNCTION _ID=F030... 30-Mar-20



32020

MCHMZ0038124 | Chang Hoe Mator Pis Lid - Yishun
ENTRY DATE & TIME. 24002020 14:35
SUBMITTED BY: SHARDN CHIDNG BENG CHOON

E-FILE

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1 Mmmmmshhdﬂhdhﬂmmwﬂmhmplm

L Jmmmmuwum mmmmmmmﬂmmmmmMMm

repudiata policy liability.

i 1'11!:ﬂwwmul"lmmurlmmhmllnm#maﬂwmwpmnthmm

[ Thmmﬂﬂhmwmm-nﬂmﬂmﬁmMwmmmeMWMHW[ﬂmﬂmmw
and that copies of this mpart will, for 8 fee, be made available upon application by intsrestsd porfies.

7. By tha lndgament of thi repon io the insurers, you hareby consant i the archiving of this repor 8t the centre and to copies of the report baing made avallable sforesaid.

Data Of Report

Data Of Accident

Exact Location Of Accidant
Country/State of Loss

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
MName Of Registered Owner
Co Reg No

Email Address

Maobile Phone No
Alternative Phane No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own Insurance policy for
repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleat Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Nama of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

hitps:#singapora. mariman.com/claims/index cfmHusabox=5\Cdochfuseaction=dsp_viewersman&ftype=2&docid=520578 18&prefix=8corale=2&CF|.,

ACCIDENT STATEMENT
24/03/2020 14:35

24/03/2020 05:35

11 SENOKO WAY CAR PARK
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

YP23s4U

ZERO SPOT LAUNDRY SERVICE PTE LTD
199707580W
SEPEIYONGEZEROSPOT.COM

Office-685211T1

MITSUBISHI
CANTER FECX1HR4SDED

COMMERCIAL USE

NO

REPORTING QNLY
COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

ERGO INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

DMFG20000606

01/01/20 - 311220

TAN SONG PENG
S1318757E
011211958
QUTDOOR
08/01/1989

e



A31/2020
Driving Experience
Gender
Mobile Number
Fax Number .
Contact Number
EMail Address
Address
Postcode
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured
Vahicle Registration Number of Driver's Own Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any fareign vehicle invalved in this accident?

Number of vehicles (including own vehicle) involved in
the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?
Was any Injured conveyed to hospital by ambulance?
Was any olher malerial or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/affaring accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police?

If Yes, Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given?

I Yes, against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

REFER TO ATTACH,

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment?
Was there any video caplured by Car Camera?
\Was there any audio recorded?

E-FILE
21 YEARS AND 2 MONTHS
MALE
(LOCAL) +65-98387044

NOEMAIL

BLK 109 SERANGOON NORTH AVE 1 #04-845
550108

YES

COLLIDED INTO PARKED VEHICLE
DARK
DRY

NO
2
NO

YES
NO

NO

YES
NO
NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Category

hitps f/singapore. merimen.com/claimalindex. efmMusabox=SVCdocAfuseaction=dsp_viewersman&fype=28docid=52007618&prefx=Acoraie=24CFI .

GBO5B46Z

COMMERCIAL VEHICLE

2114



43112020 E-FILE
_Name of Driver CHINESE MALE
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number CO.: DHL
Address
Postcode
Insurance Company Name

Nature Of Damage
MNo. Of Passanger {Including Driver)

huprfmmmm.mMmmmm.mﬁwcmmam,mwwzmmm1upr-fm-umm-zml=l.. A



Sketch Plan

hitps:/fsingapora. merimen.com/clalms/ndex. cfmPMusebox=5VCdocAfusesction=dsp_viswsrsmanaftype=28docid=520876184prefix=Rcorole=2&CF|..

A



asvznza E-FILE

SKETCH PLAN VEHICLE NO.: NP 2394y

INSURER . _E€Go
IMPORTANT NOTICE DATE & TIME: 3_4['3(:1:: @ pl=2yam
1. Pivwse report gooregtly the detalls of ihe sccident to spead up the daims process
2. This Femen sl Se completed by the Pall (relaes andfar th Ithoriied Drive

3 infatmation provided must be 2a truthul and sccyrate ss possible Any wiltul moarepresentalon or withholding of material
facts may allow imsurance companies 1o repudiate policy liabity,

4 Teg lsaue and acceptance of this Form by Insurance compan s s not an admission of policy llatility on the part of the insrance
compan jies

5 Any lalée reparting may be referved 1o the Police for investiganon.

& Tha repont will be forwarded by the insurers of the GlA Records Management Centre sctabiithed by the General Insurance
Asscuiation of Singapore (GIA} for prehiving and that copies of this repoet will Tor o Teg be made svallabis upen apslication by
interesied parties

7 By the lodgment of this report b5 the inkurers, you hareby consant to the archiving of this repart ot the cenire and te copies of
the repon being rmadn wvailabic aforessid.

B Coment under the Personal Data Protection Act [PDRA)
| urdinrstang, &knowicdge, agree and consent thal:

{a) My mmures, my worksnop and the Geerral inturanee Assotiation of Singapars | "BIA") muy/drr por rllled ta collect, wse,
aisciose andfor process my perscnal data/personal Information set out in this [farm] and sry ether persanal imfesration
provided ty me o possesued by my Inturer (coliectively the “Persanal infermation”| ana distiose and tramfer such
Peasonal infarmation 1o all insurery) who have imured vehicle(s) invabesd ie this seeident (al inurerfs) wio have Insursd
wehucle{s} invnived in this sccitent shall Be colisstively referred to a3 the “Insurers”), the lnsurers’ lavperi/law N, the
Manetary Authority of Sngapore and sny relevant government agencyfautharity [suth 23 the police), for the purposelt
of:
|1} processing. handling and/or deaing with my clim indoeding the settiemant of the clsims and any necesiary

Investigatiom i elaling 10 U claims,

{4} Invastigating the accident antdfor my dalms;
(i) carying out ana/or oealing with my instructions or reapondng to any engquiries by me;

(v} admirustering my claimi (including the mailing af correspondence, statements, involces, reports or natices Lo me,
whith could ol dinclosure of certain personal data abaut me 1o bring about dellvery of the sama 25 well 52 o0 The
external cover of envelopes/mail packages | sngfor

Iv) eomplyng, wilh applicable law in administeting processing, handling and/or desling with my claens |caileetively thi
“Purposes”)

) wllirsureris] whe have insured veniclals| involved in this sccident and the nsurers’ Lwyers/law flrms, mayfare permittes
to coflert, use, dischose aad/or protess my Personal Informallon (o one ar more of the above Purposes: and

{el  my Personal information may/cn be disclosed by any of the inwrers andfor GIA 1o theie third party service arovidess ar
spents{induding thair iwyers/law firmil, which muay be slted outsida af Singspate, far oie or more of the §bove Purpases.

{dl  mw Pernal information will also be collected and used 1o comipile clairs histary for the purposws of fraun oeection,
investigation and management in present and 8 futurs clalm

{#]  the mlormates 1o collected under () shove may be shared / disclosed;

Ui to all inturers andfor ary oboer third parthes that asist in svaluating, investigating. controliing or managing fraus,
regulstor, law enforcement and gavernmend agencies a3 ressonably required Tor the purposes stated, o

{H} tor complying with requirements wedes 3y regulations. faws or court arders

CRlTERY SR
# =~
W ). ) y
Pelliyholorrd Sigrauti Drives's Sigrature e purting Gentre Fesonnels Sgrature
Oate K Time: DF dhviwer Fs =t (b moicymaldert PMarrie: L"f'S
Date & Time; NRIC/TIN Nt f’

hitps:singapors. merimen.com/claimalindex. cfm Musebox=SVCdocAfuseaction=dsp_viewersman&fype=28docld=520876188pralix=8corole=24CFI... 5



Autpmobils integrated Manageman] Ps e
T Co EGST Ragno 2016052376
Oftkce: 28 Sin Ming Lane #07-147 Midwiew City -
Singapore 573972
Workshog: 23 Kokl Bukit Ave 5 80401 [South Wing)
Singapore 415933

Autamatsie misgraed Manegement Me Lid Ermeail: autamen, clam@ grgadl.oom Tek 5119 8371
N2 r‘/"jﬂf
ESTIMATE AL H.th{ .
Our Ref: AC2020026/TP/GBDS8462-24.03.2020 d/¢q 3200
?gﬂ,iim pape
Vehicle number: GBD58462 Vehicle Made & Model: TOYOTA HIACE
Items Qty Listitems Amount §
1 1 Front bonnet Q\ym 727.10~
2 1 Front bonnet lock ™ 13150
3 2 Front bonnet hinges - L/R @ §5.50 A 13300%
4 1 Front bumper (1o ©2 59570~
5 2 Front bumper brackets - L/R @ 201.10 A 40220/
6 1 Front bumper beam A 232.60X
7 1 Front bumper reinforcement A 49710
8 2 Front bumper side retainers - L/R @ 124.10 A 24820 X
9 1 Front grille - Top 1Pf'l11 cAe 43510 _—
10 1 Front grille - Lower 330-f0 Cru 40595~
11 1 Front grille base a5 41035
12 2 Front headlamps - L/R @ 704.35 N( Sew 140870 1PC
13 1 Front corner panel - LH A1 37020X
14 1 Front door - LH A A 165860
15 1  Front brace panel A 110.25X
16 1 Front support panel 199.10 —
17 1  Front support panel seal A4 8L60MN
18 1 Air con condenser A 1.024.19(
19 1  Radiator assy A1 1,887.60 X
20 1 Radiator sub tank A7 39160y
21 1 ‘Wiper tank B 24120
22 1 Wiper panel garnish Av 44160 X
Sub-total 12,231.35
Less 25% 3,057.84
Total List 9,173.51
cial Nett Items
23 1 Front no. plate alt Aunrdf 4D.ﬂﬂ>(
24 1set Front bumper clip A 1500
25 1set Advertisement sticker ALA  300.00 .'L?D
Total Special Nett 3185.00
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26
27
28

30

Labour charges

To check front electrical wiring

To remaove, refix A/C condenser & refill A/C gas

To respray undercoating

To respray painting and etc

Panel beating, cut, weld remove & replacing above parts

ESTIMATE PARTS AND LABOUR GRAND TOTAL $

Page 2 of 2

Total Labour

50.00 20

180.00 /02
120.00 32

1,200.00 525

1,200.00 60

2,750.00

12,308.51



412020 Adjuster Repon
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno1sssoriser)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933

Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-B805 Email: suri@kkaulo. com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CS/EGI20004604/UQD3N2

Date: 01/04/2020
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: ERGO Insurance Pte. Lid. Palicy No:
Fiaimant Vehicle  ggpsessz Insured Vehicle No:  YP2384U
Dale of Loss: 24/03/2020 Nature of Claim; TP Claim No: COMFG2Z0000517
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No GBD5846Z
Make & Model: TOYOTA HIACE, 3.0 D (M) Engine No: 1KD2461512
Reg. Date: 02/01/2015 (Man. Year. 2014) Chassis No JTFHTO2P200153925
Calour Yellow Odometer. 157388 km
Engine Capacity: 2082 cc
Market Value/New Car Price:  N/A
Sum Insured [S$); Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
Genaral Condition; Stearing (Serviceabls); Yes Footbraka (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable}: Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condilion:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Froni Tyre Size: 185 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 185 R15
Front Left Side: Michelin 6 mm Rear Left Side: Michelin 6 mm
Front Right Side: Michelin & mm Rear Right Side: Michelin 8 mm
The above values represant (e remaining tyrs eads dopth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster’s Difference  Diff %
Parts 8,558.51 2,B0B.B9 B,749.62 T0.81
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2,750.00 1,250.00 1,500.00 54.55
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (S5) 12,308.51 4,058.89 824962  67.02
Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 3,200.00
(S$) 12,308.51 3,200.00 9,108.51 74,00
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5%) B61.60 224.00 637.60 74.00
MNett Amount (S§) 13,170.11 3,424.00 9,746.11 T4.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 27/03/2020
Automobile Integrated Management Pte Lid (HQ)
Dats Inspecied: 30/03/2020 Inspected AL f\r?rl r:;.-;u Bukit Ave 4 #04-01, Kaki Bukit (South
Singapore 415933
Estimated Peariod of Repair: 4.0 days
Adjuster: MARCUS CHUA Manager: SHIAU CHAN

NOTE: This repor! represanis owr findings &l the time and place of inspection stsfed herein. Such inspection has been carried out fo the best of our knowledpe and

abdity bul arry other lability under any ofher ciroumstances i heveby expressly excluded.

hitps:/isingapore menmen.com/ciaimsindex cimusebox=MTRad|usier&iuseaction=gen_printrpilcaseid=0202918extid=3351754CFID=695104
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an2020 Adjuster Repon
REPAIR DETAILS
Reference
Part Source: (Last Synchronised: 01 Apr 2020)
Parts: TOYOTA HIACE 3.0 D (M) (Model not available in database)
Labour: Repairer's {Price-denominaled Standard List)
Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for GBD5SB46Z)
Validity: These estimales are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page numbers with

the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page
Further Info: llems/values nol in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT BONNET Badly Deniad 72TA0FL  “T2T10FL
2 1 *FRONT BONNET LOCK Twisted 1TM50FL  "131.50FL
3 2 *FRONT BONNET HINGES-L/R Nol Necessary 131.00FL *-FL
4 1 *FRONT BUMPER Dented 505 7OFL *496.30FL
5 2 *FRONT BUMPER BRACKETS-LUR Not Necessary 40220 FL *-FL
B 1 *FRONT BUMPER BEAM Not Necessary 232 60FL *FL
T 2 *FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINERS-L/R Mol Necessary 24B.20FL *-FL
B 1 “FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Nol Necessary 497 10FL *FL
B 1 *FRONT GRILLE-TOP Cracked 43510FL *28150FL
1m0 1 *FRONT GRILLE-LOWER Cracked 40595FL *330.B0FL
L. “FRONT GRILLE BASE Mo such par 410.35FL *-FL
12 1 *FRONT HEADLAMPS-L/IR N/s Cracked 1408, 70FL *704.35FL
13 1 *FRONT CORNER PANEL-LH Nol Necessary 370.20FL *-FL
14 1 *FRONT DOOR-LH Mol Necessary 1.658.60 FL *-FL
15 1 ‘FRONT BRACE PANEL Mot Necessary 11025FL *FL
16 1 *FRONT SUPPORT PANEL Benl 399 10FL *388.10FL
7 1 *FRONT SUPPORT PANEL SEAL Not Necessary 81.60FL *-FL
18 1 “AlR CON CONDENSER Not Necessary 1,024.10FL *-FL
12 1 *RADIATOR ASSY Not Necessary 1.867.60 FL *-FL
20 1 *RADIATOR SUB TANK Not Necessary 381.60FL *-FL
21 1 *WIPER TANK Defarmad 241.20FL *241.20FL
2 1 *WIPER PANEL GARNISH Not Necessary 441.60 FL *-FL
23 1 ‘FRONT NO PLATE (BENT) Not Consistent With The Impact 40.00Fs *-Fs
24 1 *SET FRONT BUMPER CLIP Necessary 4500F5 "45.00Fs
25 1 *SET ADVERTISEMENT STICKER Necessary 300.00F5 *2B0.00FS
F=Franchise part, S=SpcNefl. L=UisilemDisc
Sub Total (S§) 12,616.35 3,636.85
- List Itam Discount on L ltems 25.00/25.00% (S$] 3.057.84 827 .96
Total Parts (S5)  9,558.51 2,808.89
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out. |

hitps://singapore. menmen.com/claimalindex. cfmPfusebox=MTRadjuster&luseaction=gen_pnntrpidcaseid=029201Aextid=335175ACFIO=685184, 23



412020 Adjuster Report
Recommended Miscellaneous Iltems

Thero are no new miscellaneous Hems selocted,

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems
1 TO CHECK FRONT ELECTRICAL WIRING Mew 50.00 20.00
2 TO REMOVE.REFIX A/C CONDENSER & REFILL A/C GAS MNew 180.00 100.00
i TO RESPRAY UNDERCOATING Mew 120.00 30.00
4  TO RESPRAY PAINTING AND ETC MNew 1.200.00 500,00
5  PAMEL BEATING,CUTWELD REMOVE & REPLACING ABOVE PARTS  New 1,200.00 600.00
Gross Labour Cost (S$) 2,750.00 1,250.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

< END OF ESTIMATES >

hitps:/isingapore. mermen. com/claims/index cimPfusebox=MTRadjusler&fuseaction=gen_prnirplécaseid=9292018exid=3351754CFID=605104. in



