Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: HC Auto <hcauto@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 September 2020 2:58 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Cc: H C Auto @ Singnet

Subject: Re: SLR 2000A / ECICS LTD / DOA: 25/03/2020
Dear Dennis,

We confirm final COR at lump sum $13,900.00( before GST ) and 09 working days.

Best Regards,

Elaine

H C Auto Pte Ltd

Phone: 6457 0678 | fax: 6457 8287 | email: hcauto@singnet.com.sg
160 Sin Ming Drive, #05-09 Sin Ming Auto City, Singapore 575722

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, September 22, 2020 1:37 PM

To: Joe Chee

Subject: SLR 2000A / ECICS LTD / DOA: 25/03/2020

Dear Joe,
As spoken, lump sum $13,900, 9days.

Please check and confirm.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-3062 | email: sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



