
Our Ref:  CC4/EQI20004590/Ega3 
 
04 AUGUST 2020 
 
DREAM CAR LEASING PTE LTD 
DRIVER: BRAYDEN MARCUS LOW  
 
155 Kaki Bukit Avenue 1 
#02-01 Shun Li Industiral Park 
SINGAPORE 416012 
 
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGS 8241K AND VCR 8480 ON 23/03/2020 
 
We refer to the above accident. We are the Appointed Surveyor and Loss Adjuster 
Company by your Motor Insurer (EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED) to resolve 
the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy 
taken up with them. 
 
This is to inform you that we received a Third Party Claim from VCR 8480. 
  
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will 
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
 
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and 
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
 

 Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any) 
 Video footage of accident (if any) 

 
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. 
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this 
claim and your NCD will be protected. 
 
Please call us if you have further queries.  
 
Yours faithfully, 

 
CECILIA CHONG 
Case Handler 
DID:  6749 4274 
FAX: 6741 4108 



EMAIL: ceciliachong@lkkauto.com 
 
c.c. EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED 
            (Motor Claims Dept) 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Southern Motor <soumotor@hotmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 6 August 2020 12:51 PM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Subject: Re: VCR8480   -   EQ's REF: DM20HO00634/SG

Hi Cecilia , 
  
We confirm $3200.00(all-in) . 
 
Thank you. 
 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Thursday, August 6, 2020 12:32 PM 
To: Southern Motor <soumotor@hotmail.com> 
Subject: RE: VCR8480 - EQ's REF: DM20HO00634/SG  
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Sir/Mdm, 
  
We are pleased to offer G/S $3200.00 (all-in). 
  
Kindly confirm acceptance. 
  
Thanks  
  
“Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis, and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our 
part or on the part of our insured/driver.  Terms of such settlement should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the 
accident.  Our offer made in respect of this present matter is made solely to resolve this matter only.  No reference shall be made to this offer 
or any settlement arising from this offer in any other related matters. 
  
Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for 
settlement sum above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/Claimant.  Further all original documents shall be retained by us after we have made payment 
on the settlement sum.” 
  

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
  
  
Best Regards, 
Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 


