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C1aim No : SNM20D20 l5t7/C02/V/CHUAKK ,/Policy No

Claimant

Amount .

Insured Name
Driver Name

DMCVSNl93148I900

IOH SIEW HARE

s$7,800.00
DOLI,ARS SEVEN TTIOUSAND EIGHT ITUNDRED ONLY

I,/l[e agree to accept the above mentioned amount to be pai.d
final settlement of all claims, costs o disbursements for
sustained by mey'us through an accident involving

Claimant Vehicle No. : SMC4206C
Insured Vehicle No, : WC4003C

Date of Loss t 25/N/2A20
P]-ace o! 4,c id*t---: NEW PUN€€+&:*$!B I*Mp pOSl 231

to me/us in full- c
injuries / damages

*'i-
-1

IN CONSII,ERATION of the payment made to me/us of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TATPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. L?D., T./WE AgrCE AbSOIUtClY tO
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) pTE. LTD. and/or

: MORNING STAR ENGINEERING & TRANSPOR? PTE I,TD
: NARAYAI{ASAMY KARTHII{EYAN

from arl claims, pxesent or future in respect of alr loss, injury or damage
sustained by me/us arising out of the said accident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admj.ssion of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING fNSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. L?D,

(l-) Global Sum S$ 7, 800 . 00

TOTAL S$ 7,800.i)0

l-:4qY{ia+

claimanr **,,., Lor-l S-tGr^) u&Lt NRrc No Eq=41stsq

s-+gIIatqge_-, , ilt&,,*,, *- -- !1!e
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                   KIANG MOTOR 
                                    BLK 25 KAKI BUKIT RD 4 # 08-26 SYNERGY @ KB SINGAPORE 417800

Date:

Singapore 079909

Final Bill For Vehicle No: SMC4206C HONDA VEZEL 

Descriptions AMOUNT

Lump Sum repair cost as recommended by $6,800.00
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Total $6,800.00

S/DLRS: SIX THOUSAND EIGHT HUNDRED ONLY

                         INVOICE

China Taiping Insurance (S) Pte Ltd 11th MAY 20
3 Anson Rd,
 #16-00 Springleaf Tower, 

Accident date:25th MARCH 2020
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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: 12 August 2020 4:03 PM
To: MORNINGSTAR1BALA@GMAIL.COM
Cc: Admin A
Subject: ACCIDENT BETWEEN  SMC 4206C &  WC 4003C ON 25/03/2020

Our Ref: CC6/CTI20004584/Aka3 
 
MORNING STAR ENGINEERING & TRANSPORT PTE LTD 
[POLICY HOLDER] 
  
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT BETWEEN  SMC 4206C &  WC 4003C ON 25/03/2020 
  
We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim 
against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them. 
                
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate 
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
  
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us 
within 10 days from the date of this letter. 
  
Please call us if you have further queries. 
  
  
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Monday, 4 January 2021 8:44 AM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Subject: FW: SNM20D201517/C02/V/CHUAKK / RE: MANDATE REQUEST - YOUR REF 

:SNM20D201517/WC4003C/BEN  - Accident Involving WC4003C (OI : CTI ) and 
SMC4206C (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI20004584/Aka3) on 25/03/2020

 
 
 
"Best Wishes for Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2021" 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Albert Chua <albert.chua@sg.cntaiping.com>  
Sent: 30 December 2020 4:55 PM 
To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Lionel Chua <lionel.chua@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CTI 
<claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: RE: SNM20D201517/C02/V/CHUAKK / RE: MANDATE REQUEST - YOUR REF 
:SNM20D201517/WC4003C/BEN - Accident Involving WC4003C (OI : CTI ) and SMC4206C (TP : LKK 
REF - CC6/CTI20004584/Aka3) on 25/03/2020 
 
Hi Khanchna, 
 
Please proceed offer as per revised amount. 
 
 
NOTICE : 
In response to the escalating Covid-19 cases, please refrain from sending hardcopy documents to us as delay is to be 
expected for handling hardcopy documents. All correspondence should be made via email claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com 
or fax at 6224 7175. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Regards, 
 
Albert Chua 
Deputy Head 
Claims Department 
 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road  #15-00  Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 
DID: (65) 6389 6181  |   F: (65) 6224 7175 
 
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  
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Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any 
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify 
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter. 
 
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 
3 Anson Road  #15-00  Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909 
DID: (65) 6389 6181  |   F: (65) 6224 7175 
 
W: www.sg.cntaiping.com   |    FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/   |   WeChat: 太平狮城 Taiping SG  
 

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 2 December 2020 4:04 pm 
To: Albert Chua <albert.chua@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Lionel Chua <lionel.chua@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of CTI 
<claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com> 
Subject: RE: SNM20D201517/C02/V/CHUAKK / RE: MANDATE REQUEST - YOUR REF 
:SNM20D201517/WC4003C/BEN - Accident Involving WC4003C (OI : CTI ) and SMC4206C (TP : LKK 
REF - CC6/CTI20004584/Aka3) on 25/03/2020 
 
 
Your ref : SNM20D201517/WC4003C/BEN 
Our ref : CC6/CTI20004584/Aka3 
 
 
Dear Mr. Albert, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Please be informed that our offer on 50% basis was rejected. Third party wants offer only on 100% basis. 
 
We have reviewed and we are of the view that the liability is down against Insured under BOLA 22 because the 
third party vehicle was parked with a cone and moving vehicles must exercise greater care compared to 
parked vehicles. 
 
Hence, we seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer “KIANG MOTOR" at $7,807.45 (all-in). 
  
The summary is as follows: - 
  

  Amount 
Claimed 

Amount Revised 

1. Cost of Repair  $ 15,155.40 $  6,800.00 

2. Loss of Rental (10 days x $120) $  1,200.00 $  1,000.00 (10 days x $100) 

3. LTA Search $   7.45 $    7.45 

Total $ 16,362.85 $ 7,807.45 
  
**9 days recommendation for repair + 1 Sunday = 10 days 
  
Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal. 
  
Appreciate your approval please. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 


