Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)

Sent: 14 August 2020 3:24 PM

To: Morning Star

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SMC 4206C & WC 4003C ON 25/03/2020

Our Ref: CC6/CT120004584/Aka3

MORNING STAR ENGINEERING & TRANSPORT PTE LTD

[POLICY HOLDER]

ATTN: Ms. Sundari

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT BETWEEN SMC 4206C & WC 4003C ON 25/03/2020

We refer to the above matter and our telephone conversation this morning.

Kindly be informed that we have informed your motor insurance company (China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd)
about your request for a letter on the NCD.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your authorized driver may not
be absolved from blame for this accident as the third party vehicle was parked and

there is also a cone behind the vehicle. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third
Party.



Please call/e-mail us if you have further queries.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Khanchna| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Morning Star <morningstarlbala@gmail.com>

Sent: 13 August 2020 5:43 PM

To: Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT BETWEEN SMC 4206C & WC 4003C ON 25/03/2020
Dear Ma'am,

As per our verbal conversation, please keep us posted on this.

Thank You & Best Regards

Wendy (Ms)

Morning Star Engineering & Transport P L
1013 Geylang East Ave 3
#02-170



Singapore 389728
(Reg. No. 201115692K)

[This e-mail is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, please delete it and notify
us immediately; you should not copy or use it for any purpose, nor disclose its contents to any other person. Thank
you.]

[We encourage everyone to do his /her part in helping to preserve the environment. Kindly refrain from printing this
email unless it is absolutely necessary.]

On Wed, Aug 12, 2020 at 4:03 PM Khanchna (LKK Auto) <khanchna@I|kkauto.com> wrote:

Our Ref: CC6/CTI20004584/Aka3

MORNING STAR ENGINEERING & TRANSPORT PTE LTD

[POLICY HOLDER]

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT BETWEEN SMC 4206C & WC 4003C ON 25/03/2020

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim
against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.



Best Regards,
Khanchna| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



