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ASSIGNMENT !

From: _ S Date: _|§ |03| 303'0_ Veh No Smﬂ/}éqy Yr Regn: 90!8! M%_:

Eslimated Cost; Type:' M.Cycle/ Bus/ Van [ Lorry [ Taxi/ Prime Mover /
ODJTP/WS/TPRES/ OD RES/EVA/INV/MV Truck / Trailer or
To Inspect Vehicle No: SMA 46q Y Make: ALAA‘ QS ce_/ 7-3%__
af Workshop mis premium) Colour Blacdc - AIC:  Insured/Std/NI/NA
of 55 Ui Roed | SpReadng 4SS T/Radio: Insured | Std I NI NA
Insured: Eng/No:
Policy No \Reoo 58618 CINo: WAUZZIFY XJ2 %9033
Claims No. S Gen. Ccni Fair | Poor / Burnt
Sum Insured: _‘-___ Excess: SeO Steering: @ | Jammed [ Leaked / Burnt or
(Client's Record) Brake: ar | Jammed [ Leaked / Burnt or

Make of Veh: __@_a'm Uy’ WA Modi : ) | STD ARIm or
' . Tyre Size: F: 2325 / <s RS9
(Policy Condition) R: I35 [53 &9,
Remark: The veh had commenced its NS | OIS | | BSIDUN/EXNOVA/GY/FSI Lm@j: | OHTSU | PIR | SUMI/
repair at the time of inspection. TOYO | YOKO or
Bal, or Market Value: $165K Front Rear

IDAG Accident Rport: Consistent? : Yes or No R/Bal, {]i mm R/Bal. ? I mm
GIA | PR Seen: Consistent? : Yes or No L/Bal. Q mm L/Bal. 0 mm

Est. Repairs: 3 days Res: Yes or No D.OA. _)Ig‘) o Dol |3 !2 O
Lum Sum: % 3Val.: Yes or No Survey held at ?(?ff}idn
o ,@ | REP. | 24HRS Des. of Damages : Frt | Rear / OIS | NIS / UIC | Rooftop or
Vehicle: IN/OUT Font M/S-
_ bse _PersonContacted; The UIC | Chassis frame | Body Structure affected due to collision.

Date/ Time | Action / Instruction a3 ]
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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Dear Kee Siang,

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Friday, 27 March 2020 4:49 PM

Premiumauto Claims; SUR
(nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg); (boojohnny@gmail.com)
RE: SMA469Y-DOA: 2/3/2020

As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle SMA 469Y, (Excess $500/-).

[f there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company

before completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 27 March 2020 9:57 AM

To: Premiumauto Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: GIA SMA469Y-DOA: 2/3/2020

Dear Kee Siang,

CI?

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Premiumauto Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Sent: Friday, 27 March 2020 8:55 AM
To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>




Cc: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; Claims <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>
Subject: RE: GIA SMA469Y

Dear Summer,
Attached above is the amended GIA for your perusal.

Kindly assist on OD Approval.

Best Regards,
Kee Siang
Claims Advisor

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd (reg no 159502271

55 Ubi Road 1 Road Singapore 408699

p. +65 6388 2323 d. +65 6768 9911 f. +65 6841 1183

e. claims@premiumauto.com.sg w. www.audi.com.sg

Audi Showroom, Audi Centre 281 Alexandra Road Singapore 159938 p. +65 6836 2223

WELCOME TO THE
8TH DIMENSION.

THE ALL-NEW AUDI Q8.

Email Disclaimer

This emall, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged

If you have received It in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you

From: Summer Lee (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 26 March, 2020 5:08 PM

To: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Cc: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GIA SMA469Y

Dear Kee Siang,

Any updates?

Best Regards,
Summer Lee | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Summer Lee (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 25 March, 2020 9:47 AM

To: 'Claims’ <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Cc: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM; 'SUR' <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: GIA SMA469Y




Dear Kee Siang,

Kindly provide the GIA report for this vehicle SMA469Y.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)

From: Summer Lee (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 16 March, 2020 1:38 PM
To: 'Claims' <claims@premiumauto.com.sg>

Cc: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Subject: GIA SMA469Y

Dear Kee Siang,

Kindly provide the GIA report for this vehicle SMA469Y.

Best Regards,
Summer Lee | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



3/27/2020 Merimen e-Claims

View Received Message

This mall Is associated with :
*SMA469Y (0132586501SG)
oD
Mar 2 2020 8:15AM

[LEE HO KIM]
Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (AIG_SG), sent on 27/03/2020 16:35 PM.

From
To LKK_HQ
Subject  Alert - Adj Mandate Approved (S$7118.00) - SMA469Y - Claim Handler: Nadaraja, Deeban

Approved:7118,00;Authorise repair. Re-inspection to be done for damage check and supplementary items / labour with clear photos.

DOCUMENTS SUMMARY -
There are no documents, __J

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_view&mode=1&iinboxid=1655937&iDomainld=11&i0bjld=1...  1/2



3/27/2020 Rich Text Editor, SVCDOCItrcontent

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (co.regno:1a9s07198R)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@Ilkkauto.com;assignments@Ilkkauto.com

To: AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid.

From: LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

AIG Building 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25

78 Shenton Way #08-16 Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 079120 Singapore 408933
Attn:  Mithoo Singh, Aashweenjeet Kaur Date: 27 Mar 2020

Preli dvice

Vehicle No : SMA469Y Accident Date : 02/03/2020
Make : AUDI Q5 Policy No. : 1800058618
Assignment Date  : 27/03/2020 Excess : $$0.00

Date of Inspection : 13/03/2020

Est. Duration of Repair  :3.00

Inspection At : PREMIUM AUTOMOBILES PTE LTD (UBI)

55 UBI ROAD 1
SINGAPORE 408699

Point of Impact / General Description of Damages

The vehicle sustained impact / damages front n/s portion and parts claimed are consistent to the accident.

Repairer's Estimate (Gross)
Revised Amount

Check Items (Estimated)
Total

Lump Sum Repair

Total Loss Consideration

New for Old Value
Pre-Accident Value
COE / PARF Rebate
Salvage Value
Margin for Repair

Remarks

(X))

:S$
:S$
:S%
:S$

:S$

:S$
:S$
:S$
:S$
:S$

19,243.00
7,118.00
300.00
7,418.00

165,000.00
76,228.00

88,772.00

The vehicle is repairable at our adjusted amount. We have also confirmed excess and policy coverage.

Kindly let us have your authorisation.

The vehicle is uneconomical to be repaired, you are advised to invite tender for the wreck.

Other comments :

https:)‘fslngapore.merimen.com!claims!lndex.cfm?fusebox=MTRadJuster&fuseacth:un=dsp_rpls&rplmode=2&caseid=923396&extid=33508?&adjcum

11



> Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner |D Type:

Owner |D:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contained herein is correct as at 27 Mar 2020

Singapore NRIC
728Z

SMA469Y

No

27 Mar 2020

AUDI

Q5 SPORT 2.0TFSI QU STRONIC
Black

2018

DAX034652
WAUZZZFYX)2149033
185.0 kW (248 bhp)
$48,406.00

25 May 2018

25 May 2018

0

$59.769.00

Yes
24 May 2028
$44,826.00

24 May 2028

B - Car above 1600cc or 97kW (130bhp)
10

$38,501.00

$31,402.00

$76,228.00

OK






SGCARMART.COM Login | Sign up Q

New Cars Used Cars Rental Cars Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Forum Resources

Post an Advertisement
Sell it yourselfl Advertise It at just

$58 until it's SOLD!

. (l- . Engine A

v

| Sort by Date Posted ¥ | | 20 results/page

AUDI Q5 Any Any 2018 Any Any Any Avallable
[C] Audi Q5 2.0A TFSI Quattro S-  $149,800 $15,600 /yr 18-Jan-2018 1,984 cc 54,539 km suv Available
tronic Sport

Agent Warranty And Maintained. Audi Virtual Cockpit With Navi Plus Integrated System, All Needed Wear And Tear Just Replaced At
Agent. Price Negotiable! Call Now!

Posted: 14-Mar-2020 Tags: 201 Q5

8 Audi Q5, Audl Q5, Audi, Q5

[:] Audi Q5 2.0A TFSI Quattro S- $155,800 $16,300 fyr 29-Jan-2018 1,984 cc 38,000 km suv Avallable
tronic Sport

1 Owner Only! Tip Top Condition! Low Mileage Unit! Fully Agent Maintained! Still Under Agent Warranty! In House Financing And Trade In
Available! Call Now To Enquire!

Hul Hua Credit Pte Ltd
-7 Posted! 20-Jan-2020° Tags: 2018 Audl Q5, Audl Q5, Aud), QS

[[] Audi Q5 2.0A TFSI Quattro $158,800  $16,980 /yr 14-Feb-2018 1,984 c 28,000 km suv Available

Under Warranty, Almost New Condition. Ceramic Coated. Well Maintained With Carpro Products. Flexible Financing And Insurance Can Be
Arranged. Call For Viewing,

Posted: 11-Jan-2020 Tags: 2018 Audl Q5, Audl Q5, Audl, Q5
D Audl Q5 2.0A TFSI Quattro $161,800 $17,040 jyr 04-May-2018 1,984 e 18,000 km suv Available
Graded A by STHR
3 Years/100,000Km Warranty Till 2021 And Fully Serviced. Special Attractive Financing Rates. STA Certified. Stunning White Paintwork [ o oo
And Brown Leather Interior! Trade In Available, View The Car At Our Leng Kee Showroom Today!
Supreme Cars Pte Ltd

Posted: 21-Jan-2020 Tags: 018 Auwdl Q5, Aud) Q5, Audl, Q5

Meriin Motor & Engineering Works - Specialist for Audi Car repair, servicing & maintenance
Established in 1980s, Merlin Motor Works is a Singapore-based company that provides excelient automotive solutions,
More info about this shop

[(] Audi Q5 2.0A TFSI Quattro S- | $178,000  $18,170 /yr 27-Jun-2018 1,984 cc 15,000 km Suv Available
tronic Sport
Offer Loan Interest At 2.28%, Extremely Well Maintained, Comes With Agent Warranty 5 Years, Up To 70% Financing Of Car Price
Possible, It's 100% Accident-Free. View To Believe! Welcome Trade In, Call/SMS To Arrange A Viewing Today! Viewing Strictly By Appol... [Py
Posind: 01-Feb-2020 Tags: 2018 Audl Q5, Audl QF, Audi, Q5

ﬂ Save Search

- ETH: [T e

Save this search criteria, to get emall alerts whenever a match is found.

For oid advertisements, view Expired ads |20 ¥ | results/page

SEOATLISTED  WMESTOMT

Home | New Cars | Used Cars | Sell My Car | Directory | Products | Insurance | Article | Forum |Resources



MPA120030289-01 / Premium Automabiles Pta Lid - UBI
ENTRY DATE & TIME: 09/03/2020 17:35
SUBMITTED BY: Khoo Zhen Wel

Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting
Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 26/03/2020 14:19

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please report cnrrectlz the details of the accident to speed up the claims process.
2. This Form must be completed by the Palicyholder and/or the Authorised Driver.

3. Information provided must be as truthful and accurate as possible. Any wilful misrepresentation or witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies to

repudiale policy liability.

4, The issue and acceptance of this Form by Insurance companies is not an admission of policy liability on the part of the insurance companies.
5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. This report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance Association of Singapore (GIA) for
archiving and that copies of this report will, for a fee, be made available upon application by interested parties.

7. By the lodgement of this report to the insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report at the centre and to copies of the report being made avallable

aforesaid.

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report
Date Of Accident

09/03/2020 17:35
02/03/2020 08:15

Exact Location Of Accident YISHUN AVE 2
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
Vehicle Registration Number SMA469Y
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner LEE HO KIM
NRIC No SXXXX728Z
Email Address NOEMAIL
Mobile Phone No (LOCAL) +65-90011152

Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver

NRIC No

Date Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Mobile Number

Fax Number

Contact Number

EMail Address

OFFICE-90011152

AUDI
Q5 SPORT 2.0 TFSI QU

PRIVATE USE

YES

PRIVATE CAR

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD,
COMPREHENSIVE

NO

1800058618

FONG MUN HIN
SXXXXT44E

23/01/1960

OUTDOOR

22/01/1981

39 YEARS AND 1 MONTH
MALE

(LOCAL) +65-97880947

VINCENT@VFFASTENING.COM.SG
Page 1 of 27



Address

12 SPRINGLEAF WALK

Postcode 787865
Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO
If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured SPOUSE
Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle -
Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle -
General Information of the Accident
Type Of Accident SIDE SWIPE
Weather Conditions CLEAR
Road Surface DRY
Other Information
Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO
Number of vehicles (including own vehicle) 2
involved in the accident
Was any body injured in the Accident? NO
Was any injured conveyed to hospital by NO
ambulance?
Was any other material or property damaged? YES
| have been approached by unknown person(s)

ot : : : NO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.
Number of Passengers (Including Driver) 1
Details of Police Action
Was the accident reported to the police? YES

If Yes,Please state which Police Station
Police Station Name

YISHUN SOUTH NEIGHBOURHOQOD POLICE CENTRE

ROAD: 32 YISHUN ST 81 , POSTCODE: 768456 , COUNTRY: SINGAPORE
TEL NO: 1800-8522999 - FAX NO: 68522239

NO

Police Station Address

Police Station Contact

Was notice of intended Prosecution given?
If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

MY VEHICLE WAS ON THE SECOND LANE AND THERE WAS 2 CARS IN FRONT OF ME STOPPED WITHOUT INDICATING
SIGNAL RIGHT TO TURN RIGHT. SO | SIGNAL LEFT TO KEEP LEFT TO FILTER TO LANE 3 AND WAITING FOR
CLEARANCE TO FILTER LEFT. WHEN MY VEHICLE WAS ALREADY ON THE THIRD LANE, VEHICLE NO SJW 4829 K CUT
ACCROSS INTO MY LANE FROM LANE 4 AND SIDE SWEPT MY LEFT FENDER AND BUMPER. A VIDEO FOOTAGE
SHOWS CLEARLY THE VEHICLE CUT AT 45 DEGREES ANGLE INTO MY PATH RESULTING IN ACCIDENT.

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES
Was there any video captured by Car Camera? YES
Was there any audio recorded? NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number SJW4829K
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour HYUNDAI GREY
Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR
Name of Driver ABDUL AZIM BIN ABDUL
NRIC/Passport Number SXXXX519F

Contact Number
Address
Postcode
Page 2 of 27



Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage
No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

Page 3 of 27



Sketch Plan

SKETCH PLAN
IMPORTANT NOTICE
1 Please report correctly the detalls of the acoident 10 speed up the claims process
2. This Form must be completed by the Policyholder and/or the Authorised Dowver

3 Information prowided must be as truthiul and accurate s possible. Any wittul misrepresentation or withholding of matenal
facts may allow insurance companies to repudiate policy lability.

4 The issue and acceptance of this Form by Insurance companies is nat an admission of policy llability on the part of the inturance

& The report will be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Records Management Centre established by the General Insurance
Association of Singapore (GIA] lor archiving and that copies of tha repart will for a fee be made available upon application by
interested parties

7 By the lodgment of this report Lo the insurers, you hereby consent 1o thie aichiving of this report at the centre and to copies of
the report being made avalable aforesasd.

8 Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act [PDPA)
| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that

(@] My insures, my workshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore ["GIA™) may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal information set out in this [form] and any other personal information
provided by mé or d by my msurer (collectvely the “Personal Information”) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information 1o all insurer(s) who have insuced vehicle(s) invoived i this accident (all insurer(s) wha have insured
vehicle(s) involved in this acodent shall be collectively referred 1o a3 the “Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Monetary Authority of Singapore and any relevant government agency/authority (such as the police), for the purpose(s|
of :

{1} processing, handling and /or dealing with my claims incduding the settiement of the claims and any necessary
investigations relating to the clasms,

(l§) Investigating the accident and/or my claims,
(ii) carrying out and/or dealing with my nttructions o responding 10 any enquines by me;

(Iv) administering my claims (including the mading of correspondence, statements, invoices, reports of notices to me,
which could involve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the

external cover of envelopes/mail packages), and/or
vl iy with applicable law in ads ng. processing. handling and/or dealing with my claims {collectively the
“Purposes”)
(B)  all insurerls) who hiave insured vehicle(s) involved in this accident and the Insurers’ liwyees/law fiems, may/are permitted
1o collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal Information for one or more of the above Purposes; and

(e] my Personal Information may/can be disclosed by any of the Insurers and/or GIA 10 thelr third party service providers of
agentsiincluding their lawyers/law firmsl. which may be sited outside of Singapore. for one or more of the above Purposes.

(d) my Personal information will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpose of fraud detection,
investigation and management in present and afl future claims

(e) the information so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclosed:

{1} to all insurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, invesugating, controlfing or managng fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purposes stated, or

{1} for comphyang with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders

por—— &

Policyholder s Signature trivers Sigrature #eporting Centre Persannel's Signature
Date & Time: (1 deiver is not the polcyhoider| Name: LA (2 Gy
Date & Time. NRIC/FIN No.:  egrd 2 $ A




Sketch Plan #2

SKETCH PLAN

DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
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DECLARATION
1|/We declare the foregoing particulars are true In every respect.

wwi

Q\E !'._j
hv- '
"c Py =

Policyholder's Signature Dmunmuw
Date & Time 1IY driver hmthcmmﬂj
Date & Time:

Mame: 'Lw"l.w _.rng
NRIC/FN NO..  (Bng 5075 Gy
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Police Report
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Police Report
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Police Report

2 Yisev) Stiwet 81 SINGAPORE 50458

hsleh Plan
ormiant ie o wtde 10 pf
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Addendum Sheet

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

GENERAL B Raffien Quisy N1B-00 Singagore Oa8ess
W TelB5) 624 0010 Fam |83) 62240030
Uipmvating vouiry  Mondasy o §ricay 0900 - 170

B CORDR, MANMAGEN M1 CEnTi VLN ShaAS00000 / GET leg Mo - MAS001 7TES

IMPORTANT NOTE: Please submit the completed Addendum form to the same Authorised Reporting Centre
with whom you submitted the Original Report
T e _
(A} PARTICULARS OF PERSON MAKING THEAMENDMENTS:
Original ReportNo : _MPA 1300734154 Vehicle RegistrationNo: _SMA W69 Y
NAME| s shownin W) :_F% Mun Win NRIC/FIN/Passporthe S XXX X 444 &
{‘Vehicleoﬁwr/wt'}Pleaedemusanproprme
Address 13 Sprrgleal Ualk Singapore( 1% % &f)
Contact (Tel) __AQ3eE 0y Mobile No. :
Email Address - Uil € \l‘{gi“ﬂuid lown.Sq
Date of Accident nhlum Time of Accident : _F:\S am
Placeof Acodent - ___ fishun Ave 2

Insurance Company - A boa Bt nsurance Pre (4,

(8) ADDITIONALINFORMATION /AMENDMENTS:

I have made a report on the above mentioned accident and wouldlike to include additional information or
make the following amendments:

(onvevt Ao oun Qghf.j daim

A
f“m,»{ M L—'} E')'A‘ )

Policyholder / Driver's Signature Ao "“’“'t‘ e ——
. Name: L (o % . '
NRIC/FINNo. (.'-h(;_*‘: 2 <{ 26

Date Jt‘f‘]:f-'!;
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Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183 WIP : 32162
Email: Nora.khai@premiumauto.com.sg / claims@premiumauto.com.sg

Telefax

Estimate :  Accident Repairs
Workshop :  UbiRoad 1

Contact No . 63662323

Fax No : 68411183
Reference . PA/OD/0272/2020/TT
Date : 12-Mar-20

Vehicle NOT IN workshop. Kindly arrange for survey.

AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
78 Shenton Way

#07-16 AIG Building
Singapore 079120

Attn: Mr. Adrian Ling - Motor Claims Dept
Tel: 6841 0055 - Fax: 6256 4315

Owner's Name
Address

Telephone
Type of Claim
Policy No.
Vehicle No
Model Code
Model / Year
Engine No
Chassis No
Mileage

Date In
Estimated By
Accident Date
Place of Accident

Ms Lee Ho Kim

12 Springleaf Walk

Singapore 787865

HP +65 90011152 .
ThirdParty-claim 0D (Claww
1800058618

SMA 469Y

Audi QS Sport 2.0 TFSI qu
May-18

DAX 034652
WAUZZZFYX)2149033

Johnny Boo / Allan Wu
2-Mar-20
Yishun Ave 2



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Read 1, Singapore 408699
Tel 63662323 Fax 68411183

Telefax

Estimated Labour Charges for Accident Vehicle. SMA 469 Y

Estimated Surveyor's
S/N Nature of Jobs Charges Recommendations

To remove, check and reinstall front wire harness for
1 headlights, horns, outside temperature sensor, S/N S 480.00 ~ .-
headlight washer assy and front parking aid.

To dismantle and renew front bumper and lhs

2 headlight. Re-organise crash management S 1,609/6(0 500 v
components. :
£ b/ £ b - | d 1250 o a.m-'w w532
To respray front bumper, front bumper spoiler an Tos > 300
3 both wheel arch trims. > Z’SEMO Syo! )
v A‘(_. xoz:t;"”!“-
4 To carry out diagnostic check. S/N S 192.00 e

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES : $ 4,772.00




Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax:6841 1183

Telefax

Material List for Accident Vehicle Regn No. SMA 469 Y

Dam P Pri
S/N_Parts Description S/Nett Remarks
1  FRONT BUMPER ’pz“g—c( 3 2,789.00 — 23l-Jo
2 FRONT BUMPER FIXING PARTS AL Ad— S 254.00 K-
3 ULTRASOUND SENSOR SUPPORT - LH S 84.00 *
4 FRONT BUMPER SECURING STRIP - LH [zt ~~ S 35.00
S FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT - LH $ 105.00*
6 FRONT BUMPER FRONT SPOILER ?'7,( $ 749.00 X -
7  FRONT BUMPER CLOSING ELEMENT N tA— S 255.00 X
8  FRONT BUMPER AIR GUIDE GRILLE - LH BrAT $ 659.00 — 52680
9  FRONTBUMPER END CAP-LH XA A $ 86.00 *
10 FRONT BUMPER GUIDE SECTION - LH Xt s $ 36.00 A
11  FRONT PARKING AID SENSOR - OUTER AY ~— TBC +
12 FRONT PARKING AID SEAL RING 4 s 14.00 +
13 HEADLIGHT MOUNTING - LH $ 112.00
14  LED HEADLIGHT - LH $ 7,462.00 *
15  LIFT CYLINDER - LH Nﬂ'i $ 132.00 +
16 WHEEL SPOILER 5 151.00 ¥
17 FRONT WHEEL COVER-LH/RH Kec % & 1,248.00 — | 1Eke
18  SUNDRIES I () $ 300.00 - X
TOTAL SPARE PARTS CHARGES : $ 14,471.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES : S 4,772.00
GRAND TOTAL :$ 19,243.00

All charges are not inclusive of GST.
Legend : Remarks (OK) = Approved, Remarks (X) = Not approved
Spare parts are Special Nett.



Premium Automobiles

55 Ubi Road 1, Singapore 408699 LKK Auto Consultants hence notify
Tel : 6366 2323 Fax : 6841 1183 the Repairer of the following:

» To resurvey before/after spray paintina

« To display damaged part(s) during resurvey

= Parts prices are subject lo confirmation

» Third party survey is on a "Without Prejudice” basis
Te|9fax * No illegal modification(s) is allowed

* Supplementary item(s) must be resurveyed and
is subject to final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowledged by Repairer

Name : Adﬂo\/\ L\\r"d 5 Signature:

Surveyed Date i 6 [ 0% I 30 Date:
Authorised Date :
Excess Cost

Liability :

Remarks Y Atlonsed , 03 5)74

Please Note . This estimate is based on visual inspection of the affected vehicle.
Should we require further labour charges and spare parts in the
progress of repair, we shall inform you accordingly.
For inspection of vehicle, please refer to Ms Norah Khai at
Tel:6768 9828 for appointment.

Yours faithfully,

Premium Automobiles Pte Ltd

Johnny Boo Allan Wu
Body Repair Manager Claims Consultant



