Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

From: haji ali <kompressor.auto@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, May 14, 2020 2:04 PM

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Finalize SJR 2163L

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Categories: Green category

Hi O1 Sun Pin,

We accepted the offer, can we sent the LOD to you?
Please advise.

Regards

Ali
Hp:97503353

On Tue, 5 May 2020 at 11:07, Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Morning, the check items 2,5,17 and special nett items 12 reverse camera are no damaged.

I do some adjustment for you, this is the best price for offer COR $4,500 (before gst). Repair day 5 DAYS.
Lump Sum repair.

Kindly to take noted, will be base finalized amount COR $4,500 and DOR 5 DAYS to close this case.

Thank you.

Best Regards,



Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: _Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: haji ali [mailto:kompressor.auto@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, May 4, 2020 8:49 AM

To: Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: Finalize SJIR 213L

Hi Morning,

Please check items 2,5,17 and special nett items 12 reverse camera. Can we finalize COR $5000
LUMPSUM.Cause my calculation is $5102.Please check and revert to me.Thank you Ou Sun Pin.

Regards
Ali

hp:97503353

On Wed, 15 Apr 2020 at 10:49, Oi Sun Pin (LKK Auto) <sunpin@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Sir,



Kindly refer the finalize amount $4,350. Repair day 5 days. (L/S, before gst).

If agree please update.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Oi Sun Pin| Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 6256 3561 | Email: _Sunpin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



