Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 22 June 2020 1:39 pm
To: Sam San Joi UBI

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: FINALIZE SGS5755P

Dear Sam,

Confirmed P/P $ 20,890.45/12 Days before GST.

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.

From: Sam San Joi UBI <SanJoi.Sam @borneomotors.com.sg>
Sent: Monday, 8 June 2020 9:55 am

To: SUR <sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: FINALIZE SGS5755P



