Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 14 September 2020 9:32 am

To: Michelle Ong Siew Bee

Cc: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: AW REF: NSV2000116 __: Pre-Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - Accident
involving potential defendant veh FBM4213J and claimant's veh SKZ1923Mon
15.03.2020_

Hi Michelle,

Finalised amount of $ 2,279.44 / 3 days of repair is confirmed
Kindly forward the resurvey after repair photos plus the new rim

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim
related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
B 74 74
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From: Michelle Ong Siew Bee [mailto:michelle.ong@wearnes.com]

Sent: Saturday, 12 September, 2020 12:38 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: assignments; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: AW REF: NSV2000116 __: Pre-Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - Accident involving potential defendant
veh FBM4213J] and claimant's veh SKZ1923Mon 15.03.2020_

Importance: High

Dear Rasul,
Please refer to Final Bill as attached.

Best regards,

Michelle Ong
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.

V 249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 9129 4556 F (65) 6264 7137
WEARNES  yww.wearnes.com michelle.ong @wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Summer Lee (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 30 June 2020 3:20 PM

To: Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearnes.com>; 'Wong, Kin' <Kin.Wong@awac.com>

Cc: assignments@Ikkauto.com

Subject: RE: AW REF: NSV2000116 __: Pre-Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - Accident involving potential defendant
veh FBM4213J and claimant's veh SKZ1923Mon 15.03.2020 _

Dear Michelle,

Noted with thanks.



Best Regards,
Summer Lee | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearnes.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 30 June, 2020 3:09 PM

To: Wong, Kin <Kin.Wong@awac.com>

Cc: assignments@Ikkauto.com

Subject: RE: AW REF: NSV2000116 __: Pre-Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - Accident involving potential defendant
veh FBM4213J and claimant's veh SKZ1923Mon 15.03.2020_

Importance: High

Dear Sirs,

Please arrange for survey on 215 July 2020 between 9am to 11am.
Kindly confirm appt in writing.

Thanks.

Best regards,

Michelle Ong
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.

V 249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 9129 4556 F (65) 6264 7137

WEARNES  yww.wearnes.com michelle.ong@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Wong, Kin <Kin.Wong@awac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 April 2020 9:47 AM

To: Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearnes.com>

Cc: assignments@Ikkauto.com

Subject: AW REF: NSV2000116 __: Pre-Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - Accident involving potential defendant veh
FBM4213J and claimant's veh SKZ1923Mon 15.03.2020_

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Michelle

If your client — the driver and/or PAX (if any) were not injured, we will be inclined to do a direct settlement with you but
quantum subjected to be agreed with us.

If there are no injuries as mentioned, you may contact and finalise the repair costs with LKK directly and they will do
adjustment accordingly for our consideration thereafter.

Thank you.

Regards,

Kin Wong (Mr.)

Assistant Claims Manager, Asia-Pacific Claims Group
Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd.

60 Anson Road #08-01

Singapore 079914

T: +65 6423 0894

F: +65 6423 0864

E: kin.wong@awac.com

W: www.awac.com




From: Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearnes.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 April 2020 12:59 AM

To: Wong, Kin <Kin.Wong@awac.com>

Subject: Re: Pre-Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - Accident involving potential defendant veh FBM4213) and
claimant's veh SKZ1923Mon 15.03.2020_AW Ref : NSV2000116/KW

CAUTION: External Email

Dear Kin,
Please find attached as per your request.

Thanks and Regards,
Michelle Ong

Get Outlook for Android

From: Wong, Kin <Kin.Wong@awac.com>

Sent: Monday, April 6, 2020 11:44:24 AM

To: Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearnes.com>

Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - Accident involving potential defendant veh FBM4213) and
claimant's veh SKZ1923Mon 15.03.2020_AW Ref : NSV2000116/KW

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Michelle
Our insured has reported that your client has made a abrupt last min turn. Please submit video for our consideration.

Thank you.

Regards,

Kin Wong (Mr.)

Assistant Claims Manager, Asia-Pacific Claims Group
Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd.

60 Anson Road #08-01

Singapore 079914

T: +65 6423 0894

F: +65 6423 0864

E: kin.wong@awac.com

W: www.awac.com

From: Hew, Lee Fong <LeeFong.Hew@awac.com> On Behalf Of Motorsurvey

Sent: Monday, 6 April 2020 9:00 AM

To: Wong, Kin <Kin.Wong@awac.com>

Subject: FW: Pre-Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - Accident involving potential defendant veh FBM4213J and
claimant's veh SKZ1923Mon 15.03.2020_ AW Ref : NSV2000116/KW

Importance: High

Hi Kin
For your handling.

Regards

Hew Lee Fong

Senior Claims Analyst
Asia-Pacific Claims Group

Allied World Assurance Company, Ltd

60 Anson Road #08-01 Mapletree Anson Singapore 079914
T: +65 6423 0533

F: +65 6423 0864

E: leefong.hew@awac.com

W: www.awac.com




From: Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearnes.com>

Sent: Friday, April 3, 2020 7:45 PM

To: Motorsurvey <Motorsurvey@awac.com>

Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - Accident involving potential defendant veh FBM4213) and
claimant's veh SKZ1923Mon 15.03.2020_AW Ref : NSV2000116/KW

Importance: High

CAUTION: External Email

Dear Sirs,
Please advise on liability clearance on urgent basis.
Thanks.

Best regards,

Michelle Ong
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.

V 249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 9129 4556 F (65) 6264 7137

WEARNES  yww.wearnes.com michelle.ong@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Michelle Ong Siew Bee

Sent: Wednesday, 25 March 2020 4:06 PM

To: Motorsurvey <Motorsurvey@awac.com>

Subject: RE: Pre-Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - Accident involving potential defendant veh FBM4213J and
claimant's veh SKZ1923Mon 15.03.2020_ AW Ref : NSV2000116/KW

Importance: High

Dear Sirs,

1%t choice — 10L — Mr Mohamad Taufikh
2" choice - 11L - Mr Mohammed Rasul

Kindly revert on liability clearance before arranging for survey.

Thanks.

Best regards,

Michelle Ong
Service Consultant
Bodyshop & Paint

Wearnes Automotive Pte. Ltd.

_V_ 249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159103

M (65) 9129 4556 F (65) 6264 7137

WEARNES  yww.wearnes.com michelle.ong @wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Hew, Lee Fong <LeeFong.Hew@awac.com> On Behalf Of Motorsurvey

Sent: Wednesday, 25 March 2020 3:57 PM

To: Michelle Ong Siew Bee <michelle.ong@wearnes.com>

Subject: Pre-Repair Survey (Single Joint Expert) - Accident involving potential defendant veh FBM4213J and claimant's
veh SKZ1923Mon 15.03.2020_AW Ref : NSV2000116/KW

Without Prejudice



Dear Sirs

We refer to your notice of accident dated 25.03.2020 and noted your request for a pre-repair survey to your client’s
vehicle number SKZ1923M.

Pursuant to the Practice Directions Amendment No. 1 of 2016, we confirm our intention to conduct the pre-repair
survey of your client’s vehicle.

Append below is a list our motor surveyors for your attention. We would be appointing one of the surveyors listed in 5L
to13Li.e.

5 L Mr Marcus Chua

6 L Mr Adrian Ling

7 L Mr Xing Guo Qiang

8 L Mr Henry Ng

9 L Mr Steven Foong
10 L Mr Mohamad Taufikh
11 L Mr Mohammed Rasul
12 L Mr Chua Weijie
13 L Mr Ma Chin Fook
14 L Mr Kenneth Kong
15 L Mr Kalvin Ang

Please acknowledge receipt of this notice and give us your reply whether you have any objections to our proposal and
to specifically select one or more surveyor from the said list.

We would propose that you select at least two(2) surveyors so as to facilitate alternatives in the event should your first
choice of surveyor is unavailable.

You may send us your selection sample as follows:-

example 1%t choice - 3P — Mr Jeffrey Ong Leng Kiat
2" choice - 15L - Mr Kalvin Ang
S/No. Name of Surveyor
1 P | MrlJimmy Lee See Tee
2 P | Mr Lawrence Ng Chun Kee
3 P | Mr Jeffrey Ong Leng Kiat
4 K | Mr Michael Ee
5 L | Mr Marcus Chua
6 L | Mr Adrian Ling
7 L | Mr Xing Guo Qiang
8 L | MrHenryNg
9 L | Mr Steven Foong
10 L [ Mr Mohamad Taufikh
11 L [ Mr Mohammed Rasul
12 L [ Mr Chua Weijie
13 L [ Mr Ma Chin Fook
14 L | Mr Kenneth Kong
15 L [ MrKalvin Ang
Regards

Motor Claims

The information contained in this e-mail and any attachments hereto is confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you must not use or disseminate any of this information. If you have received this e-mail in error, please
immediately notify the sender by reply e-mail and permanently delete the original e-mail (and any attachments hereto)
and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this e-mail and any attachments hereto are believed to be free of any
virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility
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of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by Allied World Assurance Company
Holdings, Ltd or its subsidiaries or affiliates, either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its
use.



