Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 27 July 2020 3:35 PM

To: Loh, Chee-Heng

Cc: SUR; Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: 2437621456SG- PRI for SJY2411)
Dear Mr Loh

The market value for SJY 2411U is as at below:

Market Value: $10,000(est)
LTA : $7,620(est)
Nett Value :$2,380

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will
be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6271-0351 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 23 July 2020 3:18 PM

To: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: 2437621456SG- PRI for SJY2411)

Dear Mr Loh,

Will check and get back to you

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related documents will
be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6271-0351 | email: sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6271-8802
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Loh, Chee-Heng <Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com>
Sent: Thursday, 23 July, 2020 2:48 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Subject: 2437621456S5G- PRI for SJY2411)

Dear Sir/Mdm,



Our inhouse requested for MV, PARF/Coe rebate and repair limit for reference.

Kindly assist.
Thank you.

Best regards,

Loh Chee Heng

AIG

Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AlG Building, 78 Shenton Way #09-16 Singapore(079120)
Tel +(65) 6419 1881
Chee-Heng.Loh@aig.com | www.aig.sg

Follow us:

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any
computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is
accepted by AlG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
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