Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 7 April 2020 11:24 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: Fw: GBC9057M DOA:19/03/2020  TP/MSIG

Attachments: DSC_2178.JPG; DSC_2179.JPG; DSC_2180.JPG; S-chmys20040710410.pdf

L/Sump $4050.00 confirmed. Wiper leakage serviceable.

From: Efeeda (Cheng Hoe) <chmotor@singnet.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 7 April 2020 10:44 AM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>
Subject: GBC9057M DOA:19/03/2020 TP/MSIG

Hi Kenneth,

Finalization list and photos as attached.

Please let us have your confirmation on the final sum- $4050/ 5 DAYS via reply email.
Thank you.

Rgds

Efeeda

Cheng Hoe Motor PL

Tel:67556142
Fax:67557719



