Vic (LKKAuto)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 April, 2020 4:34 PM

To: Admin A

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto); Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SML4771P & PC296H Doa 23/3/20

Attachments: INVOICE.pdf; LOA jpg; Ita fee.pdf; PHOTO 1.jpg; PHOTO-2020-03-23-14-58-55.jpg

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Enclosed is invoice , GIA report , LOA ,invoice & Ita .

As request following :

1. RC $7597(57100+7% GST - AS AGREED )

2. Loss of use $720 ( $S80 x 9 (1500CC car of 2019 years) -7 days recommend + 1 day waiting PRS +
1 days weekend

3. Ita $7.45

@ 100 % TOTAL  $8324.45

( DIRECT FROM BEHIND WITH SCENE PHOTO )

Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks

Regards,

Chris Chan Pick Yuen

GREEN FOREST AUTOMOBOLIE PTE LTD
HP: 92712214

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, March 24, 2020 9:08 AM

To: assignments@Ikkauto.com <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: SML4771P & PC296H Doa 23/3/20



Dear Sir / Mdm ,

Enclosed is our client GiA report.
Please advise OIC & claim no .
I will call Mr Adrian survey later . Thanks

Best Regards

Chris Chan

Green Forest Automobile Pte Ltd
Hp:92712214
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