Nivitha (LKK Auto)

From: Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 23 March 2020 1:33 PM

To: ‘assignments'

Subject: FW: OUR REF: SNM20D201436/GBG3508Y /BEN - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE

GBE6684L AND GBG3508Y ON 20/3/2019

Dear LKK
Please assist to arrange for survey of TP vehicle GBE6684L.

Thank you.

Best Regards

Ben Tang
Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6175 | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: X34 Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, March 23, 2020 12:09 PM

To: Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM20D201436/GBG3508Y /BEN - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE GBE6684L AND GBG3508Y ON
20/3/2019

Dear Ben

Please appoint LKK Marcus .

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.



Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg

From: Ben Tang [mailto:Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Monday, 23 March 2020 12:02 PM

To: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM20D201436/GBG3508Y /BEN - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE GBE6684L AND GBG3508Y ON
20/3/2019

Dear Sirs

We refer to your email dated 23 March 2020.

We infend to conduct a pre-repair survey of the damage to your client's vehicle jointly with your client/your
motor workshop. We propose to use one of the following motor surveyors to conduct the joint pre-repair survey
as a single joint expert.

LKK / LBS / STA

ADRIAN LING
Kelvin Ang
SEE CHEW SENG

MOHD FADHILAH BIN
OSMAN

XING QUO QIANG
KENNETH KONG
SIMON HO

CHUA WENIE
MARCUS CHUA

HENRY NG

You may select one of the listed motor surveyors and we will bear the cost of the pre-repair survey carried out
by the single joint expert.

If we do not hear from you within two days of this letter, you shall have deemed to have agreed that the
surveyor appointed by us shall be Single Joint Expert for this matter.

Thank you.

Best Regards
Ben Tang



Executive
Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #XX-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: (65) 6389 6175 | F: (65) 6222 1033

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsa/ | WeChat: K F#iisi Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain confidential information. Any
unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify
the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and any copies of it thereafter.

From: Claims Dept of CTI

Sent: Monday, March 23, 2020 11:52 AM

To: Ben Tang <Ben.Tang@sg.cntaiping.com>; jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Cc: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: OUR REF: SNM20D201436/GBG3508Y /BEN - ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE GBE6684L AND GBG3508Y ON
20/3/2019

Dear Ben,

Please conduct PRS for GBE6684L.

Note : officer in charge — Ben Tang 63896175.

*** Kindly quote our reference number when replying.
Thank you

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #15-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: (65) 63896116 | F:(65) 62247175

W: www.sg.cntaiping.com | FB: www.facebook.com/chinataipingsg/ | WeChat: A FHilf Taiping SG

Disclaimer: This e-mail and any files transmitted with it is intended only for the named recipients and may contain
confidential information. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination of this message, either in whole or partial,
is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately. Please delete the e-mail and
any copies of it thereafter.

From: jouis <jouis@jinauto.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, March 23, 2020 11:21 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE GBE6684L AND GBG3508Y ON 20/3/2019




Without Prejudice

Dear Sir/ Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE GBE6684L AND GBG3508Y ON 20/3/2019

We are assisting owner of GBE6684L handling his third party claim
recovery against GBG3508Y .

Have your insured GBG3508Y reported, able to establish liability to proceed with direct settlement .

Please advise .

Thank you & Best Regards,
Jouis Seow

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd

Blk 14 #01-412 Defu Lane 10
Singapore 539195.

Tel : (65) 62898126
Fax : (65) 62870590
Email :jouis@jinauto.com.sg




