claims@juseq.com.sg

From: claims@juseq.com.sg

Sent: Thursday, August 20, 2020 6:38 PM

To: Jeffrey Tay'

Cc: ‘Angelia Ho Yun Fong'

Subject: RE: PROPERTY DAMAGE CLAIM ARISING FROM ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJV2986H

AND SMJ3766Y ON 17 MARCH 2020.

Dear Jeffrey

Your Ref: M2001989/JT-TP(2)
Our Ref: JEQ/200299/0320 (AHE)

Thanks for your email below.

We confirm that the settlement sum should read as $2,090.99.
Kindly let us have your DV as soon as possible.

Thanks and Regards

Kevin Foo
On behalf of Mr. Caleb Tan
JusEquity Law Corporation

From: Jeffrey Tay [mailto:JeffreyTay@tokiomarine.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, August 20, 2020 6:04 PM

To: 'claims@juseq.com.sg' <claims@juseq.com.sg>

Cc: Angelia Ho Yun Fong <AngeliaHo@tokiomarine.com.sg>

Subject: RE: PROPERTY DAMAGE CLAIM ARISING FROM ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJV2986H AND SMI3766Y ON 17
MARCH 2020.

Hi Kevin
We confirm settlement as follows

Cost of Repair: $1,800.00
Loss of Use $300.00 (5 days x 60 )
$2100
@80% S1680
Survey Report :

LTA/GIA 1 $36.49
Cost & Dish : $374.50
Total : $2,090.99

It’s 2090.99 if $350 costs include GST.
Please reply confirmation and copy back to Angelia who will be issuing DV

Warmest regards



